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ABSTRACT
English Version

Within the projection of maternity units, the-
re are different international organisations 
and governments that develop guidelines 
for these health infrastructures to meet all 
the requirements of hygiene, sanitation, in-
fection and disease prevention and control. 
However, in resource-limited settings, access 
to maternal health and/or adequate health 
facilities is restricted, putting the lives of mo-
thers and babies at risk.

In such contexts, the application of interna-
tional guidelines may vary according to so-
cio-cultural factors and characteristics of the 
population. For this reason, it is important to 
adapt international guidelines for maternity 
units to the needs of the local context and 
culture.

On this basis, this thesis is the result of re-
search to assess which cultural factors can 
be integrated into the design of a maternity 
unit, responding to the needs of users, im-
proving the user experience, and the quality 
of care offered.

This research was conducted through a lite-
rature review that allowed for the recogni-
tion of new approaches to design and care, 
to respond to the needs of users and to im-
plement a culturally sensitive approach. In 
addition, a methodology was developed to

identify which features are important to inclu-
de within the maternity unit, according to the 
perceptions of a specific culture. This tool is 
primarily designed to assess resource-limited 
and underdeveloped contexts.

An analysis of maternity unit projects built 
around the world was also conducted to 
better understand the spatial and functional 
characteristics that they develop, as well as 
to identify whether they incorporate non-con-
ventional spaces.

Finally, a conceptual proposal is arrived at 
for a possible spatial organisation of the ma-
ternity unit that integrates non-conventional 
spaces as a response to the different cultural 
needs that the users of the unit may have.
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ABSTRACT
SpanishVersion

Dentro de la proyección de unidades de 
maternidad, existen diferentes organizacio-
nes internacionales y gobiernos que desa-
rrollan los lineamientos para que estas in-
fraestructuras sanitarias cumplan con todos 
los requerimientos de higiene, saneamiento, 
prevención y control de infecciones y enfer-
medades. Sin embargo, en contextos con 
recursos limitados, el acceso a la salud ma-
terna y/o a una instalación de salud ade-
cuada es restringido, lo que pone en riesgo 
la vida de las madres y los bebés.

En este tipo de contextos, la aplicación de 
los lineamientos internacionales puede va-
riar según los factores y características socio 
culturales de la población. Por esta razón 
es importante adaptar las directrices inter-
nacionales de las unidades de maternidad 
a las necesidades del contexto y la cultura 
local.

Partiendo de esta base, este trabajo es el 
resultado de una investigación que tiene 
como fin evaluar qué factores culturales 
pueden ser integrados dentro del diseño de 
una unidad de maternidad, respondiendo a 
las necesidades de los usuarios, mejorando 
la experiencia de estos, y la calidad del cui-
dado ofrecido.

Esta investigación se realizó a través de una 
revisión bibliográfica que permitió reconocer 
nuevos enfoques de diseño y atención, para 
responder a las necesidades de los usuarios 
e implementar un enfoque cultural sensitivo. 
Adicional, se construyó una metodología, 
que sirve para identificar qué características 
son importantes incluir dentro de la unidad 
de maternidad, según las percepciones que 
pueda tener una cultura específica. Esta 
herramienta esta principalmente diseñada 
para evaluar contextos de recursos limitados 
y bajo desarrollo.

También se realizó un análisis de proyec-
tos de unidades de maternidad construidas 
en diversas partes del mundo, con el fin de 
comprender las características espaciales y 
funcionales que desarrollan, así como iden-
tificar si incorporan espacios no convencio-
nales.

Finalmente, se llega a una propuesta con-
ceptual para una posible organización espa-
cial de la unidad de maternidad que integra 
espacios no convencionales como respuesta 
a las diferentes necesidades culturales que 
pueden tener los usuarios de la unidad.
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 01.1 State of meanings

For this study, it is essential to define different 
terms related to the maternity unit and the 
concept of maternity itself, to have clarity on 
the subject. 

Maternity:
The concept of maternity usually is unders-
tood by people as the pregnancy period, the 
delivery, and child rearing. However, for this 
work the term will be assumed as the period 
of pregnancy, childbirth, and postpartum pe-
riod, considering six weeks after birth. Obs-
tetrics and midwifery are disciplines related 
to the concept of maternity (AusHFG, 2023).

Maternity Care: 
Maternity care, as its name suggests, focuses 
on providing care for both the mother and 
the baby, beginning from the preconception 
period and continuing through each stage 
of pregnancy. Stages range from antenatal 
care, labour, childbirth, and postnatal care 
for both mothers and newborns, extending 
up to six weeks after birth (AusHFG, 2023).

Maternity care “may be provided in several 
different ways that will impact on the orga-
nisation and provision of facilities” (TAHPI, 
2022, p. 4). Links between maternity, neo-
natal and more specialised services are also 
essential to ensure quality care.

Maternity Unit: 
The maternity unit is a health unit that can 
be a stand-alone facility or be within a lar-
ger infrastructure such as a hospital or heal-
th centre. This unit focuses on the care of 
the woman, ideally starting with family plan-
ning and pregnancy, followed by care during 
pregnancy, childbirth, and the postpartum 
period, which is considered up to 40 days 
after delivery. 

Among the services that a maternity unit can 
provide are preconception care, antenatal 
care, assistance in the assessment and ma-
nagement of childbirth, in-patient accom-
modation in a birthing unit or birthing suites, 
delivery and post-delivery observation, post-
natal care, and neonatal care (TAHPI, 2022). 
Each of the services and facilities provided 
within the unit also require specific spaces 
that have contrasting functions. Spaces are 
organised following the natural phases of 
pregnancy until delivery and post-delivery.

Preconception Care: 
This type of assistance “includes counselling 
and the provision of biomedical, behaviou-
ral and social health interventions to optimi-
se the health of women and their partners 
prior to pregnancy to improve health related 
outcomes for themselves and their children” 
(AusHFG, 2023, p. 5).
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Preconception care can serve as support for 
family planning, sexual and reproductive 
health counselling, and motherhood aware-
ness. 

Antenatal Care:
During the pregnancy period, pregnant wo-
men are required to attend antenatal exami-
nations and screenings (NHS, 2013) which 
are responsible for monitoring the health of 
both the mother and the baby, thereby pre-
venting potential complications or risks. “It is 
a routine part of pregnancy care which aims 
to support and monitor the woman and de-
tect complications early so they can be acti-
vely managed” (AusHFG, 2023, p. 5).

This type of care consists of two components: 
outpatient care, which, in addition to the 
evaluation, management, and monitoring of 
pregnancy, may also include services related 
to parenting education and health. Additio-
nally, it includes in-patient care which is an 
area that will be provided with accommoda-
tion because in some cases, women require 
more detailed assessments or follow-ups. 
Also, there might be a case of a woman who 
is already admitted and needs an antenatal 
ward hours before delivery (NHS, 2013).

Birth Unit or Birth Centre: 
This unit within the maternity unit is another 
area dedicated to “provide facilities for the 
safe prenatal care, delivery and immediate 
postnatal” (TAHPI, 2023, p. 3) meaning it 
has birth rooms and a nursing base.  A birth 
unit can manage low-risk deliveries atten-
dant by midwives and will be able to support 
women with antenatal care, delivery, and 
postnatal care until discharge (TAHPI, 2022 
and AusHFG, 2023).

Birth Suite:
The suite has several birth rooms designed 
for flexible use, allowing it to accommoda-
te different service models and approaches 
to care. This facility covers the phases of 
labour, delivery, and the immediate pos-
tpartum period. Following one to two hours 
after birth, the mother is transferred to a 
postpartum inpatient bed (AusHFG, 2023).

Birth Room: 
It is “a room designed to support any wo-
man through labour, birth, and the early 
postnatal period. It will be adapted to su-
pport a range of care needs” (AusHFG, 
2023, p. 6). A birth room must ensure the 
safety of mothers and babies, provide pri-
vacy for mothers, and offer freedom of mo-
vement. It also must allow staff, equipment, 
and services available to women in the pla-
ce by providing flexibility in their use, redu-
ce the risk of cross-infection, and provide 
access to water during labour to alleviate 
pain (NHS, 2013).

Postnatal Care: 
Postnatal care encompasses the care pro-
vided to both mothers and newborns fo-
llowing childbirth. This care typically invol-
ves general recovery in an inpatient unit for 
both mother and baby, along with paren-
thood and lactation education. Additiona-
lly, it may include outpatient clinics, and in 
some cases, extended follow-up through 
community or home-based services, ensu-
ring ongoing support during the postnatal 
period (AusHFG, 2023).

Neonatal Care or Newborn care: 
Neonatal care requires a dedicated unit 
which is essential but is not always located 
within the maternity unit. This specialised 
facility is designed to provide care for new-
borns whose medical needs exceed what 
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can be offered at the mother’s bedside 
(NHS, 2013). In these cases, the neonatal 
unit is equipped to manage conditions that 
require close monitoring or advanced me-
dical interventions, ensuring that infants re-
ceive the appropriate level of care for their 
specific health requirements, which cannot 
be adequately addressed within the standard 
maternity setting.

Early Pregnancy Assessment Care:
This type of care aims at pregnant women 
with complications during the first months of 
pregnancy that require screening and coun-
selling, pregnancy tests, and ultrasound 
scans to assess aspects such as the viability 
of the pregnancy, the gestational age, and 
whether the pregnancy is intrauterine (NHS, 
2013).

Also, can be provided support and accom-
paniment, “within a sensitive and confiden-
tial environment, for women who are ex-
periencing threatened miscarriage, ectopic 
pregnancy and other early pregnancy con-
ditions, usually defined as up to 20 weeks 
gestation” (AusHFG, 2023, p. 8).

Midwifery led Unit:
These types of units are distinct in that they 
are managed and staffed by midwives, who 
can care for women with low-risk or uncom-
plicated pregnancies, as deliveries are usua-
lly conducted with few or no interventions 
(NHS, 2013). The services offered by a mid-
wifery unit vary depending on whether it is a 
unit within a larger health infrastructure or a 
stand-alone unit.

If the unit is “co-located with another health-
care facility, the MLU may use their antenatal 
and out-patient clinics. If stand-alone, it may 
include these and other diagnostic services” 
(NHS, 2013, p. 2).

The unit may also be known as a birth centre 
because it focuses especially on the time of 
delivery and postpartum and does not offer
specialised medical services such as a 
caesarean section.

Consultant led Unit: 
“These secondary-level units are located on 
a hospital site and provide antenatal out-
patient and in-patient services, birthing and 
postnatal care, with facilities for neonatal 
care and access to adult critical care facili-
ties” (NHS, 2013, p. 2).

The difference with the midwife unit is that 
the consultation unit offers much more spe-
cialised medical services and allows for a 
more rigorous examination and monitoring 
of pregnant women in the prenatal period. 
The midwife unit can be within the consul-
tation unit, or they can be managed sepa-
rately.

All these terms were explained for the reason 
of differentiating each of the specific points 
of care required by the maternity unit, as well 
as the variations that can be found around 
the same theme. However, the terms can so-
metimes be recognised by a different name 
but represent the same thing in terms of their 
function and services offered.

In summary, the maternity unit, often referred 
to as the obstetrical unit, includes spaces 
such as the birthing unit that can be known 
by other names like birth centre, or delivery 
unit. It encompasses the birthing rooms, 
which are alternatively termed birth suites or 
delivery suites (NHS, 2013).
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 01.2 Technical specifications 
and Functional requirements

Aiming to understand deeply how a materni-
ty unit works, what are the required spaces, 
how are their functional relationships, what 
are their spatial characteristics and requi-
red dimensions, a comparison was made 
among three types of models proposed by 
international guidelines to identify clearly 
and concisely all the necessary technical and 
functional requirements.

Australasian guidelines applied in Australia, 
New Zealand, and some Asian countries 
were taken as the first reference. Then, the 
international health facility guidelines pro-
posed by Total Alliance Health Partners In-
ternational were taken for referencing the 
inpatient maternity unit, these directrices are 
implemented in numerous countries globa-
lly, especially in areas emphasising better 
healthcare infrastructure. These international 
(TAHP) principles are extensively applied in 
numerous countries in the Middle East, Asia, 
and Africa, which are heavily investing in 
healthcare advancement.

Finally, the England health building notes 
which although are designed for England, 
can also impact other nations in the UK 
such as Wales, Scotland, and Northern Ire-
land, which may have similar guidelines. 
Furthermore, healthcare organisations and 
institutions around the world may use the 

principles outlined in the health building
notes as a guide for healthcare facility
design.  

From the Australasian guidelines was as 
reference the model of complete materni-
ty unit. In this model the design is focused 
on providing a woman centred care: “Aims 
to meet the woman’s physical, emotional, 
psychosocial, spiritual, and cultural needs, 
it enables individual decision-making and 
self-determination for the woman to care for 
herself and her family” (AusHFG, 2023, p. 
7).

The model determines and differentiates the 
functional areas that make up the maternity 
unit, starting with the entrance area, where 
the reception, waiting room and an area for 
public services are located. It continues with 
the outpatient area, which is more focused 
on antenatal care. In the outpatient area 
there are consulting rooms, and rooms for 
monitoring and examining the mother and 
baby. In addition, a room can be integrated 
to offer antenatal education programs.

The maternity acute assessment unit is inclu-
ded within the complete maternity unit just 
in the case where the infrastructure offers a 
higher level of services. 

Australasian Guidelines: 
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It would include consulting rooms, interview 
rooms and day stay bays, as well as some 
mix rooms for procedures, ultrasound servi-
ces, and neonatal resuscitation capabilities.

Then, the birth suite can be found. This area 
includes the birthing rooms, which should 
facilitate the mother’s mobility during labour, 
provide privacy, and offer sanitary facilities 
such as showers and toilets. It also should 
have a lounge area for the family and those 
supporting and accompanying the mothers, 
which should be located next to the birthing 
rooms, and finally space for clinical support.

Only in some cases when the unit manages 
all types of pregnancies that can be progres-
sed or scheduled as a caesarean section is 
the obstetric operating area included. If this 
is the case, “this space will be adjacent to 
the birth suite so that it is easily accessible, 
recovery bays will be required for the mother 
and to undertake initial baby health checks” 
(AusHFG, 2023, p. 17).

Following, there is the inpatient area where 
there is a division of antenatal care beds and 
postnatal care beds. It is recommended to 
have a separate room per bed with its own 
sanitary facilities included, however, “two 
bed rooms may be an option where this will
positively affect the wellbeing of new mothers, 
e.g. Indigenous communities, young mums” 
(AusHFG, 2023, p. 17). In addition, there 
could be integrated clinical support services 
and meeting rooms for mothers, spaces for 
breastfeeding, and spaces for the promotion 
of parenting and mothers’ education.

It is also essential to include designated 
areas and spaces for medical personnel, 
both from a functional perspective, requi-
ring meeting rooms, offices, and changing 
rooms, as well as from a workforce well-

being standpoint, where provisions for di-
ning areas, sanitary facilities, and resting 
rooms may be offered.

Functional Relationships: 
If the maternity unit does not include ope-
rating theatres and neonatal care services, 
these should have proximity to the unit.

Additional functional connections that need 
to be enabled consist of clinical assistan-
ce services like medical imaging, patholo-
gy, and pharmacy, as well as ambulance 
transport areas and/or helipad for retrieval 
services, intensive care unit, high dependen-
cy- close observation units, and gynaecolo-
gy inpatient beds (AusHFG, 2023).
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Unlike the previous model, these guideli-
nes take the model that is focused on the 
in-patient area of the maternity unit, offering 
a service of antenatal, delivery, postpartum, 
and postnatal care. However, it would be for 
all mothers who are already admitted to the 
unit, meaning that there is not an out-patient 
area.

The functional areas include an entrance
area with reception, a waiting room for 
visitors with toilets, and prayer rooms. Then, 
there is the patient accommodation area, 
which is subdivided according to the level 
of care required. In this sense, there is the 
antenatal accommodation area, and the 
postnatal accommodation area where there 
are also meeting spaces for mothers, spaces 
for breastfeeding, and rooms for group edu-
cation. Lastly, there is a smaller, more private 
accommodation area for mothers who have 
had a loss, and who still require postnatal 
and psychological care (TAHPI, 2022).

Support areas are required to ensure the 
efficient operation of the unit, including sa-
nitary facilities such as utility rooms, disposal 
rooms, and storerooms, as well as supple-
mentary service areas, which should include 
spaces such as meeting rooms for educatio-
nal sessions and interview rooms.

As in the previous model, it is also essential 
in this model to include areas for staff, such 
as “offices and workstations, staff room, 
staff sanitation and handover room, toilets, 
shower and lockers” (TAHPI, 2022, p. 8).

The main difference in this model is that a 
nursing area is included for the newborn’s

International Health Facility
Guidelines: 

care. The approach to this area can be from 
general care or from a much more specia-
lised care, where more specific spaces and 
characteristics are required.

General care needs a bathing examination 
area, a staff station with proximity to a res-
uscitation trolley, and support rooms such as 
a cleaner’s room, utilities room, and storage 
areas. The special care nursery will include 
isolation rooms, space for feeding, bathing, 
changing and weighing the baby, educatio-
nal rooms for parents and staff, and a dark 
area to allow babies to sleep during the day. 
It will also have access to public amenities 
for parents. This type of care will offer short-
term care, including the provision of assisted 
ventilation (TAHPI, 2022).

Another difference with this model is that as 
it includes a neonatal care area, it also focu-
ses on offering dedicated spaces for breas-
tfeeding and formula feeding, for example, 
the latter will include “benches with sink for 
rinsing equipment, cupboards for storage, 
refrigerator with freezer, baby milk warmer or 
electric kettle and bottle disinfector” (TAHPI,
2022, p. 9).

Functional Relationships: 
The reception will assist in overseeing secu-
rity for the entire unit, with staff stations and 
associated areas requiring direct access and 
visibility to patient areas. Utility and stora-
ge spaces should have convenient access 
to both patient and staff work areas. Shared 
support areas need to be conveniently rea-
chable from the units they support (TAHPI, 
2022). 

Nursery zones must be easily reached from 
postnatal areas, with access to feeding and
formula rooms provided to patients in both
the nursery and postnatal units.
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Illus 2: Funcionatl relationships diagram of inpatient
maternity unit
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From these guidelines, the midwifery led unit 
is taken as a reference. As mentioned before 
this type of unit is managed and assisted by 
midwives, it can be a stand-alone facility or 
be within a larger health infrastructure, for 
either case the space requirements vary as 
well as their functional relationships.

In both cases, where the MLU is within a 
health facility or connected to a consulting 
led birthing unit, it would be focused on the 
birth moment. The birthing suite includes 
the triage room, consulting rooms, birthing 
rooms, birthing rooms with pool, bathroom, 
and stores. Due to the activities and func-
tions carried out within the unit, it is also 
necessary supporting rooms such as the dirty 
and clean utility room, the ward pantry, the

England Guidelines: cleaner’s room, the disposal holds, the
general store, a staff communication base, 
and a meeting room or office for staff (NHS, 
2013).

The MLD also requires spaces that house 
services for health personnel, such as shared 
toilets, kitchen, and changing rooms.

The only differences when the MLU stan-
dalone is evidenced on the entry area and 
additional supportive spaces. In the entry 
area, apart from the entrance and reception 
would be a nappy changing room, infant-
feeding room, a sitting and beverage bay, 
and toilets. The accommodation section of 
the unit can include an information centre, 
single-bed rooms, shower facilities, a gene-
ral store, and a room for parenthood prepa-
ration (NHS, 2013).

Illus 3: Funcionatl relationships diagram of
Midwifery-Led Unit
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Functional Relationships: 
“In-patient accommodation should be easily 
accessible from, and within a short distance 
of the hospital entrance, antenatal and post-
natal areas should be co-located for flexibi-
lity” (NHS, 2013, p. 22).

If the MLU is within a health facility, it must 
have its own dedicated entrance for women 
and families that is different from the entran-
ce to the CLU. Effective communication in 
the organisation of the health structure is es-
sential, as well as access routes between the 
two sites (MLU and CLU) (NHS, 2013).

Within the maternity unit, the operating area 
can be included. However, it is an object of 
discussion according to the context in which 
the project is developed and the analysis of 
the care services needed. Having an obs-
tetrical operating area within the maternity 
unit enables the management of all types of 
pregnancies, provided that the necessary su- 

Operating theatre suite:

pplies, medications, and specialised medi-
cal equipment are available. 

If the unit includes this specialised area, it 
may be necessary to increase postnatal ac-
commodation capacity or designate a space 
for post-surgical recovery. 

The obstetrical operating area would inclu-
de an anaesthesia room, obstetric theatres, 
scrub and gowning room, an exit bay, dis-
posal hold, storage spaces, a preparation 
room, and a dirty utility room (NHS Estates, 
2004). 

Functional Relationships: 
The positioning of the obstetrical operating 
area is crucial. All birthing facilities inside 
and outside the maternity unit must have
direct access, 24 hours a day.
The neonatal unit should have theatres 
nearby for easy transfer of the baby, with 
convenient access to adult critical care
facilities. 

Patient
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Illus 4: Functional relationships diagram of an operating theatre
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For a comparison of the three models a 
schedule of accommodation is shown, this 
contains the required spaces, the recom-
mended number of spaces or rooms and the 
required spatial dimensions. Although the 
three models are different in their functional 
relationships, the spatial and dimensional 
requirements do not vary much, but rather 
the variations are identified in the inclusion 
of some spaces within specific areas.

Model 1: 
The model one takes as reference a “level 3 
maternity service within a small hospital in-
corporating 2 birth rooms, 5 maternity inpa-
tient beds and 2 cots to support step-down 
transfers of infants from networked neonatal 
care units” (AusHFG, 2023, p. 30).

Model 2:
The second model is represented by a mater-
nity impatient unit with accommodation for 
25 beds. To have a more detailed approxi-
mation of the spatial requirements, it is taken 
from the same model as an alternative that 
manages as an accommodation program-
me two rooms within the birth unit.

That is, there is model 2.1, which represents 
accommodation for 25 patients and model 
2.2, which represents two rooms i.e. it would 
be for two individual patients.

Model 3:
The third model is focused on a midwifery led 
unit in which 500 births occur per year. This 
reference is conceived in two ways, when the 
MLU is co-located with a consultant-led unit 
(Model 3.1) and when standalone (Model 
3.2).

Schedule of Accommodation:

MODEL 1

MODEL 2.1

Model 2

MODEL 2.2

MODEL 3.1

RECEPTION BIRTH SUITE

STAFF
AREAS

INPATIENT
ACCOMMODATION

MODEL 3.2

Model 3

Illus 5: Models and scheme for the schedule of
accommodation, own elaboration
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Within the reception area there are some re-
quired spaces that can be highlighted, such 
as the lounge and beverage area that could 
serve as a more comfortable place for visi-
tors. The meeting room which could be con-
sidered as a communal lounge to develop 
education programmes or to hold conferen-
ces. Also, there are other spaces more dedi-
cated to the wellbeing of mothers and their 
children, such as the play area, the nappy
changing room, and the feeding room, 
which provides more privacy for mothers 
and babies.

Reception Area 

ENTRY - RECEPTION - WAITING
  
  

Qty

  
  

Model 1

  
  

Reception

Pu
bl

ic
am

en
iti

es Bay for vending machine
Bay - Vending fountain
Parenting room
Waiting area
Accessible Toilet
Public Toilet
Visitor lounge room
Meeting room

Note: 
- No dimensions specified
/ Same dimensions as previous model 

Discount circulation :  

Play area
Bay - Wheelchair park 
Nappy changing room  
Infant feeding room 
Sitting and beverage bay: 6 places 

m2

  
  

Qty

  
  

m2

  
  

10

10
6
3

1
--
--
--

1
1
1

10

6
3

1

1
1

30
12

1
1

101
21

5
6

1
21

5,51

5,51

1
121

/ /

/

Model 2

  
  

Model 3

  
  

Qty

  
  

m2

  
  

 Model 1
25% 

 Model 2
35% 

 Model 3
35% 

An interesting point proposed in the interna-
tional guidelines (TAHPI) is the inclusion of 
one or more prayer rooms in the reception
area, which suggests a perspective of
respect for the beliefs and cultural diversity of 
patients and their companions. It also offers 
a space for emotional and spiritual support 
where visitors can express their needs, con-
cerns or even prayers that are part of their 
traditions. 

Illus 6: Dimensional requirements for the reception area, 
own elaboration

Data from: NHS, 2013. TAHPI, 2022. AusHFG, 2023.
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Of the spaces for inpatient antenatal and 
postnatal care, two spaces can be highligh-
ted. The patient lounge, as this room could 
be a space where mothers can gather and 
feel more accompanied during the day, and 
the seating area for companions, due to 
considering companions during the birthing 
process is a crucial factor. 

Inpatient antenatal and
postnatal care:

INPATIENT UNIT / ANTENATAL
POSNATAL CARE
  
  

1 Bed room
1 Bed room isolation
Ensuite standard
Ensuite accessible
Neonatal bay
Newborn bathing room
Handwashing
Linen
Mobile equipment
Bay - meal trolley
Milk preparation and storage
General equipment 
1Bedroom large
Anteroom 
Lounge patient
Sitting alcove
Sitting and beverage bay: 6 places

16,5

12,5
12
1

5
16,51

54
71

2
1
1

21
21
41
61
81

184
181
519
61

22
4

10

1

1
201
301
61
201
22

121

N.A

/

/

m2

  
  

Qty

  
  

Qty

  
  

m2

  
  

Model 1

  
  

Model 2

  
  

Model 3

  
  Qty

  
  

m2

  
  

Note: 
- No dimensions specified
/ Same dimensions as previous model
N.A: Not applicable  

Discount circulation :  

 Model 1
25% 

 Model 2
35% 

 Model 1
35% 

 Model 2
35% 

 Model 3
35% 

Depending on the type of maternity unit, 
more outpatient spaces can be included in 
the antenatal care area to expand the co-
verage of care provided. In this outpatient 
antenatal care area, consultation rooms, 
interview rooms, an ultrasound room, and 
even a pregnancy assessment room can be 
integrated. Although, this last space will re-

Illus 7: Dimensional requirements for the inpatient area, 
own elaboration

Data from: NHS, 2013. TAHPI, 2022. AusHFG, 2023.
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require more trained medical staff, which 
means that it will only be included in mater-
nity units with a higher level of service.

One space mentioned in all three models 
is the bereavement room, which is a space 
dedicated to “women and families who su-
ffer bereavement at any stage of pregnancy” 
(NHS, 2013, p. 5). This space is important 
to offer postnatal care to women and psy-
chological support, “it should be away from 
the birthing area and with a separate exit 
from the ward” (NHS, 2013, p. 5).

Birth Unit:
This area of the unit is quite technical and 
in general the three models do not specify 
any other spaces beyond those necessary for 
effective functionality. However, it is the area 
of the unit that requires the most support 
space, as it is there that most of the techni-
cal procedures are carried out and therefore 
must have all the necessary equipment and 
supplies for successful interventions.

Although the models mention the possibility 
that the birthing rooms have the option to in-
clude or not a swimming pool, the most im-
portant thing is that they offer the possibility 
for the woman to move freely during labour 
and to adopt the position of her choice.
 
Depending on the level of care of the unit, 
it is also essential to have all the necessary 
equipment for the care of the newborn with 
in the birth room, which is why there is a 
neonatal resuscitation area in the room. 

Staff Areas and amenities:
The medical staff zone in the maternity unit 
is essential for ensuring the well-being of the 
healthcare workers and at the same time 
to offer them some services and facilities.

Consequently, integrating space for them 
within their work area helps to improve the 
performance of the unit.

In addition to the required spaces such as 
the staff station, toilets, offices, and meeting 
rooms there are some spaces that can be 
integrated as staff overnight bedrooms that 
not only allow staff to rest after long shifts 
but could ensure that there is continuous 
availability of health personnel in the mater-
nity unit. This is because one of the recurrent 
problems in remote areas or low-income 
settings is that medical staff are not always 
available in health centres due to difficulties 
in access to these facilities.

Providing space and facilities for staff to stay 
in the facility for certain periods of time, if 
necessary, can improve the quality of service 
and encourage more women to choose to 
deliver in maternity units rather than at home 
(Essendi et al., 2015).

Optional accommodation:
These spaces are some additional rooms 
that support the activities developed in the 
midwifery led unit when standalone. They 
are not obligatory but can be integrated as 
support spaces for other areas of the unit.
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Birth Unit:

BIRTH UNIT
  
  

Assessment room
Ensuite- standard

Birth room with pool
Birth room without pool

Ensuite birthing 
Bay PPE-Personal protective equipment
Family bereavement room
Neonatal resuscitation  
Staff station
Clean store / Medication room
Dirty utility room
Storage 
Mobile equipment
Linen 
Blanket Blanket 
Resuscitation trolley 
Handwashing
Equipment
General store 
Cleaner’s room
Disposal room 
Patient and family lounge 
Bay - Beverage enclosed
Office
Bay - Staff property 
Store - sterile stock 
Clean Utility room
Ward pantry
Triage
Consulting room

20

7
3

15

1
51

342 241
34,52

62
40,52

2
1
1

151
121
121
101
11

11

11
81 201

101
61
81
201
51
122

61

91
51
81

121
51
91
31

1,51 1,51
1,51

21 41
2121

5

1,5

19

1

14
10-12

1 5,52

141
1

12
4

1
3

8
12

1
3-41

1

161

161
121
161
121

-
/

/

/

/

/

/

N.A

N.A

N.A

-

Model 1

  
  m2

  
  

Qty

  
  

Qty

  
  

m2

  
  

Model 2

  
  

Model 3

  
  Qty

  
  

m2

  
  

Note: 
- No dimensions specified
/ Same dimensions as previous mode
N.A: Not applicable
Discount circulation :  

 Model 1
25% 

 Model 2
35% 

 Model 1
35% 

 Model 2
35% 

 Model 3
35% 

Illus 8: Dimensional requirements for the birth unit, own elaboration

Data from: NHS, 2013. TAHPI, 2022. AusHFG, 2023.
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Staff areas and amenities:

STAFF  AREAS AND AMENITIES
  
  
Meeting room
Workstation

Staff room
Store files

Staff toilet 
Bay - property staff
Muntifunction device
Staff lounge
Office clinical / handover
Change - staff (female/male)
Overnight stay - bedroom 
Overnight stay - ensuite
Staff rest and mini kitchen (size based on number of seats) 

12

3
2
3

1 201
4,51
11

21
151

1
1

3
2

2
2

1

41

14

N.A

N.A

N.A

1

15
15

2

101
102

1
1,410

1,83

/

/

m2

  
  

Qty

  
  

Qty

  
  

m2

  
  

Model 1

  
  

Model 2

  
  

Model 3

  
  Qty

  
  

m2

  
  

Note: 
- No dimensions specified
/ Same dimensions as previous model
N.A: Not applicable
 Discount circulation :  

 Model 1
25% 

 Model 2
35% 

 Model 1
25% 

 Model 2
35% 

 Model 3
35% 

Illus 9: Dimensional requirements for staff areas
and amenities, own elaboration

Optional Accommodation:

OPTIONAL
ACCOMMODATION FOR MLU
  
  

Qty

  
 

Information/resource centre: 3 persons
Single-bed room
Shower room en-suite: chamfered
Preparation for parenthood room
(size based on number of places)
General store

m2

  
  

12

12

1
19

1

4,51

71

1

Model 3

  
  

Illus 10: Dimensional requirements for optional
accommodation for the midwifery Led Unit. (NHS, 2013)

Data from: NHS, 2013. TAHPI, 2022. AusHFG, 2023.
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In general, but not least, the three guidelines 
set out environmental characteristics that the 
maternity unit should have, all three models
agree that the environment should be a 
welcoming space and avoid the institutio-
nal atmosphere, on the contrary, manage a 
more informal environment. Including access 
to some outdoor areas also is considered an 
important point, especially in the birthing 
unit (AusHFG, 2023 and TAHPI, 2022). The 
connection with natural elements helps to 
reduce the levels of stress during labour, for 
that reason the importance of allowing mo-
bility between internal and external spaces.

“Birth rooms should provide a calm and safe 
setting where mothers can control and alter, 
as much as possible, the room environment” 
(AusHFG, 2023, p. 20). Keeping privacy is 
an essential aspect to consider in the design 
of birth rooms, because it gives the mother 
more security and makes them feel better in 
space.

All the internal characteristics include “furni-
shings, style, colour, textures and ambience,
influenced by perception and culture” (TAHPI,
2022). “The decoration of the Unit should 
be of a standard that meets the expectations 
of the clients using the services and make 
every effort to reduce an institutional atmos-
phere” (TAHPI, 2022, p. 16).

One possibility in the maternity unit is to
manage a “Homelike environment” which 
promotes a calm and stress-free environ-
ment (AusHFG, 2023). The decoration of the
environment may include the use of artwork 
or other visual elements that create a positi-
ve distraction for the mother during labour.

Environmental characteristics: Another relevant aspect is the use of natu-
ral light, this on should be maximised throu-
ghout the unit. “Windows are an important 
aspect of sensory orientation and psycholo-
gical well-being of patients” (Health Facility 
Guidelines, n.d., p. 8). “Natural light must 
be available in all bedrooms and is desira-
ble in inpatient areas such as lounge rooms” 
(TAHPI, 2022, p. 15).

Acoustics and ventilation are correlated 
features. On one hand, the noise should 
be reduced as much as possible in the bir-
thing unit and in the inpatient accommoda-
tion areas; to achieve this is necessary an 
acoustic treatment especially because in the 
birthing unit it is uncomfortable for mothers 
to listen to another woman during labour. 
On the other hand, depending on how the 
ventilation is connected, sounds may or 
may not be transmitted. “The ventilation 
distribution ductwork should be designed 
to minimise the transmission of sound from 
one area to another by suitable routing or 
separate distributions” (NHS, 2013, p. 40).

In summary, the above-mentioned guideli-
nes and models provide a structure for the 
maternity unit, independent of its focus of 
care. They have already studied guidelines 
that ensure the good functioning of the unit, 
the maintenance of hygiene and sanitation, 
and the prevention of infections or conta-
gious diseases.
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01.3 WHO’s Framework for 
Respectful and Supportive

Maternity Care

Beyond the technical guidelines there is ano-
ther approach of care in the maternity unit 
proposed by the World Health Organization, 
this approach is oriented to offer women a 
positive childbirth experience through a res-
pectful maternity care, an effective commu-
nication, an integration of the companions-
hip during labour and childbirth, and a 
continuity of care (WHO, 2018).

To better understand this approach, it is es-
sential to define what constitutes a positive 
childbirth experience and respectful mater-
nity care.

Positive Childbirth Birth Experience:
According to WHO (2018) a positive child-
birth experience is one: 

That fulfils or exceeds a woman’s prior per-
sonal and sociocultural beliefs and expec-
tations, including giving birth to a healthy 
baby in a clinically and psychologically safe 
environment with continuity of practical and 
emotional support from a birth companion 
and kind, technically competent clinical staff 
(WHO, 2018, p. 1).

Respectful Maternity Care: 
“Which refers to care organised for and 
provided to all women in a manner that 
maintains their dignity, privacy, and confi-
dentiality, ensures freedom from harm and 
mistreatment, and enables informed choice 
and continuous support during labour and 
childbirth” (WHO, 2018, p. 3).

With the aim of achieving such a positive 
childbirth experience there are some stan-
dard recommendations suggested by WHO, 
but at the same time the recommendations 
proposed the integration of new techniques 
that could improve the woman’s experience.
 
Among the main needs to provide respectful 
maternity care in reference to the infrastruc-
ture are the following:

Allow women and their babies to remain 
together, this can be translated in inpatient 
rooms with enough space for both. Another 
recommendation is oriented to maintain
labour, childbirth, and neonatal areas 
clean, appropriately illuminated, and well-
ventilated, as well as prioritising privacy 
through curtains, screens, and partitions 
(WHO, 2018).
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It is also important to have enough bed ca-
pacity to meet the needs of the community in 
which the maternity unit is located, as well as 
to provide all women with access to sanitary 
facilities such as cleaning bathrooms during 
labour.

According to the WHO recommendations, 
supportive facilities for the mother, her com-
panion, and even her other children are es-
sential to respectful maternity care. These 
guidelines emphasise the need for labour fa-
cilities that accommodate companions, offe-
ring a private space for the mother and her 
chosen support person. Additionally, basic 
amenities such as a chair, space to change 
clothes, and access to a toilet are recomme-

Illus 11: Schematic representation of the WHO intrapartum care model, 
(WHO, 2018)

nded to enable the companion to provide 
continuous and meaningful support throu-
ghout labour and delivery. 

Lastly, to have an effective communication 
that brings the mother security about the 
procedures, the interventions, and the gene-
ral process of birthing, WHO recommends 
have within the health facility, “training fa-
cilities to support development of skills and 
competencies in effective communication” 
(WHO, 2018, p. 27). This can be interpre-
ted in meeting rooms or social settings, utili-
sed for diverse purposes such as training for 
healthcare staff and educational sessions for 
mothers and fathers.
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One of the most important aspects of the 
WHO recommendations published in 2018 
is the inclusion of relaxation techniques 
for pain management. Healthy pregnant
women looking for pain relief during labor 
can benefit from relaxation techniques such 
as muscle massages, breathing, music, and 
mindfulness, depending on their preferences 
(WHO, 2018).

The relaxation techniques can be categori-
sed depending on the technique used and 
the equipment required, the spatial charac-
teristics, and the physical infrastructure may 
vary.

The general relaxation techniques include 
“breathing techniques, progressive muscle 
relaxation, and combined breathing and 
muscle relaxation techniques” (WHO, 2018, 
p. 106). The yoga techniques work with 
different yoga postures that will help the
mother to relieve pain during labour.

The music is also used as a technique offe-
ring to the woman a selection of music for 
labour, this technique can be related with the 
audio-analgesia technique, which, as the 
name suggests, uses some soothing sound 
to relieve pain and reduce stress.

Integrating these techniques into the mater-
nity unit can have a positive effect on the 
women’s experience, and they are low-cost 
interventions, “as most of these techniques 
can be performed by the woman herself
once learned, or with the support of a
labour companion, while others require little 
staff time and effort” (WHO, 2018, p. 108). 

However, they may require some modifica-
tion of the unit spaces or additional equip-
ment, for example the yoga technique will 
require sufficient floor space to spread a 

yoga mat. In the case of the use of music 
techniques, equipment will be necessary for 
playing music (e.g. phone, CD player, MP3 
player, speakers).

There are other methods that can be adop-
ted, such as manual techniques, which use 
massages or the application of warm com-
presses to relieve pain in women with low-risk 
pregnancies (WHO, 2018). These methods 
only require constant access to warm water, 
and they are low-cost because they can be 
performed by the woman’s companion.

Continuing with the idea of a positive child-
birth experience, WHO recommends mater-
nal mobility during labour and the possibility 
to women for choosing the birth position of 
their preference. If it is a low-risk pregnancy,
the upright position can be adopted. To 
follow these recommendations, it is essential 
to include in the birthing room a standard 
bed suitable for recumbent positions, ensu-
ring comfort and versatility for various birth 
preferences.

Additional options, such as birthing cushions 
or alternative support for upright positions, 
as well as a birthing stool, may be provided 
to accommodate and facilitate upright birth 
positions, enhancing comfort and choice for 
the mother (WHO, 2018).

As mentioned above, the quality of care 
provided directly influences the experience 
of the mother, which is why it is essential to 
offer quality care oriented towards respectful 
care in health facilities and maternity units. 
In general terms, to improve the quality of 
care, WHO also sets standards that focus on 
the provision of care, the experience of care 
and the human and physical resources avai-
lable to provide care.
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“Good-quality care requires appropriate use 
of effective clinical and non-clinical inter-
ventions, strengthened health infrastructure,
optimum skills, and a positive attitude of 
health providers” (WHO, 2016, p. 5). In that 
sense WHO (2016) proposes eight domains 
to define the priorities for quality improve-
ment:

Standard 1: “Every woman and new-
born receive routine, evidence-based care 
and management of complications during
labour, childbirth and the early postnatal
period, according to WHO guidelines” 
(WHO, 2016, p. 2).

Standard 2: “The health information system 
enables use of data to ensure early, appro-
priate action to improve the care of every 
woman and newborn” (WHO, 2016, p. 3).

Standard 3: “Every woman and newborn 
with condition(s) that cannot be dealt with 
effectively with the available resources is 
appropriately referred” (WHO, 2016, p. 3).

Standard 4: “Communication with women 
and their families is effective and responds to 
their needs and preferences” (WHO, 2016, 
p. 3).

Standard 5: “Women and newborns recei-
ve care with respect and preservation of their 
dignity” (WHO, 2016, p. 3).

Standard 6: “Every woman and her family 
are provided with emotional support that is 
sensitive to their needs and strengthens the 
woman’s capability” (WHO, 2016, p. 3).

Standard 7: “For every woman and new-
born, competent, motivated staff are consis-
tently available to provide routine care and 
manage complications” (WHO, 2016, p. 4).

Standard 8: “The health facility has an 
appropriate physical environment, with ade-
quate water, sanitation and energy supplies, 
medicines, supplies and equipment for
routine maternal and newborn care and
management of complications” (WHO, 
2016, p. 4).

For this paper, I focus on the latter stan-
dard which provides the infrastructural
requirements and amenities necessary to offer
quality care. 

Firstly, the maternity unit must have all the 
supplies it needs to operate, which inclu-
de adequate sanitation and hygienic of the 
space. It must be stocked with the medicines 
required for procedures and interventions. 
In addition, it must have sufficiently trained 
medical staff.

Secondly, the unit would be organised and 
maintained in a way that every woman and 
newborn can be cared for according to their 
needs in private, to facilitate the continuity 
of care. It includes a designated area in the 
labour and childbirth section specifically for 
newborn resuscitation, furnished with essen-
tial equipment such as a radiant warmer, and 
appropriate resuscitation supplies. An ade-
quate number of clean, well-lit, ventilated,
and private birthing rooms are available 
to accommodate the estimated number
of births in the service area. The facility also 
supports 24-hour rooming-in to enable
mothers and babies to remain together 
(WHO, 2016).

Additionally, a functional, accessible ba-
throom is available solely for women in
labour, and the proximity of a fully equipped 
operating theatre ensures swift access for 
surgical needs. 



31

A recovery room is reserved for women with 
complications, and a dedicated ward is 
available for the care of unwell or unstable 
infants, ensuring comprehensive maternal 
and neonatal support.

Finally, the maternity unit should have “ade-
quate stocks of medicines, supplies and 
equipment available for routine care and 
management of complications” (WHO, 
2023, P. 60).

All the above-mentioned aspects guaran-
tee the proper functioning of the unit, which 
will improve the care and quality of care for 
mothers and newborns. If facilities have the 
necessary equipment, supplies, drugs, and 
human resources to adequately attend births 
and provide quality antenatal and postnatal 
care, the objective of improving quality will 
be met. And the dignity, privacy and confi-
dentiality of the mother will be maintained 
as well as avoiding negative experiences for 
them and ill-treatment.
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The worldwide current situation of maternal
and newborn health during pregnancy,
childbirth, and the postpartum period conti-
nues to represent a considerable challenge, 
for countries and for various international
organisations, such as the World Health 
Organization (WHO) and different United 
Nations agencies. Despite efforts, the pre-
sence of numerous maternity units around 
the world that operate under a variety of 
approaches, and established international 
guidelines, significant limitations persist in 
both the quality of care offered and access 
to these health facilities.

These barriers particularly affect context with 
limited resources, where access to quali-
ty antenatal, delivery, and postnatal care is 
restricted and where relevant socio-cultural 
aspects are often not considered. As a result, 
many mothers prefer to opt for home births, 
which increases the risks for both mother and 
newborn, in the absence of adequate care.

From this scenario it can be understood why, 
notwithstanding global efforts to reduce 
maternal mortality rates, the rates of ma-
ternal mortality and health complications
remain high. This situation reflects a significant 
challenge in the field of public health, since, 
despite the policies and programs implemen-
ted with the aim of reducing these figures,

substantial progress has not yet been made 
in improving the quality of health services 
provided to mothers.

It is therefore necessary to re-evaluate how 
architecture directly and indirectly influen-
ces the health services offered to mothers. 
While there are international standards for 
how maternity units should be structured, it 
is equally important to consider how these
facilities can be more accessible, including 
socio-cultural factors and be designed with 
a focus on users’ needs. By addressing
these issues, a reinterpretation of the mater-
nity unit could be made to improve maternal
experience, and consequently influence
access to care and reduce maternal morta-
lity rates.

To understand this problem in greater depth, 
it is necessary to present the problem from 
three perspectives: first, by reviewing the ob-
jectives and goals set over the last 20 years to 
improve maternal and neonatal health, and 
how maternal mortality rates have evolved. 
The second, from the existing limitations to 
access and quality service in health centres
or maternity units. The third, focuses on 
how maternity units and delivery areas are 
currently conceived from a medical perspec-
tive, when they should be human-centred 
and have a more integrated approach.
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 02.1 International goals and 
maternal mortality rates 

According to the most recent report by the 
WHO published in 2020, “an estimated 
287,00 women lost their lives globally due 
to maternal causes, which translates to near-
ly 800 maternal deaths each day” (WHO, 
2023, p. 2); or roughly “one death every two 
minutes” (WHO, 2023, p.2). These figures 
reveal a critical need for enhanced efforts 
at both global and regional levels to ensure 
that health systems are sufficiently equipped 
and accessible to all women. Furthermore, 
it is essential to explore why some women in
certain regions opt not to utilize health facilities 
for antenatal care or choose home deliveries.

With the intention of providing a historical 
background of the global goals established 
over the years, a comprehensive analysis 
spanning from 2000 to 2020 is examined. 
This period is coherent with the WHO report 
“Trends in Mortality 2000 to 2020,” which 
was published in 2023 and includes estima-
tes from WHO as well as other organizations 
such as UNICEF and the World Bank Group.

In 2000, 339 maternal deaths per 100,000 
births were recorded in the MMR statistics 
report, indicating a significant milestone: 
the beginning of the Millennium Develop-
ment Goals. These goals aimed to achieve
eight milestones by 2015, with Goal 5 fo-
cusing on improving health outcomes

and including targets detailed in a document 
released by WHO on February 19th.

The target 5.a. was “reduce by three quar-
ters, between 1990 and 2015, the maternal 
mortality ratio” (WHO, 2018). And the target 
5.b. was “achieve, by 2015, universal ac-
cess to reproductive health” (WHO, 2018).

The Sustainable Development Goals (SDGs) 
launched in 2015 with a timeframe spanning 
from 2016 to 2030 include a focus on goal 
three. “Ensuring lives and wellbeing all at 
every stage of life” (WHO report, 2023). This 
study focuses on target 3.1. “aimed at lowe-
ring MMR to below 70 deaths, per 100,000 
live births by 2030” (WHO report, 2023, p. 1).

As of the most recent WHO report, maternal
mortality rates decreased only slightly
between 2016 and 2020. As a result, mee-
ting the SDG target by 2030 will require 
significant efforts; an average annual rate 
(ARR) reduction of approximately 11.6% 
must be realized between 2021 and 2030 
(WHO report, 2023).
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2000

MDGs Era

2015
2016

2020

2030

2021

Maternal Mortality Ratio
339 deaths per 100,000 live births  

Millenium Development Goals  
Significant reduction in the
MMR in 130 countries  

From 2016 to 2020, there was a
significant reduction in the MMR
in 31 countries  

Maternal Mortality Ratio
227 deaths per 100.000 live births  

Sustainable Development Goals
SDGs were launched  

Maternal Mortality Ratio
223 deaths per 100.000 live births  

Target 3.1 SDGs
“Reduce maternal deaths to
75 per100.000 live births”
(WHO report, 2023, p. 1).

EPMM launched new coverage
targets to meet SDGs 

SDGs Era

EPMM

Proccess for implementation for
sustainable Development Goals  

Ending preventable
maternal mortality 

Illus 12: Timeline, own elaboration
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As shown in the the WHO report (2023), the 
MMR for 2020 varies significantly across the 
world’s regions.

• Latin America and the Caribbean accoun-
ted for “88 deaths”.
• North Africa and West Asia “84 deaths”.
• East and Southeast Asia “74 deaths”.
•Europe and North America “13 deaths”.
•Australia and New Zealand “4 deaths”

Sub-Saharan Africa evidenced an alarmin-
gly high MMR of 545 maternal deaths per 
100,000 live births; this region “accounted 
for approximately 70% of global maternal 
deaths in 2020, followed by Central and 
Southern Asia, which accounted for nearly 
17%” (WHO, 2023, p. 2).

This inequity in maternal mortality rates is 
concerning and highlights the limitations for 
accessing to healthcare between high deve-
loped and least developed countries (LDCs).  
Nevertheless, “only 13% of the world po-
pulation lives in least developed countries” 
(WHO, 2023, p. 2). The LDCs had a large 
share of aggregated maternal deaths, taking 
around 42% of all global maternal deaths 
as late as in year 2020. These countries 
have an estimated Maternal Mortality Ratio 
(MMR) of 377 deaths per 100,000 live bir-
ths (WHO, 2023). 

As the evidence shows, unfortunately, low-in-
come and least developed countries still 
have difficulties in ensuring access to qua-
lity health care, partly due to distinct factors 
such as the health policies applied, the dis-
tribution of supplies and resources, cultural 
and contextual differences, among others. 
Such deficiencies in the health system, infras-
tructure, transport and sanitation problems 
and lack of adequate personnel contribute

to the fact that maternal mortality rates are 
not declining as expected.

In difficult and precarious environments, 
the causes of death may be direct obstetric 
burdens such as “postpartum haemorrhage, 
pre-eclampsia, and hypertensive disorders, 
pregnancy-related infections, complications 
of unsafe abortion” (WHO, 2023, p. 6), 
indirect causes such as infectious and 
non-communicable diseases (WHO, 2023).

These complications may also be due to the 
prevalence of mothers having their delive-
ries assisted by traditional birth attendants, 
which exposes women and newborns to the 
lack of an adequate response to complica-
tions and infections.
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 02.2 Factors influencing the 
quality of care 

Ensuring that mothers have access to ade-
quate care is critical to reducing the poten-
tial risk of illness and death, thanks to efforts 
for improving the quality of care offered to 
mothers also the maternal mortality rates 
have been reduced (Chang et al., 2020). 
However, achieving this is not a simple task 
and not only improving the quality of clinical 
care but also the non-clinical care of women 
must be considered, considering other so-
cio-cultural factors to provide a positive ex-
perience during all stages of pregnancy and 
the immediate postpartum period (Asefa et 
al., 2020).

Unfortunately, ensuring such access is not 
always possible and the quality of care does 
not always meet the standards previously set 
by international standards. Firstly, due to the 
lack of rigorous monitoring by international 
mechanisms and secondly because the same 
indicators for measuring the service quality in 
health facilities are extensive and distant from 
medical personnel (Chang et al., 2020).

A clear problem is related to the guideli-
nes established, as evidence shows that 
they were not designed precisely for the 
settings where implementation is most cri-
tical to saving the lives of mothers and 
newborns, nor assessed in low- and mi-
ddle-income settings (Manu et al., 2018). 

Neither the guidelines include socio-cultural 
aspects within the requirements of care to be 
provided to mothers, based on international 
directives that focus on providing a technical 
structure of the maternity unit and the spaces 
that support health services, but do not inte-
grate factors that influence users’ experience 
such as their culture, beliefs, and traditions.

The lack of consideration of local realities, 
both in terms of infrastructure, resources, 
culture, traditions, and even human capa-
cities, can limit the effectiveness of interven-
tions and, in some cases, even aggravate 
contrasts in access to health. This suggests 
a call for standard-setting organisations to 
place more emphasis on country contexts 
and conditions to improve policies and be-
tter manage health programmes (Victora et 
al., 2019).

While it is indisputable that standards still 
have room for improvement, they are not 
the only cause limiting access to health and 
undermining quality of care, as other factors 
such as the physical infrastructure of the fa-
cility, access to the facility, water and electri-
city supplies, and even the health personnel 
available are more detailed in these types of 
low-income contexts.
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The infrastructure of health facilities is ano-
ther factor that directly affects the quality of 
care offered, considering that it has different 
components such as “the facility and its ma-
nagement, the physical infrastructure, the 
supply facility system, the disposal system, 
technical medical equipment, information, 
communication technology, and the outreach 
services” (Scholz et al., 2015, p. 2). If the 
overall conditions are not optimal, the quali-
ty of the care that can be offered decreases.

The experience of women and her compa-
nions within the maternity unit can be affected 
by physical factors, as well as the care and 
attention offered to mothers and newborns. 
This is the case in many facilities around the 
world, especially those in contexts of scarcity, 
where for example the facilities themselves 
do not meet hygiene standards, are not ade-
quately stocked with medicines and special 
equipment, do not have a constant supply of 
water and energy, are not adequately main-
tained, and do not have a referral system 
due to difficulty of access, variables that hin-
der the effectiveness of the procedures and 
services that can be offered, as well as the 
satisfaction of mothers for being cared in 
maternity units.

Continuing in a deeper sense in the limita-
tions of the sanitary facilities, this includes 
the dysfunction or complete absence of utili-
ties such as showers and toilets, shortage of 
water supply, no waiting area for accompan-
ying persons, and poorly ventilated rooms 
(Asefa et al., 2020). These shortcomings are 
not only related to the quality of the service, 
but also to the patient’s experience and the 
failure to meet their physical and emotional 
needs, for example, the woman in labour 
will not feel equally comfortable if the space

Physical infrastructure: where she is, does not have some sense of 
privacy, good lighting, and ventilation. Ins-
tead of the experience being rewarding and 
helping her in labour, on the contrary, it may 
cause stress and hinder the natural process 
of childbirth.

In reference to the infrastructure itself it is sig-
nificant to mention that when talking about 
low-income settings there may be deficien-
cies in service capacity. For example, where 
there may be a shortage of beds or over-
crowding of patients (Asefa et al., 2020). 
This becomes a negative aspect faced by 
women who attend a health facility with the 
assumption that they will receive a better 
service. On the contrary, it becomes a fac-
tor that, if it becomes common, influences 
women to continue to prefer home births.

Offering quality care and attention is not 
only related to the service, but also to the 
infrastructure available to offer the service, 
because beyond being functional. It must 
correspond to the characteristics of the en-
vironment in which the health facility plans 
to be developed, to achieve a correct per-
formance.

Electricity and Water supply:
Water and electricity supply are key elements 
to ensure the proper functioning of any heal-
th facility regardless of its scale. However, in 
difficult contexts with limited resources, wa-
ter and electricity supply cannot always be 
assured, putting at risk the service that can 
be provided and generating other problems 
consequently.

In the case of not being able to count with 
water supply 24 hours a day, every day, can 
complicate the functioning of the maternity 
unit and even put patients at risk (Essendi et 
al., 2015).
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Illus 14: Al-Shaheed Mahnaf Hospital in Loader 
district, Abyan governorate, Yemen

Illus 15: Child welfare clinic, Batapotha,
Battaramula, Sri Lanka
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The scarcity of drinking water implies serious 
hygiene and sanitation problems, because 
it reduces the frequency with which hands, 
equipment, and instruments used in proce-
dures can be cleaned and disinfected, which 
exposes mothers, newborns, and health per-
sonnel to infections.

In addition, without a continuous water 
supply, some of the relaxation techniques 
proposed by WHO for a positive birth ex-
perience cannot be applied, reducing the 
options for pain relief during labour. This 
reduces the possibilities for the materni-
ty unit to offer quality care to the mother.

On the other hand, electricity supply is also 
an indispensable requirement for the correct 
and efficient functioning of the health facili-
ty, considering that many medical equipment 
used daily depend directly on the continuous 
and stable flow of electricity to operate pro-
perly. In turn, the lack of electricity supply has 
direct implications for the conservation of 
medicines and vaccines, which must main-
tain a cold chain. If this chain is interrupted, 
essential supplies for the treatment and pre-
vention of diseases could be lost.

The power supply is an important factor for 
a maternity centre because many of the me-
dical equipment used to monitor mothers 
and newborns are completely dependent on 
electricity. If the continuous supply of elec-
tricity cannot be guaranteed the monitoring 
and checking of pregnant women and ba-
bies can be put at risk, endangering their 
lives and well-being, and diminishing the 
quality of care.

In a maternity centre, the supply of essen-
tial resources such as water and electricity 
must be guaranteed so as not to put mothers 

and newborns at risk, especially if there are 
targets aiming to reduce maternal mortality 
and morbidity.

Access:
Access to health services is another point 
that must be addressed in low developed 
regions, especially in rural areas where the 
access to health centres or maternity units 
presents different limitations. This aspect is 
related to transport infrastructure, which in-
cludes both roads and available means of 
movement. 

The difficulties that may arise due to the 
available transport infrastructure becomes 
a determining factor in the availability of 
service, since if for example roads are in 
poor condition access to necessary medical
supplements, health care providers, and 
even patients, can be disrupted (Maternal, 
2012); and the referral system between 
health facilities may also be affected. 

This situation is aggravated in rural areas 
where the precariousness of roads becomes 
a barrier to access to health and referrals for 
mothers and newborns (Essendi et al., 2015). 
As a result, access to adequate health care is 
limited and the risk of complications during 
pregnancy and childbirth increases. 

If a pregnant woman does not have a heal-
thcare centre or maternity unit nearby, or if 
access to such facilities is challenging due 
to poor road conditions, infrequent transport 
options, or high additional transportation 
costs, she is unlikely to attend regular check-
ups. Furthermore, at the time of delivery, she 
may still prefer a traditional midwife at home 
(Essendi et al., 2015 and Amouzou et al., 
2019).
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That is why in some regions of the world, 
the design of waiting houses for mothers, 
or transitional facilities where mothers can 
stay even up to six weeks before the sche-
duled date of delivery is being considered. 
This type of facility ensures that the mother 
can access adequate care. In addition, this 
model can have some benefits, they can be 
used for educational programs, as support 
facilities for the mother’s companions and 
other children and serve as a temporary re-
sidence for premature births.

Health personnel:
Today we are facing a worldwide crisis of the 
availability of medical care. This has an im-
pact on the health care that can be offered 
especially to mothers and newborns, even 
more considering the shortage of midwives, 
gynaecologists, and obstetricians. This as-
pect is relevant if the aim is to provide a high 
quality of care (Asefa et al., 2020).

Consequently, if there is a shortage of health 
professionals of doctors, midwives, and nur-
ses, some women users will prefer to seek 
care from the TBA (traditional birth atten-
dants) and opt for this alternative that gua-
rantees them will always be available to pro-
vide care and support (Essendi et al., 2015).

This shortfall is due to several factors which 
will not be detailed, but if a solution is nee-
ded especially because the percentage of 
available active medical personnel is not 
evenly distributed. It is even more difficult 
to have qualified personnel in precarious 
contexts, for example, “Sub-Saharan Africa 
hosts 11% of the world’s population, but ca-
rries 24% of the global maternal morbidity 
burden and only 3% of the world’s health 
workforce and is narrowly attributed to 1% 
of the world’s health expenditure” (Maternal 
N, 2012, p. 7).

The capacity of health personnel is another 
factor directly affecting the quality of care 
and influences the decision of many women 
to use health facilities and the western health 
system, especially in precarious contexts with 
different traditions and cultures. Better plan-
ning of health systems and their infrastructu-
re is required to improve care, especially in 
contexts with limited resources where adap-
tation is needed.

In conclusion, in many places there are sti-
ll significant disparities in the equitable co-
verage of essential maternal and perinatal 
health interventions, which is an obstacle 
(Maternal Health, 2021). It is critical that 
global standards are developed with an in-
clusive approach focused on women and 
their needs. But also consider the variations 
between contexts in terms of resources, heal-
th conditions, and access to health care.

It is essential to pay particular attention to 
those environments where local culture and 
traditions conflict with the strict application 
of international guidelines, which may lead 
to tensions or discrepancies in their effective-
ness. Consequently, it is necessary to adapt 
the maternity units towards a sensitive and 
contextualised approach that considers so-
cio-cultural particularities to achieve a more 
adequate and effective implementation.
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 02.3 A new conception of the 
maternity unit-delivery space

Nowadays, the maternity unit is conceived 
as a medical structure where mothers and 
newborns are cared for during pregnancy, 
delivery, and postnatal period. Beyond the 
medical perspective, there are more possibi-
lities for designing a maternity unit, it could 
be based on design approaches that “su-
pport normal physiological birth processes 
and emotionally satisfying birth experien-
ces” (Balabanoff, 2023, p. 414). However, 
studies in this field are not relevant today.

The birth environment plays a significant role 
not only in promoting physical progress but 
also in supporting emotional well-being of 
the mother, which is essential for a positive 
birth experience. For that reason, it is signifi-
cant to know how the spatial atmosphere in 
the maternity unit can impact the hormonal 
birth process in both ways, positive or ne-
gative (Balabanoff, 2023). The biomedical 
model of birth care frequently overlooks the 
personal and emotional experiences of chil-
dbirth, prioritising clinical procedures over 
the holistic needs of the mother.

As Balabanoff (2023) explains, “In labour, 
anxiety or situations in which the woman 
does not feel private, safe, and undisturbed 
may provoke epinephrine-norepinephrine 
elevations, which may slow or stall labour 
and reduce foetal blood supply via epi-

nephrine-norepinephrine effects” (Bala-
banoff, 2023, p. 421). This can exemplify 
how the natural process of childbirth may 
be affected, influencing both maternal and 
neonatal physical and emotional outcomes 
(Nilsson et al., 2020).

The birthing room is used by various indivi-
duals at different stages, including mothers, 
supporters, and midwives, necessitating an 
adaptable environment that accommodates 
the evolving needs of each stage of the birth 
process (Setola et al., 2019). This adaptabi-
lity is particularly relevant when considering 
cultural differences as the birth spaces should 
embody cultural and spiritual traditions, fos-
tering respect and dignity for all involved.

For instance, some women from diverse cul-
tural backgrounds perceive medical birth 
facilities as hostile rather than welcoming 
environments. “Indigenous women’s birth 
practices have traditionally been situated in 
their surrounding environments, which are 
sometimes purpose-built” (Sheila Kitzinger 
cited by Balabanoff, 2023, p. 429).

Improving the maternity unit has demons-
trable effects, such as reducing the need for 
epidurals and other medical interventions, 
lowering stress and anxiety levels, and en-
hancing the ability of medical personnel
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to perform their duties effectively (Setola et 
al., 2019). In line with these findings, the 
latest World Health Organization guidelines 
underscore the importance of supporting the 
physiological process of childbirth across all 
birth settings (WHO, 2018).

Advocating for birth environments that meet 
the medical and emotional needs of the 
mother, in addition to including sociocultu-
ral factors, could promote overall maternal 
and neonatal health outcomes. However, it 
is essential to generate more studies with this 
type of approach. 

To conclude the chapter, it is important to 
consider the gap between current designs
and international guidelines on mater-
nity units, because they are not geared to 
supporting the natural process of childbirth
from a holistic perspective focusing on
women and their needs. Nor does it consider
socio-cultural factors that support and 
integrate women’s beliefs, and in turn
encourage a positive birthing experience.

This gap should be considered as a relevant 
issue, since it is not included in the already 
established directives, and it is not develo-
ped in contexts where its application would 
bring improvements in outcomes. If today, 
there are organisations and governments 
worldwide that focus on improving mater-
nal and neonatal health and care, including 
other design approaches in maternity units 
could bring more positive results, and would 
help to reduce problems related to access, 
infrastructure, medical staff, maternal morta-
lity rates and women’s preference for home 
births.

To improve the maternal experience and reduce
maternal mortality rates,  the architecture
of the maternity unit needs to be reassessed, 
considering socio-cultural factors and users’ 
needs. This may lead to a more integrated 
approach to maternity units and delivery 
wards and address existing limitations in 
terms of quality of care at maternity units.
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Illus 16: The logic behind the construction of the Birth Environment Spatial 
Perception Questionnaire (Nicoletta et al., 2022).

Illus 17: Different sensory elements creating a calm and relaxing atmos-
phere in the birth room (Setola et al., 2019).
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03.1 Problem 

In the field of maternity unit design, and pro-
jection of guidelines for maternity care in-
frastructures, there is a growing gap in the 
inclusion of cultural aspects and more inte-
grated human-centred approache to care. 

Currently, there is little development and re-
search on the inclusion of cultural factors wi-
thin the maternity unit, as well as a lack of 
emphasis on users’ needs, especially woman 
needs. This is most relevant in regions of the 
world with limited resources, where culture, 
traditions, and beliefs vary. This issue is of 
paramount importance if global goals are to 
increase access to health services, improve 
the quality of care offered to mothers and 
newborns, and reduce maternal mortality 
rates.

One of the factors contributing to this pro-
blem is that most international guidelines, 
standards, and recommendations focus on 
the organisational requirements and layout 
of the maternity unit. These directives are 
aimed at designing a functional and hygienic 
structure, which maintains sanitary parame-
ters, avoids preservation and transmission of 
diseases, and functions efficiently.

On the other hand, there are still limitations 
in terms of access to health care, especia-
lly in low developed settings, ranging from

the physical conditions of the facility, the 
supplies and equipment available for quality
care, the means available for accessing
maternal services, and the availability of me-
dical personnel.

If this problem is not addressed, many wo-
men around the world in different contexts 
will continue to prefer not to access these 
types of health services. Mothers may ex-
perience dissatisfaction with these infras-
tructures due to unmet expectations of 
care, discomfort with the environment or 
the staff’s treatment, unfamiliarity with the 
setting in where they are, a perceived lack 
of attention to their needs, or instances of 
mistreatment and abuse during their care.

This problem influences women to continue 
preferring home births, to be cared for in a 
close and familiar environment, and to be 
assisted by traditional birth attendants or
women from the same community, putting
the life of the mother and baby at risk. 
Especially given that the global goals are to
reduce maternal deaths while increasing 
and improving access to health care.

From this perspective, it is necessary to  
question:
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How to integrate socio-cultural elements, 
considering the needs of women, her family,

and the medical personnel within
the maternity unit? 

How to support the natural process of
childbirth keeping in mind the physiological
and psychological needs of women within

maternity units, respecting the requirements
already included in international guidelines,

to be more flexible and adaptive in the
implementation of such sanitary

infrastructure in contexts
with limited resources?
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Illus 18: Haiti’s Precarious State of Health Care
for Pregnant Women
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03.2 Objectives

General aim:
The principal aim of the thesis is evaluating 
the elements that can be included in thede-
sign of maternity units to integrate cultural, 
social, and contextual factors, in regions 
with limited resources. And then prioritise 
the needs and experience of all the users in-
volved. 

Specific objectives: 
1. Characterise the maternity unit, its spatial 
requirements, functions, operational con-
nections, and spatial particularities.

2. Identify the factors that contribute to the 
problem’s continued existence.

3. Identify new maternity unit design concepts 
and approaches to care in the existing literature.

4. Analyse and define which concepts can 
contribute to the inclusion of sociocultural 
factors and users’ needs in the maternity unit.

5. Develop an assessment tool that can be 
applied to different contexts with the aim of 
identifying which spaces and characteristics 
should be included in the maternity unit
depending on local conditions.

6. Evaluate the evidence of maternity units, 
both built and proposed, to identify which 
elements of the literature are being applied 
and, if not, what new proposals exist that 
respond more adequately to the needs of 
users and the specific issues of the contexts 
in which they are located.

7. Propose a spatial scheme that includes 
non-conventional spaces within the materni-
ty unit, to integrate cultural factors that allow 
a better adaptation of the health infrastructu-
re within the context where it will be located.
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03.3 Methodology

The study was developed in two parts, the 
first focused on a literature review of inno-
vative approaches to design maternity units 
and new perspectives of care. And the se-
cond was evidence-based, taking case stu-
dies, and analysing them. 

In the first part, research was done taking 
scientific articles, which were then analysed 
to obtain new concepts of design and care. 
From these innovative approaches, it was 
obtained some new spaces that could be 
integrated into the structure of a maternity 
unit, and environment features that help the 
woman in the process of childbirth. 

FIRST PART
Literature review:
A search was conducted on scientific articles 
published within the last 14 years, with a 
particular emphasis on the most recent lite-
rature on new approaches to the design of 
maternity units or healthcare facilities, which 
take a much more personal approach to the 
patients and staff experience, considering 
contextual, socio-cultural, and traditional 
differences.

This step aims to identify what has been 
done, researched, and written about the 
integration of cultural aspects, considering 
the integration of non-conventional spaces

and environmental characteristics within the 
projection of maternity units, especially in 
low-income settings.

Databases such as Scopus, PubMed, Open 
Athens, BMJ Open, and ResearchGate were 
used for this search.

Data Analysis:
After collecting all the articles, they were 
analysed in a way that identified and cate-
gorised innovative design concepts of ma-
ternity units and new approaches to care. 
The current ideas emerged from the articles 
support the development of the thesis, such 
as the inclusion of unconventional spaces 
within the maternity unit and suggested en-
vironmental features to enhance the users’ 
experience within the unit.

These aspects benefit socio-cultural diffe-
rences and individual perceptions that vary 
across regions of the world. Thus, enriching 
the understanding of the maternity unit by 
appreciating the cultural and social diversity 
in each specific context. 

Assessment Tool:
The information was divided into innovative 
design and care approaches, and indicators 
on unconventional spaces and environmen-
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tal  features, this information was used then 
to build a matrix. The matrix allows linking 
new design approaches with new spaces 
that integrate socio-cultural differences and 
environmental features to enhance the expe-
rience within the unit.

Through this matrix, an assessment tool was 
generated to assess which characteristics 
and spaces can be included in the maternity 
unit depending on the context in which it is 
to be located.

Tool Application: 
First, a methodology was developed so that 
the tool can be used and applied in diffe-
rent contexts, it functions as an assessment 
instrument to integrate cultural and social 
aspects within the maternity units.

Then, the assessment was applied in two 
contexts with quite different visions of maternity 
and conception of childbirth, this to recognize 

what social, cultural, and traditional factors 
influence the design of maternity units and 
that depending on the context some spaces 
or features should be integrated or omitted. 

SECOND PART 
Case studies analysis:
This analysis aimed to identify successful
designs or innovative proposals that integra-
te unconventional spaces, consider cultural 
factors, adopt a comprehensive approach, 
and prioritise users’ specific needs.

Proposal: 
Finally, a proposal was made focused on the 
integration of unconventional spaces within 
the structure of a maternity unit, supporting 
socio-cultural and contextual differences. 
This proposal is based on the configuration 
of the maternity unit already validated by
international organisations.
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04.1 New Approaches to
design and care

To develop a conceptual framework a lite-
rature review was made to obtain innova-
tive approaches of design more focus on 
integration of contextual, sociocultural, and 
traditional factors. And different carepers-
pectives that consider women as the primary 
focus of care and their needs, as well as the 
demands of her family or companions and 
the health personnel. 

The present research covers a period of 14 
years, from 2010 to 2024, to consider the 
most recent advances in the last decade and 
to analyse the evolution of the topic over 
the years. Initially, a study period limited to 
the last 10 years was contemplated; howe-
ver, significant findings were identified since 
2010, which allows inferring that the topic 
of the projection of maternity units, focused 
on diverse perspectives and oriented to users 
such as mothers, their families, and staff, has 
been addressed for some time. Nevertheless, 
there are still important gaps in the practical 
application and research in this field.

The analysis of the last 14 years corrobora-
tes the validity and relevance of the topic, 
showing that, with the advance of technolo-
gy and the facilitated access to knowledge 
exchange, the argument in favour of inves-
tigating new approaches in maternity units 
has gained strength. This highlights the need

for further research that addresses the imple-
mentation of approaches that consider spe-
cific cultural and contextual factors. Althou-
gh the period of study is broad to enrich the 
development of this work, emphasis is pla-
ced on the review of more recent literature, 
with the intention of maintaining an updated 
perspective based on contemporary studies.

The key words used in the literature search 
were maternity, maternity unit design, 
maternal health, maternity units, maternity 
care, barriers to maternity care, maternity 
services, birthing unit, childbirth, birth unit 
design, birth environment, birth experience, 
birthing process, physiological birth, labour 
and delivery units, birthing room, needs of 
birthing woman, midwifery unit, midwives, 
midwife-led unit, family centred care, and 
healthcare environment.

The research was carried out using databa-
ses such as PubMed, Scopus, ResearchGate, 
Open Athens, BMJ Open, and BMC Preg-
nancy and Childbirth. From the search re-
sults, the thirty most relevant articles related to 
the development of this research were selec-
ted. Then, the articles were read to establish 
a baseline of innovative approaches for the 
projection of maternity units, and new pers-
pectives of care considering the viewpoint of 
mothers, companions, and health personnel.
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Within the analysis of the articles, it was 
found that several of the concepts and 
approaches to care mentioned by the au-
thors were repeated and suggested the 
need and lack of research that exists into the
design and conception of health facilities 
and care, more focused on the experience 
of the users. Furthermore, there is currently 
a large gap in the conceptualisation of chil-
dbirth as a natural phenomenon that consi-
ders the physical and emotional needs of the 
mother, as well as the lack of humanisation 
in birth environments, aspects that are little 
considered in maternity units.

Each of the articles reviewed provided a de-
tailed description of the position and pers-
pective from which they were developed, 
based on new approaches to care or design 
concepts for the birth environment. From this 
basis, the articles highlighted features of the 
environment that should be considered, spa-
ces that could be integrated into the mater-
nity unit, and best practices for the care of 
mothers, newborns, families, and midwives, 
also highlighting the importance of the rela-
tionships between these actors.

For better understanding the information 
obtained was classified into innovative 
approaches to care, new concepts related to 
architectural design and environmental cha-
racteristics, and independent concepts. The 
latter are considered because of their impor-
tance in the process of pregnancy, birth, and 
postnatal care.

The group of care approaches is divided 
into two subgroups, approaches that take 
a broader view of the general environ-
ment in the maternity unit and birth wards,
and approaches that are focused on 
the care offered in the health facility.

Within the first subgroup is the holistic, salu-
togenic, humanised, and caring approach. 
In the second subgroup is the individualised 
care, woman centred care, patient centred 
care, person centred care, human centred 
care, cultural care, family centred care, and 
spiritual care.  

The new concepts found related to archi-
tectural design and environmental features 
are healing architecture and environment, 
maternity waiting home, holistic health and 
safety within the maternity unit, friendliness, 
functionality and freedom in the unit, holistic 
design, salutogenic design, and humanised 
environment. Finally, the independent con-
cepts are the decision making and the spi-
rituality but related to the birth experience.

One of the findings, which is not part of 
the above-mentioned classification groups, 
but is equally relevant is the BUDSET tool, 
which is important because it “was develo-
ped to inform improvements in birthing en-
vironment design, and it has been validated 
by caseload midwives and women in their 
care” (Menke et al., 2019, p.372). This tool 
is useful because it provides a list of factors 
and features to apply within a maternity unit 
environment, to make them more optimally 
designed.

“The BUDSET is based on 18 design princi-
ples and is divided into four domains” (Fou-
reur et al., 2010, p. 43). The fear cascade 
includes reception space, birth rooms, sense 
of domesticity, privacy, and noise control. The 
facility integrates physical support, birth bath 
and ensuite facilities. The aesthetics domain 
has light, colour, texture, indoor environs, 
and femininity. And support encompasses 
food and drink for woman, and accommo-
dation for companions and birth attendants. 



60

Greenless, (2024)

Maxweel et al. (2024)

Feeley (2023)

Vermeiden et al.  (2018)

Menke et al.  (2019)

Drglin  (2019)

Carlsson et al. (2020)

Ngotie et al. (2024)

McMullen et al. (2024)

Finlayson et al. (2014)

Staniszewska et al. (2012)

Banerjee et al. (2018)

Hall et al.  (2012)

Murray-Davis et al.  (2023)

Hammond et al.   (2017)

Foureur et al. (2010)

Nielsen & Overgaard (2020)

Patel & Rajasingam (2013)

Umstead et al. (2023)

Crowther & Hall (2015)

Pangas et al. (2019)

Ebert et al. (2014)

Iswanti et al. (2024)

Balabanoff  (2023)

Setola et al.  (2019)

Nicoletta et al. (2022)

Nilsson et al. (2020)

Kennedy et al. (2018)

Connellan et al.  (2021)

Olza et al. (2018)

Greenless, (2024)

Maxweel et al. (2024)

Feeley (2023)

Vermeiden et al.  (2018)

Menke et al.  (2019)

Drglin  (2019)

Carlsson et al. (2020)

Ngotie et al. (2024)

McMullen et al. (2024)

Finlayson et al. (2014)

Staniszewska et al. (2012)

Banerjee et al. (2018)

Hall et al.  (2012)

Murray-Davis et al.  (2023)

Hammond et al.   (2017)

Foureur et al. (2010)

Nielsen & Overgaard (2020)

Patel & Rajasingam (2013)

Umstead et al. (2023)

Crowther & Hall (2015)

Pangas et al. (2019)

Ebert et al. (2014)

Iswanti et al. (2024)

Balabanoff  (2023)

Setola et al.  (2019)

Nicoletta et al. (2022)

Nilsson et al. (2020)

Kennedy et al. (2018)

Connellan et al.  (2021)

Olza et al. (2018)

Holistic Approach (Care)

Healing Environment

Salutogenic Approach

Cultural Care

Person Centred-Care

Human Centred-Care

Family Centred-Care

Spititual Care

Caring Approach

Humanised Approach

Individualised Care

Patient Centred-Care

Woman Centred-Care

Holistic Design

Healing Architecture

Salutogenic Design

Holistc Health

Humanised Environment

Holistcally Safe

Decision-Making

Spitituality realted to birth

Culturally Safe Care

Culturally Sensitive Care

Maternity Waiting Home

Approaches to care Concepts derived from 
the approaches 

Illus 19.



61

Greenless, (2024)

Maxweel et al. (2024)

Feeley (2023)

Vermeiden et al.  (2018)

Menke et al.  (2019)

Drglin  (2019)

Carlsson et al. (2020)

Ngotie et al. (2024)

McMullen et al. (2024)

Finlayson et al. (2014)

Staniszewska et al. (2012)

Banerjee et al. (2018)

Hall et al.  (2012)

Murray-Davis et al.  (2023)

Hammond et al.   (2017)

Foureur et al. (2010)

Nielsen & Overgaard (2020)

Patel & Rajasingam (2013)

Umstead et al. (2023)

Crowther & Hall (2015)

Pangas et al. (2019)

Ebert et al. (2014)

Iswanti et al. (2024)

Balabanoff  (2023)

Setola et al.  (2019)

Nicoletta et al. (2022)

Nilsson et al. (2020)

Kennedy et al. (2018)

Connellan et al.  (2021)

Olza et al. (2018)

Greenless, (2024)

Maxweel et al. (2024)

Feeley (2023)

Vermeiden et al.  (2018)

Menke et al.  (2019)

Drglin  (2019)

Carlsson et al. (2020)

Ngotie et al. (2024)

McMullen et al. (2024)

Finlayson et al. (2014)

Staniszewska et al. (2012)

Banerjee et al. (2018)

Hall et al.  (2012)

Murray-Davis et al.  (2023)

Hammond et al.   (2017)

Foureur et al. (2010)

Nielsen & Overgaard (2020)

Patel & Rajasingam (2013)

Umstead et al. (2023)

Crowther & Hall (2015)

Pangas et al. (2019)

Ebert et al. (2014)

Iswanti et al. (2024)

Balabanoff  (2023)

Setola et al.  (2019)

Nicoletta et al. (2022)

Nilsson et al. (2020)

Kennedy et al. (2018)

Connellan et al.  (2021)

Olza et al. (2018)

Holistic Approach (Care)

Healing Environment

Salutogenic Approach

Cultural Care

Person Centred-Care

Human Centred-Care

Family Centred-Care

Spititual Care

Caring Approach

Humanised Approach

Individualised Care

Patient Centred-Care

Woman Centred-Care

Holistic Design

Healing Architecture

Salutogenic Design

Holistc Health

Humanised Environment

Holistcally Safe

Decision-Making

Spitituality realted to birth

Culturally Safe Care

Culturally Sensitive Care

Maternity Waiting Home

Approaches to care Concepts derived from 
the approaches 

Illus 20.



62

Before going into detail on each approach, 
it is necessary to understand what a normal 
physiological birth is and what is meant by 
physiological birth alternative choices.

Normal physiological birth: WHO defines a 
normal birth as “spontaneous in onset, low 
risk at the start of labour and remaining so 
throughout labour and delivery” (Technical 
Working Group & World Health Organiza-
tion, 1997, p. 1 cited by Amis, 2019).
Feeley adds that a normal physiological bir-
th “progresses without incident nor requires 
medical intervention and ends in a sponta-
neous birth where the mother and baby are 
both well” (Feeley, 2019, preface, p.24).

Physiological birth alternatives: They are 
options that fall outside of local and/or
national maternity guidelines because mo-
thers prefer to receive other care that supports 
physiological birth, rather than suppor-
ting recommended medical interventions.

Holistic approach:
The holistic approach is mentioned by di-
fferent authors and refers to comprehensive 
care that involves the physical and psycho-
logical needs of mothers, their companions, 
and midwives. This care should be oriented 
to include the mother’s emotional needs 
(Greenlees, 2024) and promote women’s 
autonomy.

As Hall et al. (2012) mentioned, holistic care 
should support the physiological process of 
childbirth, and preferably be attended by mid-
wives, as they also bring a holistic overview, 
and can offer the mother the use of comple-
mentary therapies that enhance the labour 
experience and help the mother relieve pain.
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“The evidence suggests that the use of com-
plementary therapies reflects appreciation 
of a holistic approach, rather than dissatis-
faction with conventional care” (Hall et al., 
2012, p. 11).

In addition, it is important to understand 
that the design of the birthing environment 
impacts maternal morbidities and men-
tal health, which is why it is so important 
to create environments that cultivate me-
aningful relationships, and trust and mu-
tual respect between patients and medical 
staff to enhance women’s experience and 
ensure their safety within the environment 
(Maxwell et al., 2024 and Feeley, 2019).

At this point it is necessary, “a re-evaluation 
of current practices and environments in 
which childbirth takes place, advocating for 
a more holistic approach that encompasses 
emotional, psychological, and physical we-
ll-being” (Maxwell et al., 2024, p. 22). And 
at the same time, environments which offer 
women feelings of deep safety and rightness 
within the maternity Unit (Balabanoff, 2023).

This approach, worked by several authors, 
suggests the inclusion of space for the use 
of complementary therapies or alternative
medicine, accommodation for companions, 
and single birthing rooms to provide more 
privacy for the mother. And within the en-
vironmental features, space should be
welcoming, familiar and calm, allow for 
the creation of social relationships, provi-
de a sense of service and security, provide 
clean and inviting birthing rooms, apply soft 
lighting, and make use of soothing sounds.

Salutogenic Approach:
The salutogenic approach aims to generate a 
positive experience of childbirth, which should 
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occur naturally following the physiological 
phases of dilation, expulsion, and delivery. 
From this perspective, childbirth should pro-
vide the people involved with mental health 
and physical well-being (Olza et al., 2018).

As Drglin mentions in her book (2019):
Salutogenetic birth environments enable the 
dynamic integration of people according to 
the needs of the woman giving birth: they 
enable a woman to connect with herself, her 
feelings and experiences, the baby, her part-
ner, other relatives, and the medical staff. 
“A salutogenetic birth space ensures privacy 
with different options to establish a perso-
nal and intimate area, it allows women to 
temporarily adopt it, control who enters, and 
what is going on with the space in general” 
(Drglin, 2019, p. 102).

In summary, a salutogenic design should 
prioritise the holistic health of the mother, 
baby, and family, which is why it also re-
commends the implementation of individual 
birthing rooms. In addition, the design of 
the maternity unit should provide a relaxing 
and domestic atmosphere, offer freedom of
movement during labour, provide a room 
that adapts according to the changing needs 
of the woman in labour, and ensure the 
connection of natural elements through
sensory channels  (Drglin, 2019 and  Olza 
et al., 2018).

Spiritual care:
Spirituality is a very important factor in the 
essence of being human and therefore 
should be included within the concept of 
health, even more so in the birth environ-
ment, however, it is an aspect that is little 
considered but has re-emerged and become 
an area of interest for researchers (Crowther 
& Hall, 2015).

Childbirth is a significant time for women, 
caregivers, families, and society at large, 
and for this reason spirituality should be con-
sidered during childbirth, as an individual’s 
spirituality can enrich the birth experience, 
provide inner strength, acknowledge the 
sacredness of new life, and foster a deeper 
human connection (Crowther & Hall, 2015). 
That is, recognising the birthing process as 
a spiritual experience can enhance the care 
provided to the mother, and the service offe-
red by medical personnel.

If the birth process were understood from a 
deeper sense of the human being, its spatial 
conception might be different as well the ex-
perience for all involved. “Birth is a funda-
mentally spiritual experience that connects 
humans to all species’ regenerative capacity, 
regardless of time, culture, or geography” 
(Balabanoff, 2023, p. 415). 

“A mindful birth environment curates and 
balances the complexities of its environment 
to allow a focus on being in the moment, 
deeply aware of the power and beauty of 
birth” (Balabanoff, 2023, p. 427).

According to Crowther et al. (2015) it could 
be inferred that, the maternity unit could in-
corporate spaces for meaningful rituals or 
practices, which align with mothers’ spiri-
tual beliefs, as engaging in rituals that are 
meaningful to the woman can enhance the 
spiritual experience, provide comfort, and 
support during labour. Sacred spaces that 
allow for reflection, prayer, or meditation 
may also be included. Creating quiet and 
peaceful spaces in the maternity unit for 
patients and families to engage in spiritual 
practices and find solace (Crowther et al., 
2015).



65

Culturally Sensitive Care:
Considering the cultural needs that women 
may have during pregnancy and childbirth 
can improve the quality of care and services 
offered to mothers. However, not all health 
professionals today are sensitive to cultural 
differences, which can lead to discriminatory 
treatment or mistreatment of women (Iswanti 
et al., 2024).

Addressing these issues is critical to improving 
the quality of care offered to mothers and their 
caregivers, which is why the WHO recom-
mends that maternity care services should 
be culturally sensitive to improve the health 
of both mothers and newborns. “Providing 
culturally sensitive services, which consider 
the individual preferences and cultural back-
grounds of people and their communities, is 
a significant aspect of delivering high-quality 
healthcare” (Iswanti et al., 2024, p. 1259).

Mothers’ perceptions of the quality of care 
can vary according to cultural beliefs and 
values, and in turn influence the experience 
they may have within the unit.  For this rea-
son, it is important to address cultural diver-
sity in maternity care, to lead to better care 
outcomes and patient-centred approaches. 
Embracing inclusive practices that align with 
the cultural norms of diverse communities 
can improve the overall maternity care ex-
perience.

This can be addressed within the maternity 
unit by engaging communities to support the 
planning of maternity care services, to gene-
rate inclusion and cultural sensitivity.

On the other hand, Ngotie et al. (2024) 
suggests that women’s experiences within 
healthcare infrastructures are influenced 
by cultural practices, therefore, there is a

need to adopt beneficial cultural practices 
in maternity care interventions to create a 
balance and ensure culturally sensitive care. 

Other authors are also cited to highlight that 
health systems and the community must work 
together to harmonise the impacts of cultu-
ral practices within the health care provided. 
Some of the cultural practices related to ma-
ternity care and childbirth include the use of 
herbal medicines, modifications in diet befo-
re and after childbirth, modifications in dress 
during pregnancy and the performance of 
traditional ceremonies or rituals (Ngotie et 
al., 2024).

As an additional point, McMullen et al. 
(2024) suggest that the implementation of 
traditional practices during childbirth and 
pregnancy has the potential to connect the 
woman, the baby, and her companions to 
their culture. 

Some of the characteristics of this approach 
include space for companions as they are an 
essential support for women in the birthing 
process, and space for the performance of
traditional rituals or ceremonies. These spaces 
can be internal or external, as, for example, 
in some cultures the burning of the placenta 
is an important cultural act and would require 
an external space dedicated to this practice. 

Humanised approach or Human cen-
tred care: 
The humanised or human centred approach 
emphasise the understanding of all the
persons involved in the health facility, which 
means the patients, their company, and the 
health personnel.  In this approach, the
design of maternity units must consider
distinct aspects to improve the experience of 
all involved and at the same time make them
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participants of the design process, ensuring 
reciprocal participation between the users 
and the design of the maternity unit can 
help improve the quality of care (Umstead 
et al., 2023 and Hammond et al., 2017).

The users’ experiences within the birth en-
vironment are shaped by interconnected 
factors such as design, culture, and model 
of care (Hodnett et al., 2012 cited by Ham-
mond et al., 2017, p. 137). In addition, to 
considering cultural or model of care fac-
tors, it is essential to consider the views of all 
users, i.e. mothers, their companions, and 
medical staff, to value their experiences, and 
to identify their needs.

Within Maternity units “human centred de-
sign can incorporate user driven insights to 
question the status quo, bring light to sys-
tems that sustain health inequities, and offer 
novel opportunities to improve health and 
wellbeing across generations” (Umstead et 
al., 2023, p. 9).

Another important point of the human-
centred approach is that it must
provide all users with a favourable expe-
rience, including compassion, concordance
in communication and procedures, and 
non-discriminatory treatment, to create an 
environment of mutual trust, where mothers 
and their companions have confidence in 
the medical staff, and vice versa, the medical
staff also have confidence in the patients.

In general terms, the approach is designed 
to meet the needs of users, and to gene-
rate a friendly environment in the unit that 
provides comfort and confidentiality, as well as 
being a functional and efficient environment, 
where workers have the facility to interact
with patients and adequately carry out all

required procedures. Along the same lines, 
the article by Hammond et al. (2017) makes 
some recommendations on the design of 
maternity units, which should allow freedom 
of movement for users, especially mothers in 
labour, and in the case of the birthing envi-
ronment, the position of the bed in the birth 
room should be changed, so that it is not in 
the centre of the room, and the room should 
be spacious and free of distractions, allowing 
an atmosphere of calm and relaxation.

Patient centred care, person centred 
care and individualised care: 
For the purpose of the paper, patient-centred 
care, person-centred care and individualise
care are explained together as they are
related and basically have the same focus. 

A patient-centred approach must include 
various aspects of a person’s individuality, 
which vary depending on culture, beliefs, 
and traditions. For this reason, materni-
ty units may adapt to this individuality and 
implement different programmes, such as a 
culturally sensitive diet for different popula-
tions, freedom of movement during labour, 
and freedom of choice in birthing position 
(Patel & Rajasingam, 2013).

The design process of maternity units, in 
addition to being based on an analysis of 
the context and the users, must also relate
to the local socio-economic conditions 
and the culture of the users (Nielsen &  
Overgaard, 2020). This means developing 
a patient-centred design while remaining 
clinically feasible and accommodating infor-
mational, emotional, and logistical require-
ments (Umstead et al., 2023).

Patient-centred care relates to women’s 
experience within the unit, i.e. it aims to
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respect their needs, values, and autonomy, 
as well as providing them with appropria-
te care and communication (Nielsen & 
Overgaard, 2020). Emphasising person-
centred care is about recognising women’s 
beliefs, values, and spiritual preferences to 
tailor the care offered in the unit to meet 
their spiritual needs, while fostering a sense 
of support and understanding during labour 
(Crowther & Hall, 2015).

As a consequent effect, developing a 
patient-centred model allows impro-
ving the quality of service and care
offered; the medical staff plays a signifi-
cant role in this regard because they must 
be able to recognize patients’ needs and 
allow them to actively participate in their 
care plans (Patel & Rajasingam, 2013).

Woman centred approach:
This approach places the woman at the 
centre of the design, as the maternity unit 
must respond to her needs, desires, cultu-
ral perceptions, and philosophy of birth to 
provide a positive experience and improve 
the quality of care. In this sense, women’s 
experience is influenced by different com-
plex factors, such as cultural expectations, 
norms, and previous experiences, aspects 
that must be integrated into the design of 
maternity units (Carlsson et al., 2020).

Woman centred care allows women to have 
more decision-making power over their 
pregnancy and childbirth and strengthens 
their capacity for autonomy, as quoted in the 
article of Nicoletta et al., (2022). “As a con-
sequence of a woman centred philosophy, 
women have the right to choose from many 
care options and birth settings which have 
been shown to positively impact on women’s 
experience of childbirth” (Migliorini et al., 

2019 cited by Nielsen & Overgaard, 2012, 
p. 205).

Feeley (2023) is another author who supports 
the woman-centred care as an approach 
that responds to women’s needs and thus 
facilitates and supports alternative choices to
physiological birth, choices that are influen-
ced by culture, politics, and ethical values. 
Additionally, “woman centred care implies a
collaborative approach to encounters invol-
ving cultural practices” (Ngotie et al., 2024, 
p. 4).

One of the models that is most in favour 
of this approach is the Midwifery-led Unit, 
as the care midwives provide is focused 
on individual care and they are the most 
skilled personnel to enable physiological 
birth. “Institutional restrictions on midwifery 
practice can limit women’s access to indi-
vidualised woman centred care and skilled 
physiological birth care” (Feeley, 2023, p. 35).

This approach must be supported by 
midwives, and an environment must be 
created within the unit that allows for a con-
tinuous relationship between the woman 
and the midwife. It should also create a 
holistically safe space, i.e. an atmosphere 
constructed jointly between the midwife and 
the woman, where the woman can feel safe 
(Carlsson et al., 2020).

At this point, it is possible to introduce the 
term decision-making, an important aspect 
in relation to pregnancy and childbirth, as 
it allows the woman to make autonomous 
decisions about how to carry her pregnan-
cy, how to have her birth, and also provide 
control over her body, , this decision making 
should be guided by the autonomy of the 
woman without considering the beliefs of the 
staff attending her.
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Feeley (2023) defines this term as “the ability 
or opportunity for women to make choices 
during pregnancy and childbirth is embed-
ded within governmental policies, cultural 
norms and women’s expectations” (p. 34).

Family centred care:
Family-centred care is oriented towards 
treating the family with dignity and respect 
within the environment of the maternity unit or
neonatal care area, allowing their parti-
cipation in the policies and programmed 
development around the provision of care. 
Medical personnel have a great responsi-
bility to implement this approach, as they 
must construct a relationship of trust with 
the mother and her companions, as well 
as assertive communication that allows 
the mother and her family to maintain 
control and independence in pregnan-
cy and childbirth (Banerjee et al., 2018).

Usually, this approach is applied in more 
neonatal care units, “the term family cen-
tred care (FCC) has been used to describe a 
model of health care which recognizes the 
significant role played by family members in 
the well-being of a hospitalised child or in-
fant” (Finlayson et al., 2014, p. 119).

In the case of premature babies or newborns 
who must remain in the neonatal care area, 
this approach is more oriented towards 
providing parents with sufficient tools so that 
they can also care for their children, in that 
sense a relationship of mutual support must be
generated between medical staff and 
parents. The family-centred model seeks to 
involve parents in a way that creates physical, 
emotional, and social well-being between the
infant and the parent (Finlayson et al., 2014).

Within the literature review the POPPY

(Parents of Premature Babies Project) model
was found, which supports the family-
centred approach. This model highlights the 
importance of a parent’s perspective and 
aims to place parents and family at the cen-
tre of health care, promoting individualised 
and flexible care (Staniszewska et al., 2012).

Four of the twelve principles proposed by the 
model are important to highlight. First, be 
aware of the needs of parents, the emotional 
impact of preterm birth, and the individual 
differences in parents’ responses and needs. 
Second, to provide practical help to parents 
in caring for babies. Third, to foster paren-
ting skills in caring for and interacting with 
the baby. And fourth, to provide adequate 
facilities for families. 

To this paper, these principles can be translated 
into spaces within the maternity unit that su-
pport mothers, their families, and companions. 
That is, the unit may include a transitional 
care facility for parents, care areas for chil-
dren, a room where parents can sit and be 
comfortable, space to provide parents with 
food and beverage services, and family 
rooms for parents to stay overnight. 

Maternity Waiting home:
MWH is not an approach, but a new concept 
applied in contexts with many constraints in 
access to health. Maternity waiting homes 
are residential structures near a health cen-
tre or hospital that house high-risk pregnant 
women and those living far from a facility in 
the final weeks of pregnancy (Vermeiden et 
al., 2018, p. 1332).

In Ethiopia, from 2014, these facilities
began to be incorporated to reduce maternal 
deaths and in comparison, with the figures 
for 2016 to 2020, it can be evidenced that 
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there was an impact. By 2016, the maternal 
mortality ratio (MMR) was 412 per 100,000 
live births, and by 2020, it had decreased to 
200 per 100,000 live births (Vermeiden et 
al., 2018, p.1332).

This type of facility arose as a solution to 
a problem of accessibility to health care, 
within contexts with many limitations. 
These facilities allow the mother to have 
a place to stay weeks before her due 
date or to stay more days in the case of
premature births or babies in neonatal care. 

04.2 Construction of Matrix 

The construction of the matrix is based on 
a literature review, as the analysis of the 
selected articles allowed not only to identify 
new approaches and concepts, but also to 
highlight the need to include certain spaces 
within maternity units and to define specific 
features of the environment that can enhan-
ce the experience and care in these settings.

From the information gathered, the purpo-
se of the matrix was to establish meaningful 
relationships and connections between the 
various elements identified. On the one 
hand, it sought to create interconnections 
between the different approaches; on the other 
hand, it aimed to support each approach by 
incorporating specific spaces and relevant 
environmental features that respond to the 

physical and emotional needs of mothers, 
newborns, their companions, and the health 
personnel. In this way, the matrix acts as an 
integrative tool, allowing the spatial features 
and the concepts of care to be related in a 
structured and coherent way.

Once the matrix was constructed, the results 
could be translated into a series of functio-
nal and practical characteristics that can 
be applied in the design and adaptation of 
maternity units. These characteristics streng-
then the conceptual basis for the design of 
humanised spaces that promote wellbeing 
and integrated care within maternity services.

These facilities should provide accommo-
dation for both mothers and their families, 
common spaces such as kitchen, sanitary 
facilities such as toilets and laundry areas 
(Vermeiden et al., 2018). As an additional 
point, they could serve to promote educatio-
nal programmes or generate some kind of 
knowledge that impacts the economy of the 
mothers or the community in general.
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Illus 24: Relation between approaches and environmental features part.2, 
own elaboration
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Illus 24: Relation between approaches and environmental features part.2, 
own elaboration
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04.3 Indicators development 

The indicators are developed under the 
premise of having an instrument to evaluate 
the performance and conditions of maternity 
units, with the purpose of making them more 
efficient and encouraging their continuous 
improvement. The use of these indicators 
can help units to improve both the care 
they provide and the overall experience of 
mothers, their companions, and staff, parti-
cularly midwives.

The aim of these indicators is to assess 
what spaces can be included within the 
organisation of a maternity unit already 
established by international organisations, 
considering other approaches to care that 
integrate contextual and socio-cultural 
factors. And recognising the diversity of 
users’ own needs. In this way, different 
findings can be obtained in relation to the 
spatial features that can improve the expe-
rience of all users within the unit, promoting 
a more humanised environment adapted to 
the cultural and social realities of the context.

These indicators make it possible to integrate 
the different variables that may be present in 
the design of maternity units, variables that 
depend on contextual and socio-cultural 
factors, as well as on the beliefs, customs, 
and traditions of the users. Consideration of 
these aspects ensures that the units not only

meet  the technical demands and requirements, 
but also adapt to the needs and experience 
of the people who use these health facilities.

For better understanding and future 
application, the indicators were subdivided 
into subgroups according to main aspects for 
adaptation and application within the mater-
nity units. The main groups are non-conven-
tional spaces, unit environment, unit layout, 
birth room environment, birth room layout, 
physical elements, supporting elements, 
lighting, sounds, colours, smells, and mate-
rials and textures.

As an additional point, it is worth mentioning 
that the proposed indicators also support 
and integrate the latest recommendations 
of the WHO (2018), which recommend the 
use of different relaxation techniques, such 
as massages, yoga positions, and the use of 
audio-visual aids during labour.

In conclusion, the development of these 
indicators seeks to meet the objective of 
integrating new spaces and approaches 
in the organisation of maternity units, as 
well as other spatial characteristics within a 
medical environment, making the maternity 
unit a more welcoming and familiar environ-
ment for mothers and their companions.
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NON-CONVENTIONAL SPACES
  
  Room for the use of alternative medicine

Overnight rooms for companions and family

Room for traditional practices, rituals, and ceremonies

Single occupancy birth rooms

Sacred room / spiritual space

Service Ward (It hosts services for mother and companions)

Common room for mothers

Social room  

Family room

Filter space (in birthing room)

Accommodation for birth attendants

Transitional care facility

Sitting room for parents

Care areas for infants 

Play area for other children in the family

UNIT ENVIRONMENT
  
  Welcoming environment

Familiar and calm environment

Respect and empower environment

Experiencing safety in the space

Homely environment

Friendly environment

Relax and domestic environment

Warm and softness environment

Nonclinical environment

Enveloping space

Illus 25. 

Illus 26. 
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BIRTH ROOM ENVIRONMENT
  
  Clean and inviting room

Central woman’s environment

Sacred and supportive atmosphere 

Individualised space

Sense of belonging within the space

Decorated space

Self-control of room 

Cave-like space

UNIT LAYOUT
  
  Support privacy within the space 

Availability of facilities

Optimum location of midwives’ hub or staff base

Allow continuity of the space

Avoid long corridors

Illus 27. 

Illus 28. 
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BIRTH ROOM LAYOUT
  
  Allow for adaptability of space

Facilitate freedom of movement

Use of mobile furniture

Ensure a private toilet, bath, and shower

Spacious rooms

Flexible room

Change bed position, not in the centre

PHYSICAL ELEMENTS
  
  Use of calming items in the room

Provide comfortable pillows and seating within the birthing ward

Use of elements that provide physical support in the room

SUPPORTING ELEMENTS
  
  Enable connection to natural elements

Use of sensory channels

Use of distracting elements

Use of visual elements

Use of communicative elements

Illus 29. 

Illus 30. 

Illus 31. 
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LIGHTING  
  

Soft lighting in the environment

Allow control of light intensity in the birth room

Use of natural light

COLOURS   
  

Use of warm colours

MATERIALS AND TEXTURES
  
  Use of different textures and natural materials

Avoid using glare-producing surfaces

Use of rugs on the floors

Illus 32. 

Illus 33. 

Illus 34. 
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SOUNDS  
  

Use of soothing sounds

Use of soundproofing in the birth unit

Use of sounds from nature

SMELLS 
  

Use of aromas

Illus 35. 

Illus 36. 
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05.1 Presentation of the Tool

The main purpose of this tool is to provide an 
assessment that allows a better approach to 
the design of maternity units, respecting and 
taking care of social and cultural factors, 
customs, and beliefs in contexts with limited 
resources, where currently there is a gap in 
the implementation of different approaches 
in the maternity unit, as it is mostly consi-
dered the indications and guidelines of the 
western health system. 

This tool allows to identify which unconven-
tional spaces can be integrated within the 
unit and some recommendations for their 
organisation and environmental characteris-
tics, so that the environment of the healthcare 
facility becomes much more familiar and 
welcoming for women, her companions, and 
staff, taking their needs into consideration.

From this perspective, this instrument can 
help in the design of maternity units in 
contexts of scarce and low resources, whe-
re local conditions, habits, beliefs, and 
traditions are unknown, allowing to be 
aware of the situation and therefore to have 
a better approach to the design of the unit or 
application of the international guidelines.

Specific Objectives: 
1. Identify and understand the main 
cultural perceptions in relation to maternity, 

childbirth, antenatal care, and postnatal 
care.
2. Identify the cultural barriers that limit 
appropriate maternal and newborn care.
3. Recognise health accessibility issues and 
contextual constraints.
4. Assess what unconventional spaces can 
be integrated within the maternity unit to 
ensure a relationship between users’ 
beliefs and culture.
5. Identify the features and elements that 
should be integrated into the unit’s spaces 
to support the mother’s diverse choices in 
care and preferences during childbirth, and 
at the same time support the staff practices. 

This tool is presented as a checklist to be 
evaluated according to the information 
acquired about the context and the popu-
lation to be worked with. The checklist is 
divided into subgroups with indicators that 
are assessed as high, medium, and low 
importance. The subgroups are listed below:

•	 Non-conventional spaces
•	 Characteristics of the spatial layout
•	 Environment features, this group includes 

physical elements, supporting elements, 
materials and textures, lighting, sounds, 
colours, and smells.

The checklist represented in tables can be 
found in the appendices section.
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05.2 Methodology of
application

It is important to highlight that this tool, 
because of the methodology it follows. 
It is designed to be used by international 
organisations or local governments. On the 
one hand, international organisations can 
follow this study to adapt already establi-
shed requirements to contexts with different 
difficulties, ensuring that the maternity unit 
is not only efficient in terms of its operation, 
but also responds to the needs of its users. 

On the other hand, local governments 
can also use this tool for the same purpo-
se, to adapt international directives to the 
particularities of their specific contexts. By 
considering local needs, culture, and 
traditions, governments are promoting a 
deeper ownership of health care provided 
to the community. Also, by incorporating 
local perspectives and priorities, local 
governments are responding effectively to 
the specific challenges of the context. This 
aspect is supremely important considering 
that precarious contexts have different limi-
tations in access to maternal and neonatal 
care. 

To use this tool, the methodology to be 
followed in assessing the context in which the 
work will be conducted is outlined below, with 
the aim of obtaining insights that will contri-
bute to the planning of the maternity unit. 

Step 1: 
Characterise the population or context with 
which the work will be conducted. Recogni-
se where it is located, what its population 
is, and its main characteristics. If possible, it 
would be ideal to conduct fieldwork to make 
a physical reconnaissance. 

Step 2:
Conduct a literature review of articles, books, 
and reports on the population or context with 
which the work will be conducted. These will 
later serve to acquire knowledge, generate 
proximity to the context, and finally serve as 
support for the evaluation.  
Where possible, the collection of information 
can also be acquired through field work.

Step 3:
Analyse the literature and, in this case, 
the information collected in fieldwork, to 
recognise the main problems that urgently 
need to be addressed in the context and the 
population. Whether due to maternal mor-
tality rates, limitations in accessing quality 
health services, or difficulties in providing 
adequate sexual and reproductive health.

Step 4:
Analyse the literature and, in this case, the 
information collected during fieldwork, to 
identify cultural perceptions and differences.
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It is necessary to identify, for the specific 
context, what is their perception of maternity 
and childbirth, recognising what is the prefe-
rred position of women to give birth, if they 
carry out any type of traditional postpartum 
ceremony, what position the family and the 
companions have, and in general what are 
their beliefs about pregnancy and childbirth.  

At this stage, where social and cultural 
aspects are addressed, it is also important 
to recognise the cultural barriers to access 
to health care. What is the vision or rela-
tionship that the context has in relation with 
health, and what is the role of women and 
men in society and during pregnancy. 

Step 5:
Conduct an assessment following the pro-
posed indicators and assigning importance 
to each one. To carry out this assessment, it 
is necessary to consider all the information 
collected so that the evaluation is based 
either on the literature review or on evidence.

Step 6:
Analyse and interpret the results, highligh-
ting key aspects to be applied within the 
design and organisation of the maternity unit.

Step 7:
Generate a final report documenting the 
development, testing, validation, and results 
of the assessment tool. This report will be the 
support for the adaptation of international 
guidelines and/or local policies to the deve-
lopment and design of maternity units. The 
final report will allow justifying each of the 
interventions or design decisions.

Step 8:
Conduct an evaluation of the tool to enable 
its evolution and increase its effectiveness, 
recognising which aspects of the instrument 
could be improved for future evaluations. 
At this stage, it is also possible to suggest 
adjustments, applications, or limitations of 
the tool for international organisations or 
local governments.

05.3 Assessment application

To exemplify the application of this tool, 
two case studies are taken from complete-
ly different contexts, where the assessment 
is conducted following the methodology 
mentioned above. These two contexts are 
Colombia and Senegal, which, despite their 
socio-cultural and geographical differences,

in rural areas the cultural characteristics vary, 
there are limitations in access to health, and 
there is little economic investment in health 
infrastructures such as maternity units.

These two contexts present limitations for 
study as they are unfamiliar contexts, I have 
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never physically been to either place, so 
the assessment can only be based on the 
literature review. For Colombia, the Nasa 
population is chosen; the literature avai-
lable for this population is limited; howe-
ver, more general supporting literature on 
indigenous perspectives on health can be 
used. In the case of Senegal, when working 
with populations in rural areas, the literature 
is also limited, as most of the studies and ar-
ticles found are developed in the main cities. 
Nevertheless, despite the limitations and 
scarcity of resources to support the assess-
ment of the two contexts, they are important 
and interesting examples to be studied. 

In the case of Colombia, where I come from, 
I know first-hand that there are also  many
problems and limitations in access to 
maternal health, as most of the development 
and investment in public health is done in 
the main cities and their surroundings, which 
makes rural areas far from receiving quality 
maternal health. Due to challenging geogra-
phical conditions and the state of country’s 
road infrastructure, many women in remo-
te rural areas are unable to access quality 
prenatal and postnatal care, in addition to 
the fact that these women may belong to 
an indigenous, Afro-Colombian, or ethnic 
community, and in most cases are of limited 
resources.

For this type of remote context, the 
constraints in accessing health care increase, 
as the geographical conditions complicate 
the maintenance of health infrastructures, 
the supply of essential medical resources, 
and the provision of qualified medical staff.
For these reasons, it was found necessary to 
address a population that is not very well 
considered, because, although I am not 
physically familiar with the culture and su-
rroundings, I could have easy access and 

make a positive contribution to a current 
problem in my country.

In contrast, as part of my training experience 
during my internship I had the opportunity 
to participate in an architectural competition
for the design of a maternity unit in 
Senegal. This experience first of all, brought 
me closer to the design of maternity units in this 
context, but also allowed me to realise that 
there are many limitations to accessing ade-
quate maternity care in rural areas, that most 
studies on maternal health are carried out in 
major cities, that little consideration is given 
to socio-cultural factors in the development 
of health infrastructures, and that in most 
places where maternal care and attention 
is most urgent, economic precariousness is 
very high.

Moreover, being Colombian a background 
completely different, but as a designer I must 
be able to approach completely different 
contexts and unknown to me, where social, 
cultural, and customary factors vary, in that 
sense my responsibility as a designer is to 
find a tool or methodology that allows me to 
design for an unknown context. On the other 
hand, from a more scientific aspect, Senegal 
belongs to the Sub-Saharan Africa region, 
the region of the world that represents more 
maternal deaths, which is why most of the 
international organisations and foundations 
are focused on developing health centres 
or maternity units that improve care and
expand health coverage.

In general terms, they are considered 
important contexts to analyse because,
despite deficiencies in the health system, 
sanitary infrastructures, and access to 
maternal care, the issue of maternal health is 
considered from a global and centralised 
country perspective, without considering the
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the perceptions that are generated throu-
ghout the territory.

The study was intended to show that the 
approach to maternity unit design in these 
contexts is different and at the same time, 
to prove that the tool can be applied to new 
different contexts and through the assess-
ment can be highlighted important elements 
to the unit’s design, demonstrating that the 
results vary according to the local conditions 
and the variables applied.

Characterisation of the population:
The Nasa Indigenous people are in specific 
regions of Colombia, with most of their 
population located in Cauca, Valle del 
Cauca, Huila, and Nariño. According to 
the report on the Indigenous population of 
Colombia published in 2019, their popula-
tion is 243,176 and they are one of the four 
most numerous Indigenous people in the 
country (DANE, 2019).

Literature Analysis: Problems
In most cases, Indigenous populations do 
not seek health services for obstetric emer-
gencies for several reasons. Firstly, cultural 
and social factors, because the context in 
which the woman finds herself means that 
she is not always able to recognise signs 
of seriousness during pregnancy, and even 
if these symptoms do occur, they may be 
considered a cultural factor, rather than an 
alarm, preventing the mother from accessing 
health services. Another point is related to 
economic factors, since travelling to a health 
centre represents an economic cost, as does 
hospitalisation, which becomes a constraint, 

CASE OF COLOMBIA:

especially for Indigenous populations living 
in remote rural areas and in precarious 
contexts (Florez, Muñoz & Ramírez, 2010).

The adaptability of health systems is also 
another critical point, because intercultural 
adaptations in health centres are not com-
mon, but if they were applied, they would 
allow for better service and user experience. 
Furthermore, for health facilities in remote 
contexts, the economic investment is low, 
generating limitations for the facility to be 
able to function adequately due to the lack 
of adequate supplies and infrastructure, and 
medical equipment.

Finally, in Latin America, the health system, 
its organisation, and financing, tends to be 
centralised, which means that healthcen-
tres around the country have little capacity 
to function autonomously, i.e. they depend 
on the capacity of the government and its 
institutions to establish policies, prioritisation 
mechanisms, regulation, and allocation of 
resources. For this same reason, it can be 
considered that “maternal mortality in Latin 
America and the Caribbean is a particularly 
serious public health problem in the case of 
Indigenous women” (Florez et al., 2010, p. 1).

A situation that is generated in the health 
system that becomes a barrier to access to 
adequate maternal health services is that 
there is little tolerance, respect, and unders-
tanding on the part of the staff towards the 
culture of the indigenous user, generating 
indigenous women may feel mistreated, 
or suffer abuse in care (Bornacelly, n.d.). 
This situation leads to adverse experiences 
for mothers and increases the gap in the 
participation of Indigenous women in the 
health system, consequently increasing the 
risk for the mother and baby.
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Illus 37: Location and population of Nasa indigenous in Colombia,
own elaboration

COLOMBIA - NASA INDIGENOUS 
Region of Cauca, Valle of Cauca, Huila and Nariño 

Reference:
Dane Census 2018
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In most of these contexts and populations 
there are also different problems in re-
lation to sexual reproductive health and 
family planning, which according to their 
perceptions is not an important aspect. The 
issue of family planning causes a division of
opinions among the Indigenous population, 
i.e. between those who consider it a right and 
those who qualify it as “another invention of 
the Western world to break with the schemes 
of the indigenous world” (CEIMM, 1995 
Cited by Castillo-Santana et al., 2017).

From the perspective of maternal dea-
ths, by 2020 the maternal mortality rate of 
ndigenous women in Colombia was 268,6 
per 100,00 live births, representing 13,3% 
of the total MMR of the country. The total 
number of maternal deaths (TMM) of In-
digenous women for provinces where the 
Nasa population is located are Cauca: 
178,4, Nariño: 64,9, and Valle del Cauca 
with 1087,0 deaths. These figures show that 
Valle del Cauca is the third place in the 
country with the most maternal deaths 
(DANE, 2021).

Literature Analysis:
Cultural perceptions

Motherhood and maternity: 
For the Nasa population, motherhood is a 
responsibility of the mother, it is considered 
as another stage in the natural life cycle of 
women, which means that it should not be 
associated with any kind of risk (Castillo-
Santana et al., 2017, p.5). Practically, the 
responsibility of prolonging the community 
in biological and cultural terms is exercised 
on the woman’s body, fulfilling the feminine 
role that is imposed on her (Bornacelly, n.d.).

On the other hand, maternity is a process 
that involves the family; it is impossible to

think of a woman’s pregnancy without the 
support of her family, which becomes a central 
axis of support (Castillo-Santana et al., 2017).

Childbirth:
Childbirth is conceived as a participatory 
moment, where the family and the communi-
ty can be involved, who can provide support 
to the mothers, usually they are assisted by 
midwives and if possible, also by a traditio-
nal doctor. Culturally women have a vertical 
birth, “the woman is perpendicular to the 
ground, kneeling, or squatting and attached 
to a rope or chumbe” (Castillo-Santana et 
al., 2017, p.66). Being assisted by midwives 
and having their births at home allows 
them to preserve family traditions, to feel 
supported by their community, and to allow 
the newborn to receive “the energy of the three 
worlds: the spiritual, the land, and the world 
below” (Castillo-Santana et al., 2017, p.66).

Illus 38: Cosmovision of the Misak people, 
(Tunubala & Trochez, 2008).
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In this sense, the moment of birth can be 
summarised as a cultural experience within the 
life cycle of women, involving the family, the 
community, and traditional birth attendants.

Placenta’s importance:
For many Indigenous cultures, the placenta
has a symbolic importance, as special 
powers and potential negative consequen-
ces are attributed to it, if it is not handled 
properly. Such cultures have a deep respect 
for the placenta, considering it an element 
loaded with symbolism and capable of 
influencing the wellbeing of the newborn 
and the mother, which is why in most cases 
a ceremonial treatment of the placenta is
conducted (Florez et al., 2010).

Cultural barriers:
As pregnancy is considered a natural and 
normal stage of a woman’s life, pregnant 
women do not take certain precautions
regarding their activities, physical exertion, 
and antenatal care. This means that certain 
signs of seriousness and obstetric complica-
tions are not recognised in time, and health 
services are not used (Florez et al., 2010). 
This can lead to complicated pregnancies, 
spontaneous abortions, illnesses during 
pregnancy such as hypertension, and even 
the death of the mother or baby. 

Another important barrier is that due to cultu-
ral differences and the treatment that women 
may have in qualified health centres, access 
may be limited, which is why in Colombia 
in some health centres some changes were 
made in relation to food, the participation 
of midwives in labour and, the delivery of 
the placenta, this allowed more women to 
frequent health centres and improve their 
experience (Castillo-Santana et al., 2017).

Role of women and men in society:
Women have the responsibility to preserve 
the community and culture through concep-
tion, which is part of their role as women, 
where they must not only bear the burden of 
pregnancy, but also care for and raise their 
children throughout their lives.

In this sense, women have the responsibility
of social and biological reproduction.
Social because as caretakers of culture, they 
are expected to monitor and enforce cultural
practices. And biological responsibility, 
because women are the only ones capable 
of giving existence to everything that exists 
(Florez et al., 2010). This last point generates 
problems if seen from an external perspecti-
ve, because according to social conceptions 
the only way to see a woman’s body is within 
motherhood, detracting from the value of 
everything that being a woman represents.

On the other hand, the man’s role is to provi-
de for and preserve the family. “Men conceive 
of fatherhood as a great responsibility that is 
associated with the idea of reproducing and 
leaving offspring” (Bornacelly, n.d., p. 20).

Health:
The perception of health for Indigenous 
people is quite different from how health
is known in the West system, “health is
understood as a space of harmonious and 
systemic relationships between the individual
and the various levels of daily life that is 
expressed in wellbeing and quality of life” 
(Castillo-Santana et al., 2017, p. 64).

Within their worldview of health, two 
important aspects must be considered, 
balance, duality, and complementarity. 
Balance is maintained when humans have res-
pect for nature and other superior beings, while 
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Illus 39: Relationship between the cultural factor and 
the use of health services. (Florez et al., 2010).

duality and complementarity derive from 
the gender roles that must be acquired in
accordance with society. 

Balance is achieved when living in har-
mony within the Indigenous community and 
respecting nature. When nature is disrespec-
ted or harmony is disrupted, catastrophes 
and illnesses can occur as punishment, thus 
endangering the health of the community. 
In contrast, Indigenous women understand 
the duality between man and woman as a
complementarity between the two. Women 
are connected to the earth and therefore
to fertility, for this reason they have the 
esponsbility to preserve reproduction in the
community (Florez et al. 2010).

In contrast is the Western health system, 
which, according to Indigenous people, 
considers pregnancy as a risky stage for the 
woman, where she must take precautions for 
herself and the baby, and avoid putting the 
lives of both at risk (Castillo-Santana et al., 
2017). Furthermore, most Western health
systems have limitations for the cultural
expression of different populations, in a con-
ventional health centre a Nasa woman is not 

allowed to give birth in an upright position, 
because it could be considered risky. In
addition, mistreatment by medical personnel 
can occur due to these same cultural diffe-
rences, “doctors and health personnel point 
to the stubbornness of Indigenous mothers, 
along with expressions such as ‘they are clo-
sed’, ‘they don’t understand’ or ‘they hide’” 
(Castillo-Santana et al., 2017, p. 67).

As mentioned by Castillo-Santana et al. 
(2017), it is necessary to recognise the
traditional medical system in its diversity, so 
as not to fall into the imposition of a health 
care model that is far from the expectations 
and needs of the population, a model that, 
despite being legitimate for the State, is still
foreign to some indigenous mothers, who 
trust and give validity to traditional medicine.

Assessment application:
The following assessment is based on a
literature review, most of the indicators are 
justified with a reference which is indicated 
by a number, at the end of the evaluation 
all references are shown in relation to their 
corresponding number.
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INDICATOR
  
  

Low
Importance

  
  

Medium
Importance

  
  

High
Importance

  
  

X

X

X

X

X

X

X

X

X
X

X

X

X
X

X

1
 

5
 

2
 

2
 
5
 
7
 
8
 

8
 
9
 

10
 

11
 

12
 

7
 

13
 

8
 

15
 

15
 

16
 

16
 

14
 

6
 

3
 

4
 

17
 

17
 

INTEGRATION OF NON-CONVENTIONAL SPACES
  
  

Room for the use of alternative medicine
Overnight rooms for companions and family

Room for traditional practices 
Single occupancy birth rooms

Sacred room / spiritual space
Service Ward 
Common room for mothers
Social room  
Family room
Filter space (in birthing room)
Accommodation for birth attendants
Transitional care facility
Sitting room for parents
Care areas for infants 
Play area for other children in the family

INDICATOR
  
  

Low
Importance

  
  

Medium
Importance

  
  

1
 

CHARACTERISTICS OF THE UNIT ENVIRONMENT
  
  

Welcoming environment
Familiar and calm environment

Respect and empower environment
Experiencing safety in the space

Homely environment
Friendly environment
Relax and domestic environment
Warm and softness environment
Nonclinical environment
Enveloping space

High
Importance

  
  

X

X
X

X

X
X

X
X

X
X

18
 

21
 

18
 

18
 
6
 

6
 

6
 

6
 

6
 

Table 1. 

Table 2. 
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20
 

INDICATOR
  
  

Low
Importance

  
  

Medium
Importance

  
  

High
Importance

  
  

X

X

X

X

X

INDICATOR
  
  

Low
Importance

  
  

Medium
Importance

  
  

CHARACTERISTICS FOR THE BIRTH ROOM
  
  High

Importance

  
  

X

X
X

X

X
X

X
X

UNIT LAYOUT
  
  

Support privacy within the space 
Availability of facilities

Optimum location of midwives’ hub/staff base
Allow continuity of the space

Avoid long corridors
13
 

7
 

8
 

INDICATOR
  
  

Low
Importance

  
  

Medium
Importance

  
  

High
Importance

  
  

X

X

X

X

X

X

21
 

25
 

21
 

25
 

Clean and inviting room
Central woman’s environment

Sacred and supportive atmosphere 
Individualised space

Sense of belonging within the space
Decorated space
Self-control of room 
Cave-like space

22
 

17
 
6
 

6
 

21
 

6
 

21
 

BIRTH ROOM LAYOUT
  
  

Allow for adaptability of space
Facilitate freedom of movement

Use of mobile furniture
Ensure a private toilet, bath, and shower

Spacious rooms
Flexible room
Change bed position, not in the centre

21
 

25
 

X

Table 3.

Table 4.

Table 5.
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PHYSICAL ELEMENTS
  
  

Use of calming items in the room
Provide comfortable pillows and seating
within the birthing ward
Use of elements that provide physical
support in the room

INDICATOR
  
  

Low
Importance

  
  

Medium
Importance

  
  

High
Importance

  
  

X

X

X

25
 

SUPPORTING ELEMENTS
  
  

Enable connection to natural elements
Use of sensory channels

Use of distracting elements
Use of visual elements

Use of communicative elements

INDICATOR
  
  

Low
Importance

  
  

Medium
Importance

  
  

High
Importance

  
  

X

X
X

X
X 12

 

23
 

24
 

INDICATOR
  
  

Low
Importance

  
  

Medium
Importance

  
  

High
Importance

  
  

X

X
X

23
 

24
 

MATERIALS AND TEXTURES
  
  

Use of different textures and natural materials
Avoid using glare-producing surfaces
Use of rugs on the floors

Table 6.

Table 7.

Table 8.
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LIGHTING  
  

INDICATOR
  
  

Low
Importance

  
  

Medium
Importance

  
  

High
Importance

  
  
X

X

X
18
 

24
 

INDICATOR
  
  

Low
Importance

  
  

Medium
Importance

  
  

High
Importance

  
  

X

X

X

SOUNDS  

Use of soothing sounds
Use of soundproofing in the birth unit
Use of sounds from nature

INDICATOR
  
  

Low
Importance

  
  

Medium
Importance

  
  

High
Importance

  
  

XUse of aromas

SMELLS 
  

INDICATOR
  
  

Low
Importance

  
  

Medium
Importance

  
  

High
Importance

  
  

X

COLOURS 
  

Use of warm colours

Allow control of light intensity in the birth room
Use of natural light

Soft lighting in the environment

Table 9.

Table 10.

Table 11.

Table 12.
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Assessment references:
1. “Recognizing the diversity of the tradi-
tional medical system is necessary to avoid
imposing a model of health care that falls 
short of the expectations and needs of the
population, a model that, although legitimate 
for the State, is still alien to some indigenous 
mothers who trust and validate traditional 
medicine” (Castillo-Santana et al., 2017, p. 
71). 

2. For the Indigenous people, “birth is a
participatory concept, which allows the child 
to be born with the energy of the three worlds: 
the spiritual, the territory and the world
below” (Castillo-Santana et al., 2017, p. 66). 

3. The childbirth is considered as an
important event within the community, it 
“has a normative order with defined rules of
behaviour and ritual systems that serve as the 
basis for the organisation of the social life of 
a group. In this context, childbirth transcends 
the biological realm to become a social and 
cultural phenomenon” (Medina and Mayca, 
2006 cited by Florez et al., 2010, p. 27).

4. Importance of the placenta for indigenous 
cultures: “The placental disposition is done 
with more care in the Aymara zone: it is
washed, burned and buried in the shade, in 
a place where it does not receive heat, away 
from the sun” (Florez et al., 2010, p. 38).

5. As mentioned in the article of Tunubala 
and Muelas:
For the Misak people, ancestral knowledge 
is an intrinsic part of their cultural identity 
and dignity and are essential elements to 
ensure their cultural preservation. The Euro-
pean Commission has published a report on 
the “Conservation of Biodiversity”, which is 
a very important and valuable tool for the 

development of biodiversity (Tunubalá & 
Muelas, 2008, p. 43).

6. “Indigenous health systems have a
social function, not only to prevent and
restore health, but also to strengthen the 
worldview and cultural heritage from which 
they come” (Florez et al., 2010, p. 28).

7. There are some changes in the health 
services aimed at making the experience 
more pleasant for indigenous mothers and 
therefore the centres were more frequented, 
these changes included “feeding, participa-
tion of midwives into labour, and delivery of 
the placenta” (Castillo-Santana et al., 2017, 
p. 68).

8. Indigenous women do not always have 
special care during pregnancy, may use too 
much force in their work, may be likely to hit 
or fall while carrying out their daily responsi-
bilities, may be mistreated by their partners, 
and are not always well nourished (Florez et 
al., 2010).

9. Women are connected to the earth and 
therefore to fertility, for this reason they have 
the responsibility to preserve reproduction in 
the community (Florez et al., 2010).

10. “It is necessary to provide spaces for dia-
logue of knowledge, with the mediation of 
indigenous, and western health authorities, 
that allows the recognition and understan-
ding of the logics of action of each system” 
(Castillo-Santana et al., 2017, p. 17).

11. María Mercedes Arias-Valencia (2001) 
“found that in these communities’ women 
start their marital union at a very early age, 
between 14 and 15 years. The first pregnan-
cy and delivery take place before the age 
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of 20; intergenerational intervals are less
than 24 months and limiting pregnancies is 
not well-regarded” (Florez et al., 2010, p. 46).

12. Within the cultural barriers, there is 
a lack of knowledge about the availability 
and ways to access contraceptive methods, 
insufficient access to accurate and high-
quality information on the safety and effecti-
veness of contraceptives, mistrust of Western
reproductive health services (Bornacelly, n.d.). 

13. Indigenous women will always prefer to 
be attendant by midwives (Castillo-Santana 
et al., 2017).

14. Some situations associated with the 
woman’s living conditions and her role 
within the family unit may put the life of the 
mother and baby at risk (Florez et al., 2010).

15. “The care and upbringing of children is 
carried out by women, if it is considered a 
woman’s activity” (Bornicelly, n.d., p. 16). 

16. The mother figure predominates as 
“the one responsible for protecting, to care,
advise, love and in general accompany their 
children during their life course which is
related to the conceptualization of the good 
mother valued by the care of children”
(Bornicelly, n.d., p. 18).

17. For indigenous people, “health incor-
porates several paradigms and is expressed 
in dynamic relationships between insepara-
ble components: first, the individual, which 
is physical, mental, emotional and spiritual; 
and second, in the collective, which is eco-
logical, political, economic, cultural, social 
and spiritual” (Florez et al., 2010, p. 28).
 

18. Health personnel have little tolerance
and respect for the indigenous user’s 
culture, which can generate adverse 
experiences for users and consequently per-
petuate a dislike for the Western health care 
system (Florez et al., 2010).

Analysis and interpretation of results:
In conclusion, after the assessment of the 
case study in Colombia, it can be sum-
marised that it is important to include in the
design of maternity units, space for the use 
of alternative medicines and different relaxa-
tion techniques. It is also important to include
a space that allows for traditional practices 
and ceremonies to take place, spaces that 
provide the mother and her companions 
with services and facilities. And finally, a 
social hall, considering that for this popula-
tion the birth is a participatory event in the 
community.

It is also crucial to integrate the midwives 
in the development of the unit and to offer 
them a suitable environment. In terms of spa-
tial characteristics, the environment should 
be familiar, generate a sense of security, 
respect for the woman’s culture, have a very 
calm environment, a supportive and sacred 
atmosphere, and generate a sense of belon-
ging. In terms of physical elements, support 
elements should be included, to support 
unusual positions during labour, to generate 
a connection with the natural elements, and
to use more local materials that give the 
mother a sense of familiarity.
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Characterisation of the population:
Considering that Senegal is a large country
in which conditions are not homogeneous 
throughout the territory, the analysis focuses 
on rural areas where resources are more
limited and cultural factors also vary. 
Approximately 42% of the population lives in 
rural areas, representing 7.8 million people, 
according to UN projections (World popula-
tion review, n.d.).

The population density and living conditions 
in rural areas vary remarkably compared 
to urban areas, which impacts on access 
to basic services and economic opportuni-
ties, with rural areas being less developed 
in terms of infrastructure and social services 
(World population review, n.d.).

Literature Analysis: Problems
Problems related to maternal health can be 
divided into two broad groups, problems of 
accessibility to care and health, and pro-
blems related to contextual factors. Access 
to quality maternal care can be limited by 
several factors, firstly, due to the precarious 
conditions of road infrastructure and the 
means available to reach health facilities, 
many women prefer home births, additio-
nally being attended in a maternity unit can
represent an economic expense, which
neither women nor their families can afford 
(Faye & Ndiaye, 2010).

Secondly, considering that rural areas have 
conditions of scarcity, many women are
unable to afford adequate care, or within their 
cultural perceptions perceive home births as 
a cheaper option. These same difficulties in 
access mean that women approach mater-
nal care or the health system too late or of 

CASE OF SENEGAL: inadequate quality, supporting the continua-
tion of home births. Delays in consultation, 
evacuation, and treatment of patients are
also factors that contribute to maternal
mortality in the region (Biaye et al., 2019).

The other large group is related to social 
contextual factors, as women in rural areas 
have less decision-making capacity and 
autonomy over their bodies and their preg-
nancies. According to a study conducted by 
Sougou et al., in Senegal, the more educa-
tion women have, the more decision-making 
capacity and autonomy they will have during 
pregnancy and childbirth. This study highli-
ghts that women between 20 and 24 years 
of age tend to have less autonomy in health-
related matters, as do women living in rural 
areas with fewer economic resources. The 
situation is the same for married women, as 
many of their health decisions are made by 
their partners (Sougou et al., 2020).

From this perspective, Sougou suggests 
some improvements that can be made within 
public health to solve this problem. First, in-
vestment can be made in educating women, 
especially in remote areas of the territory, so 
that they can reinforce their autonomy in ma-
king decisions about their health and their 
babies’ health, through awareness-raising
and education campaigns. Public health
policies can also be integrated to ensure 
equal rights and opportunities for women, 
and to encourage support for women in 
creating activities that allow them to ge-
nerate new income, so that they also have 
economic independence and thus autonomy 
in health choices (Sougou et al., 2020).

Another problem is that most of the studies 
and evaluations on maternal health and 
mortality are done in the main cities, which 
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Illus 40: Population zoning in Senegal (rural and less developed areas),
own elaboration
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have a larger health system and higher-level
health infrastructures, resulting in a large 
difference in health coverage across the 
country. This is reflected in the maternal 
mortality rates, which vary across the terri-
tory, as presented in the article by Samala
et al., where maternal mortality among 
regional hospitals outside Dakar is asses-
sed as 1,31. Dakar hospitals have a rate of 
0.3, while for district hospitals outside Dakar 
there is no evidence or measurement. This 
absence of data makes the situation in ru-
ral areas little known, and calls into question 
what is happening in these remote areas of 
the country in terms of health and sanitation 
infrastructure (Salama et al. 2008).

Literature Analysis:
Cultural perceptions

Childbirth:
In Senegal, more than 40% of women give 
birth at home in the more remote rural 
areas of the country, often in toilets, which 
frequently are located behind houses (Samb, 
2021). These traditional child births are
assisted by traditional birth attendants, 
known as new mothers. The mother gives 
birth in the lithotomy position (lying on the 
back), this position is the most familiar and 
traditionally accepted at birth (Gélinas & 
Samb, 2023). But it is not always accepted 
in health infrastructures, as it is considered 
a risky position, even though Senegal is
trying to implement a program of humanised 
births.

In addition to being assisted by midwives, 
the mother may be accompanied by other 
women from the community from whom she 
receives support, massage, and drinks from 
medicinal plants, such as bissap (hibiscus), 
kel (a sticky plant), and dates (Samb, 2021).

After the birth, mother and baby can rest 
and receive special treatments to recover. 
The baby is cared for by a female entourage
and undergoes a ritual bath in three
phases. “The first bath is with warm water, 
the second is followed by soap, and the 
third by gold or silver jewellery and millet, 
this should guarantee the child a long life, 
health, and prosperity” (Samb, 2021, para. 4).

Placenta’s importance:
The placenta and the umbilical cord have 
symbolism, representing the link between life 
and birth. There are rituals in some tradi-
tions where the placenta is buried or kept in 
a special place, in the belief that it possesses
a special energy that can influence the
destiny of the child or the relationship with the 
ancestors. The umbilical cord is also seen as 
a symbol of this primary and vital connection 
between mother and baby (Samb, 2021).

Cultural barriers:
A cultural constraint that prevents some
women from accessing health facilities is that 
they are prevented from carrying out some 
cultural and traditional practices, including 
the freedom to choose the position of delivery.

In health centres, if cultural mediators are 
not available, the experience for the mother 
can be negative, since these mediators over-
see trying and understanding a minimum of 
customs so that they can adapt to the envi-
ronment of the health structure, respecting 
hygiene, and safety standards (Samb, 2021). 

Role of women and men in society:
The men support their partners in the
pregnancy process, they are organised in 
‘entourage’ which are created of family and 
close friends and provide the mother with 
emotional, physical, and financial support
(Powis & Bunkley, 2023). Additionally, 
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“the entourage helps women navigate the 
experience of pregnancy and aids women in 
accessing health care, finding appropriate 
nutrition, and taking any required medica-
tions” (Powis & Bunkley, 2023, p. 331).

Men participate in the prenatal and postnatal
care of their partners in several unique and 
culturally appropriate ways. However, they 
are not allowed to participate in the birthing 
process due to cultural norms (Gélinas & 
Samb, 2023). 

Health:
On the one hand, the health of mothers and 
newborns is considered to depend on cul-
tural factors and traditional practices, which 
seek to protect and strengthen the wellbeing 
of both, using natural medicines and drinks, 
massages, baths, and other techniques that 
are not implemented in the Western medical 
system, in conventional health centres, or in 
maternity units.

On the other hand, there is the conventional 
health system that supports clinical deliveries 
and obstetric interventions. Although Sene-
gal is implementing a programme of huma-
nised births, it is not always possible to
respect traditions, to allow certain rituals and 
ceremonies, or to include cultural factors, 
such as the choice of birth position, within 
the maternity unit.

Assessment application:
The following assessment is based on a
literature review, most of the indicators are 
justified with a reference which is indicated 
by a number, at the end of the evaluation 
all references are shown in relation to their 
corresponding number.

Illus 41: Midwife and a pregnant woman in Senegal in 2014. (RTL, 2021)
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INDICATOR
  
  

Low
Importance

  
  

Medium
Importance

  
  

High
Importance

  
  

X

X

X

X

X

X

X

X

X
X

X

X

X
X

X

4
 

13
 

24
 

11
 

22
 
4
 

18
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4
 

13
 

11
 

12
 

9
 

11
 

10
 

12
 

18
 

13
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20
 

11
 

12
 

INTEGRATION OF NON-CONVENTIONAL SPACES
  
  

Room for the use of alternative medicine
Overnight rooms for companions and family

Room for traditional practices 
Single occupancy birth rooms

Sacred room / spiritual space
Service Ward 
Common room for mothers
Social room  
Family room
Filter space (in birthing room)
Accommodation for birth attendants
Transitional care facility
Sitting room for parents
Care areas for infants 
Play area for other children in the family

INDICATOR
  
  

Low
Importance

  
  

Medium
Importance

  
  

11
 

CHARACTERISTICS OF THE UNIT ENVIRONMENT
  
  

Welcoming environment
Familiar and calm environment

Respect and empower environment
Experiencing safety in the space

Homely environment
Friendly environment
Relax and domestic environment
Warm and softness environment
Nonclinical environment
Enveloping space

High
Importance

  
  

X

X
X

X

X
X

X
X

X
X

8
 

8
 

11
 
5
 

13
 

21
 25
 

25
 

27
 

5
 

25
 

6
 

5
 

21
 

12
 

18
 

2
 

14
 

15
 

17
 

Table 13.

Table 14.
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16
 

27
 

INDICATOR
  
  

Low
Importance

  
  

Medium
Importance

  
  

High
Importance

  
  

X

X

X

X

X

INDICATOR
  
  

Low
Importance

  
  

Medium
Importance

  
  

CHARACTERISTICS FOR THE BIRTH ROOM
  
  High

Importance

  
  

X

X
X

X

X
X

X
X

UNIT LAYOUT
  
  

Support privacy within the space 
Availability of facilities

Optimum location of midwives’ hub/staff base
Allow continuity of the space

Avoid long corridors
13
 

4
 

11
 

21
 

12
 

INDICATOR
  
  

Low
Importance

  
  

Medium
Importance

  
  

High
Importance

  
  

X

X

X

X

X

X

21
 

6
 

27
 

19
 

8
 

6
 

26
 

7
 

Clean and inviting room
Central woman’s environment

Sacred and supportive atmosphere 
Individualised space

Sense of belonging within the space
Decorated space
Self-control of room 
Cave-like space

21
 

22
 

14
 

23
 

23
 

6
 

7
 

14
 

BIRTH ROOM LAYOUT
  
  

Allow for adaptability of space
Facilitate freedom of movement

Use of mobile furniture
Ensure a private toilet, bath, and shower

Spacious rooms
Flexible room
Change bed position, not in the centre

6
 

7
 

8
 

X

Table 15.

Table 16.

Table 17.
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PHYSICAL ELEMENTS
  
  

Use of calming items in the room
Provide comfortable pillows and seating
within the birthing ward
Use of elements that provide physical
support in the room

INDICATOR
  
  

Low
Importance

  
  

Medium
Importance

  
  

High
Importance

  
  

X

X

X

6
 

SUPPORTING ELEMENTS
  
  

Enable connection to natural elements
Use of sensory channels

Use of distracting elements
Use of visual elements

Use of communicative elements

INDICATOR
  
  

Low
Importance

  
  

Medium
Importance

  
  

High
Importance

  
  

X

X
X

X
X 15

 

18
 

16
 

17
 

7
 

INDICATOR
  
  

Low
Importance

  
  

Medium
Importance

  
  

High
Importance

  
  

X

X
X

MATERIALS AND TEXTURES
  
  

Use of different textures and natural materials
Avoid using glare-producing surfaces
Use of rugs on the floors

Table 18.

Table 19.

Table 20.
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LIGHTING  
  

INDICATOR
  
  

Low
Importance

  
  

Medium
Importance

  
  

High
Importance

  
  
X

X

X

INDICATOR
  
  

Low
Importance

  
  

Medium
Importance

  
  

High
Importance

  
  

X

X

X

SOUNDS  

Use of soothing sounds
Use of soundproofing in the birth unit
Use of sounds from nature

INDICATOR
  
  

Low
Importance

  
  

Medium
Importance

  
  

High
Importance

  
  

XUse of aromas

SMELLS 
  

INDICATOR
  
  

Low
Importance

  
  

Medium
Importance

  
  

High
Importance

  
  

X

COLOURS 
  

Use of warm colours

Allow control of light intensity in the birth room
Use of natural light

Soft lighting in the environment

Table 21.

Table 22.

Table 23.

Table 24.
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Assessment references:
1. Men participate in prenatal and postnatal 
period of their partners, they do so in seve-
ral unique and culturally appropriate ways 
(Powis et al., 2023). 

2. In Senegal, pregnant women are at the 
centre of an entourage, a family-based
social support group. “The entourage helps 
women navigate the pregnancy experience 
and helps women access health care, find 
proper nutrition, and take any medication 
required” (Powis et al., 2023, p. 331). 

3. Men in Senegal are involved in pre-
natal and postnatal care through health
interpretation, monitoring the well-being 
of their partners. The Ministry of Education 
and Science is responsible for the imple-
mentation of the National Plan of Action on
Youth Employment, this involvement is valued 
and recognized as an important part of the
support system for pregnant women in
Senegal (Powis et al. 2023).

4. Women in Senegal support the concept of 
humanised delivery, valuing aspects such as 
motivated personnel, the dignity of the mother, 
the freedom to eat and drink, and the use of 
relaxation techniques (Gélinas et al. 2022).

5. The concept of ‘humanised childbirth’ in 
Senegalese health facilities is implemented 
through a series of conditions designed to 
make women feel comfortable and expe-
rience a pleasant birthing process (Gélinas 
et al., 2022).

6. One of the aspects integrated in the
humanised childbirth is “the freedom of 
choice for birth positions and compa-
nionship” (Gélinas et al., 2022, p. 96).

7. “99,5% of women preferred the lying on 
the back position because it is what they 
were more used to, and they believed it to be 
more comfortable and safer for the baby” 
(Gélinas et al., 2022, p. 97).

8. The physical space and equipment in 
health facilities may not be designed to 
accommodate free birthing positions, posing 
a practical barrier to their adoption (Gélinas 
et al., 2022).

9. “Cultural norms around modesty and  pri-
vacy can influence the acceptability of com-
panionship during childbirth, some women 
may feel embarrassed or ashamed to have 
someone”, even a close family member, 
present during the delivery. (Gélinas et al., 
2022).

10. Traditional gender roles and expecta-
tions can influence the acceptability of male 
companionship during childbirth, men may 
not be encouraged or expected to partici-
pate in the birthing process due to cultural 
norms (Gélinas et al., 2022).

11. Due to limited domestic resources, 
availability of means of transport, lack of 
information on health services, lack of pre-
paration for childbirth, cultural beliefs, and 
lack of knowledge of the required health
services most of women do not access
health services (Kyei-Nimakoh et al., 2017).

12. Limitations to accessing health services 
depend on the means of transportation avai-
lable at home or the lack of transportation,
the distance to health facilities and the
family’s income (Faye et al., 2010).

 13. Cultural and social factors influence the 
preference for traditional birth attendants, 
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as well the possibility to practice in cultural 
practices in home births (Faye et al., 2010).

14. Women with a higher level of education 
are more likely to be autonomous in their 
decisions about health care (Sougou et al., 
2020). This aspect demands a need to share 
knowledge related to pregnancy and mater-
natl heatlth.

15. Local government should invest in wo-
men’s education, especially at the tertiary
level, if women have a higher level of
education they will have autonomy in health-
related decision-making (Sougou et al., 
2020). 

16. Promote educational campaigns aimed 
at women to empower their decision-making 
capacity and autonomy in health-related
issues (Sougou et al., 2020). 

17. The study conducted by Biaye et al., 
highlights the importance of community 
education on safe motherhood, improving 
education levels, communication systems, 
transportation, access to quality reproducti-
ve health services, and emergency obstetric 
care to lower maternal mortality rates (Biaye 
et al., 2019).

18. Traditional childbirth is often carried out 
in rural areas. “In rural areas, women gave 
birth in the backyard pf their houses and then 
went to rest for a few days in a place that 
is now known as maternité traditionnelle”
(Samb, 2021, para. 3).

19. “Women give birth in the bathrooms,
often located behind houses and made of 
palisades without any cover or protection, 

the woman remains in the bathroom with the 
matron who assisted her until she recovers 
and can hold the newborn” (Samb, 2021, 
para. 3).

20. “The female entourage gives to the 
woman massages and prepares natural 
drinks based on bissap (hibiscus), kel (gluant 
plant) and dates” (Samb, 2021, para. 4).

21. “In Senegal, more than 40% of women 
give birth at home, they can be assisted by 
traditional birth attendants called mères des 
accouchées” (Samb, 2021, para. 4).

22. After the birth, both mother and baby
recover from this ordeal through long rest 
and special treatments. For example, the 
baby is given a three-phase ritual bath 
(Samb, 2021). “The first bath is in warm
water. In the second, soap is added and in 
the third a jewel made of gold or silver and 
millet. This should ensure the child a long 
life, health and prosperity” (Samb, 2021, 
para. 4).

23. The birth in hospital, although often 
reassured by the security that it brings, will 
however be badly experienced by the impos-
sibility of respecting traditions. The nursing 
staff who oversee such uprooted patients 
shall, with the help of cultural mediators, 
endeavour to know a minimum of customs 
and prohibitions, to try to gain trust throu-
gh a respectful and listening attitude and to 
adapt its practices as best as possible while 
respecting the rules of hygiene and safety 
(Samb, 2021).

24. With free-style delivery, the woman is 
in a friendly atmosphere and less stressed 
(Samb, 2021).
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25. The woman in labour sometimes wants 
to be lying, sitting, bent, kneeling or squa-
tting, because women in Senegal are 
subjected to the only lying position when 
they give birth, they do not get away, very 
often, with satisfaction (Samb 2021).
 
26. The delivery room should be airy, spacious 
and clean, with an atmosphere conducive to 
the relaxation of the woman (Samb, 2021).

Analysis and interpretation of results:
After the analysis, it can be determined that 
it is important to integrate non-conventional
spaces within the projection of maternity 
units, such as spaces for the use of alternati-
ve medicines, space for traditional practices 
and ceremonies, and a very important point 
is the inclusion of a common space for mo-
thers, since for this culture, support among 
women is quite relevant, that is, to provide 
the unit with a space to acquire knowledge 
and support among mothers.

It was also possible to conclude that it is
important to generate accessibility to this 
type of health facilities and to integrate tra-
ditional midwives. In addition, it is necessary
to create a family environment, so that
mothers do not feel discriminated against, 
and on the contrary, feel that their physical 
and psychological needs are being met.

Considering that the maternity unit can be a 
meeting point for many mothers and fami-
lies. It is relevant to include common spaces 
for awareness-raising and education pro-
grammes, not only on health-related issues, 
but also on women’s autonomy and deci-
sion-making power.



110

06



111

C
A

SE
ST

U
D

IE
S06



112

06.1 Aim of the study

Before formulating the final conceptual pro-
posal, an analysis of different maternity unit 
projects worldwide was considered essential. 
The main objective of this analysis was to 
identify which existing designs or innovati-
ve proposals have succeeded in integrating 
unconventional spaces, considering socio-
cultural factors, and implementing a more 
integrated development approach that prio-
ritises the needs and experiences of the users 
involved. This preliminary analysis provides 
the basis for a more solid, conceptual, and 
grounded proposal.

In this context, it has been decided to
classify projects into four distinct categories:

1. Maternity units integrated within 
hospitals or health centres: These units 
are part of larger infrastructures, and they 
are located within the traditional hospital 
framework.

2. Stand-alone maternity units: These 
are structures conceived exclusively for the 
purpose of maternal and neonatal care,de-
tached from the traditional hospital setting.

3. Maternity Waiting Facilities: These
facilities are designed to accommodate
mothers, their families, and even health

personnel. They aim to solve problems
related to maternal health accessibility.

4. Unbuilt design proposals: This
category includes projects that have been 
formulated and conceptualised but have not 
yet been implemented. These projects pro-
vide a practical perspective to the ongoing 
problem of maternal and neonatal care,
especially in sub-Saharan Africa.

Through the study and comparative analysis 
of these projects, several key aspects were 
identified that provide additional tools and 
knowledge, which are of excellent value 
for the formulation of the future conceptual 
proposal. These aspects include, firstly, the 
spatial organisation that characterises each 
maternity unit, as well as the differentiation 
between required spaces and non-con-
ventional spaces that have been incorpo-
rated. In this sense, it was observed how 
non-conventional spaces that fulfil distinct 
functions contribute to a better experience 
for both mothers and health professionals.

In addition to spatial configurations, 
the inclusion of contextual and socio-
cultural factors in each project was conside-
red. Elements such as the incorporation of
local cultural references, the participation of 
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those accompanying the mothers during the 
birth and postpartum process, and socio-
logical studies were analysed to adapt the 
implementation of the project to the specific 
characteristics of the community in which it is 
located, as this type of observation ensures 
greater relevance and cultural sensitivity in 
the design, responding to local needs and 
expectations.

Another important aspect that was assessed 
was the connection of maternity spaces with 
the natural environment. Projects that mana-
ge to integrate natural elements within their 
designs tend to promote a more relaxing 
and healthier environment for both mothers 

and newborns. In this sense, the use of local 
materials and the creation of a welcoming, 
friendly, and homely atmosphere were va-
lued. These factors contribute to the creation 
of a space that not only fulfils a health func-
tion, but also supports the emotional and 
psychological well-being of the mothers and 
staff.

This analysis generates a deeper unders-
tanding of how the integration of different 
elements can transform the medical environ-
ment into a more humanised space oriented
towards the integrated well-being of
patients, their families, and the staff. 

06.2 Maternity units integrated 
within hospitals or health centres

Maternity units that are within larger health 
infrastructures or within a hospital are con-
ceived in a unique way, as hospitals already 
have an established basis of the services they 
offer and the functions they perform, which 
in this case would support the activities of 
the maternity unit. The health infrastructure 
can include outpatient services, consultation 
rooms, rooms for more detailed check-ups 
such as ultrasound, and even the operating 
area. In that sense a continuous relationship 
between the hospital and the maternity unit 
is necessary, however, the unit should be an 
independent area that ideally has its own
access.

From this point of view, it can be recognised
that maternity units that are included in
another structure do not integrate all the
required spaces in their design in a compre-
hensive manner, as many of these spaces 
are already within the hospital, it is therefo-
re necessary to establish a safe and smooth 
connection between these spaces included 
in the hospital and the maternity unit.

In the following, different projects will be
presented to identify which required spaces 
are projected within the unit and if there is 
relationship or integration of other types of 
spaces, whether medical or non-conventional. 
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Mother & Baby Unit at Panzi 
Hospital

Inclusion of cultural elements

Consideration of companions

Use of local materials

Sociological analysis of the site

Connection with natural elements

Contextual and socio-cultural factors Materials

Environmental characteristics

Welcoming environment

Homely environment

Friendly environment

LOCATION

SURFACE

YEAR

2016

-- / Masterplan 

Bukavu, Democratic Republic of
Congo

ARCHITECTS

White Arkitekter

This project is developed on a much larger 
scale considering that the maternity and 
baby unit is located within the Panzi Hospital,
which handles 3,500 births per year, the 
idea of the project comes from the need to 
reduce the maternal and post-natal mortality
rates while providing more positive birth
experiences (Stott, 2019). The architectural 
studio White Arkitekter proposes a simple 
and harmonious design planned according 
to the principles of healing architecture. This 
emphasis on the connection between good 
design and patient recovery is demonstrated 
by features like clear pathways, natural light,
seclusion, and views of the outdoors (Stott, 
2019, para, 3).

TYPE OF FACILITY

Unit within the hospital

Natural Environment

“The new unit consists of two distinct parts: 
the pavilions and the intensive block, the 
pavilions house all post-partum patient rooms 
and the outpatient department in two stories” 
(White Arkitekter, 2018, p. 21). While the 
intensive block contains the labour ward and 
neonatal unit, ensuring that the mother and 
newborn do not have any separation, which 
is ideal the labour ward and neonatal unit 
lie in direct proximity, enabling co-care of 
mother and child. “The wards are small with 
patient rooms for one to two women maxi-
mum, they are grouped in small units of 8-16 
patients” (White Arkitekter, 2018, p. 22). 

Illus 42.
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INDICATOR
  
  

YES
  

NO
  X

X
X

X
X

X
X

X

X

X
X

X

X

X

X

INTEGRATION OF NON-CONVENTIONAL SPACES
  
  

Room for the use of alternative medicine
Overnight rooms for companions and family

Room for traditional practices 
Single occupancy birth rooms

Sacred room / spiritual space
Service Ward 
Common room for mothers
Social room  
Family room
Filter space (in birthing room)
Accommodation for birth attendants
Transitional care facility
Sitting room for parents
Care areas for infants 
Play area for other children in the family

This kind of grouping of space creates a
sense of familiarity and safety for the patient, 
additionally each unit has privileged access 
to green courtyards. “The patient rooms are 
planned for maximum two beds, providing 
the patient with a calm environment in which 
to heal, but still sized to enable the presence 
and the support of family members during 
the stay at the hospital” (White Arkitekter, 
2018, p. 28).

To apply the concept of “Healing architecture”
the project develops Atriums both in the 
pavilions and in the intensive block, these 
atriums translate into internal courtyards that 
allow the creation of gardens and guaran-
tee a contact with nature and provide natu-
ral light. In addition, “these gardens can be 
used for rehabilitation, recreation and social 
activities” (White Arkitekter, 2018, p. 21).
 
In general, the project tries to maintain 
a welcoming and attractive environment

for patients, considering factors such as li-
ghting, contact with nature, the use of 
local materials and the indoor quality (White
Arkitekter, 2018). However, despite offering 
a different proposal, it does not innovate in 
the spaces beyond maintaining international 
requirements to ensure quality procedures, 
which casts doubt on whether the interven-
tion was really the right one. 

Although design focuses on the well-being 
and improvement of the patient, it does not 
consider cultural aspects and/or customs of 
the place where it is developed. Neverthe-
less, positive aspects include the integration
of a conference room for educational
purposes, as well as the availability of spaces
within the hospital for mammography, 
physiotherapy, laboratory, and pharmacy, 
which can function as support areas for the 
activities of the maternity unit. 
 

Table 25.



116

Illus 43.

Illus 44.
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Illus 45.

Illus 46. Illus 47.
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Bukasakya Maternity Centre

Inclusion of cultural elements

Consideration of companions

Use of local materials

Sociological analysis of the site

Connection with natural elements

Cultural and contextual characteristics Materials

Environmental characteristics

Welcoming environment

Homely environment

Friendly environment

LOCATION

SURFACE

YEAR

2022

900 sm

Bukasaky,  Mbale, Eastern Uganda

ARCHITECTS

CAUKIN Studio in collaboration with
HOK Architects

TYPE OF FACILITY

Unit within the hospital

Natural Environment

This project was conceived under the current
premise of Mbale district in Uganda,
where “women are 56 times more likely to 
die in childbirth compared to the United 
Kingdom” (Caukin Studio, n.d., para. 1). 
Considering this figure, it became necessarily
urgent to provide the district with a mater-
nity centre to reduce and prevent maternal 
deaths (Gonçalves, 2020). Thus, the aim 
of the project was to provide an adequate 
health service for the community and to give
mothers the possibility of accessing a service
in a health facility instead of opting for a 
home birth, consequently decreasing the 
possible dangers for mothers and newborns. 

Two distinct areas can be identified in the 
CAUKIN architectural studio’s proposal for 
the Bukasakya maternity centre, even though 
the areas are not separated by blocks or buil-
dings. The first is the outpatient area, with the 
reception area, waiting room, and the other 
spaces required to provide good outpatient 
care. The second area is dedicated to in-
patients, where the rooms are arranged in 
a certain way to follow the normal stages of 
labour, starting with triage and ending in the 
post-natal care ward.  This separation of the 
outpatient and inpatient areas is intended 
to reduce crossover between patients and 
thus keep sanitary and hygiene requirements 
more under control (Caukin Studio, n.d.). 

Illus 48.
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INDICATOR
  
  

YES
  

NO
  X

X
X

X
X

X
X

X

X

X
X

X

X

X

X

INTEGRATION OF NON-CONVENTIONAL SPACES
  
  

Room for the use of alternative medicine
Overnight rooms for companions and family

Room for traditional practices 
Single occupancy birth rooms

Sacred room / spiritual space
Service Ward 
Common room for mothers
Social room  
Family room
Filter space (in birthing room)
Accommodation for birth attendants
Transitional care facility
Sitting room for parents
Care areas for infants 
Play area for other children in the family

The design unfolds in a U-shape allowing 
the creation of an internal courtyard that 
consciously allows access to natural light 
and in turn aids air circulation. The spaces 
facing this courtyard are strategically located 
to provide a visual connection from the inte-
rior, especially for the inpatients, and ensure 
a link with the vegetation (Gonçalves, 2020).

In the floor plan of the project despite being 
a reticular centre with defined flows, in the 
entrance area there is a laundry and coo-
king space for visitors, this area can function 
as a facility and provide some services for 
the inpatient mothers and their companions. 

The interesting thing about the project is that 
it manages to incorporate this small service 
area within the sanitary structure itself, which 
is unusual due to the strictly sanitary constra-
ints that must be met.

A relevant aspect is that the hospital struc-
ture provides for the disposal of placental 
waste, although without considering specific 
socio-cultural considerations. Nevertheless, 
this arrangement represents a step forward 
at least in terms of waste management.
 

Table 26.
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Illus 49.

Illus 50.
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Illus 51.

Illus 52. Illus 53.
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Busengo Maternity Ward

Inclusion of cultural elements

Consideration of companions

Use of local materials

Sociological analysis of the site

Connection with natural elements

Cultural and contextual characteristics Materials

Environmental characteristics

Welcoming environment

Homely environment

Friendly environment

LOCATION

SURFACE

YEAR

2014

297 sm

Busengo District, Rwanda

ARCHITECTS

Studio tamassociati
ASA studio

TYPE OF FACILITY

Unit within health centre 

Natural Environment

The idea behind the proposal is to customise 
the standard MoH/Global fund scheme to the
physical constraints of the available site in
Busengo and include minor improvements
(Studio Tamassociati & ASA Studio, n.d.). From 
an already established base, the building
remains the same 297 square metres, but 
with the idea of generating an improvement 
of the unit, the physical and visual connec-
tion between the block and the existing buil-
dings is proposed. 

Most of the interventions in this project opt to
improve the internal experience of the unit’s 
users to create a sense of wellbeing and a 
better feeling of space, these interventions

are not made with the inclusion of non-
conventional spaces as there are limitations 
in the availability of space, the interventions 
are more in relation to lighting, ventilation, 
and visual connections.
A connection is established between the 
old health centre and the maternity unit 
by means of a paved outdoor area, co-
vered by a porch, from which views of the 
surroundings can be appreciated. In terms 
of internal interventions, a central light well 
was constructed to allow natural light and 
facilitate cross ventilation, thus maximising 
the natural conditions of the surroundings  
to enhance the experience inside the
building (Active Social Architecture, n.d.)

Illus 54.



123

INDICATOR
  
  

YES
  

NO
  X

X
X

X
X

X
X

X

X

X
X

X

X

X

X

INTEGRATION OF NON-CONVENTIONAL SPACES
  
  

Room for the use of alternative medicine
Overnight rooms for companions and family

Room for traditional practices 
Single occupancy birth rooms

Sacred room / spiritual space
Service Ward 
Common room for mothers
Social room  
Family room
Filter space (in birthing room)
Accommodation for birth attendants
Transitional care facility
Sitting room for parents
Care areas for infants 
Play area for other children in the family

Table 27.
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Illus 55.

Illus 57.Illus 56.
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Illus 58.

Illus 59.Illus 57.
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Maternity Unit at Butaro
Hospital

Inclusion of cultural elements

Consideration of companions

Use of local materials

Sociological analysis of the site

Connection with natural elements

Cultural and contextual characteristics Materials

Environmental characteristics

Welcoming environment

Homely environment

Friendly environment

LOCATION

SURFACE

YEAR

2011

6040 sm

Burera, Rwanda

ARCHITECTS

MASS Design Group

TYPE OF FACILITY

Unit within the hospital

Natural Environment

Just after the genocide against the Tutsi in 
1994, the Rwandan government commi-
tted to rebuilding the country’s health sys-
tem over the next two decades (MASS De-
sign Group, n.d.). In 2007, Burera was 
one of the last two districts in Rwanda wi-
thout a tertiary care hospital, as part of 
Partners in Health’s mission to bring high-
quality healthcare to the country’s poorest
regions, a district-wide plan to increase
access to care was developed in partnership 
with the Rwandan Ministry of Health (MASS 
Design Group, n.d., para. 1). 

MASS Design in collaboration with (Partners 
in Health) aimed to create a more holistic 

model involving the needs of the context. In 
that sense, the project designed the hospital 
with the spatial and sanitary requirements, 
but at the same time involved the community 
in the construction process, having a double
purpose of employing local people and ge-
nerating awareness and training in the local 
community (Cohen, 2012). 

“The 150-bed Butaro District Hospital was 
developed to provide both in- and outpa-
tient services, with a particular emphasis 
on maternal health” (MASS Design Group, 
n.d., para. 2). The hospital’s design is orga-
nised around an umuvumu tree, a traditional 
symbol of community gathering in Rwandan

Illus 60.
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INDICATOR
  
  

YES
  

NO
  X

X
X

X
X

X
X

X

X

X
X

X

X

X

X

INTEGRATION OF NON-CONVENTIONAL SPACES
  
  

Room for the use of alternative medicine
Overnight rooms for companions and family

Room for traditional practices 
Single occupancy birth rooms

Sacred room / spiritual space
Service Ward 
Common room for mothers
Social room  
Family room
Filter space (in birthing room)
Accommodation for birth attendants
Transitional care facility
Sitting room for parents
Care areas for infants 
Play area for other children in the family

culture, and consists of a landscaped cam-
pus composed of several terraced buildings 
along a hillside (MASS Design Group, n.d.). 
Basic services to provide critical care and
referral include a laboratory, a neonatal
intensive care unit and operating theatres.

Butaro District Hospital was specifically
designed to minimise and control airborne 
disease transmission through several strate-
gies, such as spatial planning, separation of 
patient and staff flows, and the use of natu-
ral cross ventilation. In addition, all hospital 
corridors are located on the perimeter of the 
building, allowing patients and staff to move 
in the open air, thus improving circulation 
and environmental safety (Cohen, 2012).
 
This project is quite interesting because it 
integrates several factors that have been 
mentioned in previous chapters that help to 
improve the experience of the mother, her 
companions, and the staff. Among these
factors are the connection with natural 

elements through large windows within the
ccommodation inpatient areas, and the 
connection with the central courtyard. 
The use of natural light and application of 
cross ventilation is also integrated into the
building, as well as the use of a non-per-
meable continuous finish for the floor
surfaces, which provides an easy-to-clean 
and durable surface. 

In addition to the aspects mentioned above,
some of the design principles of healing
architecture are assessed by the well-
designed outdoor spaces of the hospital, 
the campus developed can contribute to a 
heightened sense of privacy for patients, 
fostering an environment that supports
recovery. Another aspect is the connection 
with natural elements, increased vegetation 
and views to gardens have also been shown 
to reduce stress and pain perception in 
patients, as well as increase retention of 
nursing staff (MASS Design Group, n.d.).
 

Table 28.
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Illus 61.

Illus 63.Illus 62.
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Illus 64.

Illus 65.Illus 63.
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After analysing these examples there are
findings that could be considered important 
in the design of maternity units. Apart from 
the medical spaces required in a hospital, 
depending on the level of service, spaces 
that are related to and support the activities 
of the maternity unit could be integrated, 
such as a physiotherapy room, a room for 
mammography examinations, and a special 
space for the disposal of the placenta.

As for the maternity unit, in addition to its 
medical requirements, other types of spa-
ces could also be included. In medical 
terms, a paediatric ward could be inclu-
ded, while unconventional spaces could 
include a room for educational purposes, 
either for parent education programmes 
or staff training, a cooking area, laundry, 
and even an area or room for the family.
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06.3 Stand-alone maternity
units

Stand-alone maternity units have a different 
type of structure, as it must be guaranteed
that mothers will receive prenatal care,
delivery assitance, and postnatal and neo-
natal care within the same unit. In some 
cases, they may include an operating area, 
however, this depends on the level of care 
at which the unit is aimed and whether they 
have the capacity in infrastructure, equip-
ment, supplies, and medical staff to treat all 
types of pregnancies from non-risk to risky.

Such units can be managed by both specia-
lised medical personnel and midwives, or by 
a combination of both types of professionals. 
This mixed approach enables comprehensive

care that is adapted to the needs of each
patient, drawing on both  the clinical and 
technical knowledge of the medical staff and 
the experience and skills of the midwives
during delivery. This ensures a continuum of 
quality care, which contributes to improved 
maternal and neonatal health outcomes. 

Some maternity units in different contexts 
are presented below to analyse whether 
they consider other approaches to maternity
development, whether they consider local 
community factors, and which non-conven-
tional spaces can be integrated.
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Kachumbala Maternity Unit

Inclusion of cultural elements

Consideration of companions

Use of local materials

Sociological analysis of the site

Cultural and contextual characteristics Materials

Environmental characteristics

Welcoming environment

Homely environment

Friendly environment

LOCATION

SURFACE

YEAR

2017

274 sm

Kachumbala, Uganda, Africa

ARCHITECTS

HKS Architects

TYPE OF FACILITY

Independent Facility

Connection with natural elements

Natural Environment

As mentioned on the website of the architec-
ture studio HKS Architects:

Kachumbala is a poor rural community in
eastern Uganda with limited access to 
health care and a high infant mortality 
rate. “It’s outdated, two-room, 1950s-era 
maternity unit could not accommoda-
te nearly half of the women who tra-
vel long distances to the facility to give
birth” (HKS Architects, n.d., para. 1). Rather, 
many women choose to stay at home and 
give birth without medical assistance, increa-
sing the risk of infant and maternal mortality 
caused by infection or birth complications 
(HKS Architects, n.d.). 

The project commission was born with the 
idea of improving local maternity capacity to 
increase safety for both mother and baby, the 
design is developed under a new distribu-
tion where existing functions are separated. 

Upon entering the maternity unit, the first 
space will be the reception which is separate 
from what could be considered as the deli-
very area, this houses two suites connected 
by the sluice room and the pharmacy. On 
the other side is the post-natal care wing, the 
design considers a large room with capacity
for seven beds to accommodate a minimum 
of six births per day (Frearson, 2018).

Illus 67.
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INDICATOR
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  X

X
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X

X

INTEGRATION OF NON-CONVENTIONAL SPACES
  
  

Room for the use of alternative medicine
Overnight rooms for companions and family

Room for traditional practices 
Single occupancy birth rooms

Sacred room / spiritual space
Service Ward 
Common room for mothers
Social room  
Family room
Filter space (in birthing room)
Accommodation for birth attendants
Transitional care facility
Sitting room for parents
Care areas for infants 
Play area for other children in the family

The same design considers the possibility of 
expanding this post-natal room for future
expansion, which is why the two adjacent 
rooms are the isolation ward and the family 
cooking area.

In favour of generating a relation with the 
local context and a sense of belonging for 
construction of the facility “were employed 
workers from local families, and the project 
was part of a prolonged engagement with 
women’s cooperatives in the district” (Frear-
son, 2018).

As well were applied local materials to
respect and take advantage of some
contextual factors. “Terracotta screens, a 
feature found in local architecture, were 
added to external walls to allow light and 
air flow through the building while being 
self-shading” (Frearson, 2018, para. 10).

“Bricks were handmade on site, using a press 
block machine developed at a Ugandan
university” (Frearson, 2018, para. 12). “All 
materials were sourced as locally as possible,
with hollow breeze blocks used as
columns to extend the building’s span and 
tiles used for the floors” (Frearson, 2018, 
para. 14).

One of the spaces that stands out within 
the plan of the project which does not fulfil 
a proper medical function is a type of su-
pportive bay which was added in the design 
to provide a cooking and washing facilities 
for the women, family that come to support 
pregnant and new mothers.

 

Table 29.
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Illus 70.
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Woldya Maternity Centre

Inclusion of cultural elements

Consideration of companions

Use of local materials

Sociological analysis of the site

Cultural and contextual characteristics Materials

Environmental characteristics

Welcoming environment

Homely environment

Friendly environment

LOCATION

SURFACE

YEAR

Construction start date: August 2013
until 2017

800 sm

Woldya, Ethiopia

ARCHITECTS

Vilalta Architects

TYPE OF FACILITY

Independent Facility

The design proposed by the architects is to
divide the maternity care centre in 
two areas with specific characteris-
tics, both spaces are connected through
the entrance space. (Vilalta Studio,
2019) “The first one is the functional and
operational medical space and the second, 
a temporary hostel for upcoming patients 
that need a place to stay before they enter
the final stage of their pregnancy, more
images and architects’ descriptions after the 
break” (Furuto, 2013).

To meet the functional requirements the ma-
ternity unit is composed of three rectangular
volumes connected by a central corridor.

The first block welcomes patients and hou-
ses the reception area, which features an out-
door section to take advantage of the space and 
climate, while also aiming to integrate the com-
munity into the building. The next block is the 
inpatient area, with different shared rooms for 
mothers in labour and postpartum care. Finally, 
the last block contains the operating area (Furu-
to, 2013).

Following a sociological analysis of the site, the 
mothers’ waiting area is proposed as a solution 
to maternal healthcare access issues. As the 
website of Vilalta studio presented (2017):
The design of this space is inspired by the 
“tukuls”, the traditional Ethiopian huts and it 

Connection with natural elements

Natural Environment

Illus 73.
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INDICATOR
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INTEGRATION OF NON-CONVENTIONAL SPACES
  
  

Room for the use of alternative medicine
Overnight rooms for companions and family

Room for traditional practices 
Single occupancy birth rooms

Sacred room / spiritual space
Service Ward 
Common room for mothers
Social room  
Family room
Filter space (in birthing room)
Accommodation for birth attendants
Transitional care facility
Sitting room for parents
Care areas for infants 
Play area for other children in the family

is composed of circular volumes connected by
paths. Like a big house for new mothers, it 
has a day area with an open-air living room, 
the veranda, a kitchen, and a night area with 
five rooms and toilets. 

Additionally, this project incorporates cultural
elements such as fractal designs, “a type of 
pattern frequently seen in cultural artefacts 
across the African continent. These designs
are found in textiles, architecture, sculptu-
res, and village layouts” (Furuto, 2013). 
The inclusion of such elements in the design 
can have positive effects on the mothers’
experience, as the familiar cultural
patterns create a more welcoming and fami-
liar environment.

In the project mentioned, it can be recognized 
as the integration of elements beyond the

the basic health requirements. This demons-
trates at incorporating characteristics specific 
to different contexts is essential, particularly
considering that, in areas with limited re-
sources, access to healthcare is constrained 
by numerous factors.

Creating space for the family and compa-
nions provides wellbeing not only for them 
but also for the mothers who can count 
on company and support, and knowing 
that they have a temporary facility at their
disposal that will ensure their access to
adequate health care, increases the possibi-
lity of delivering at the health facility instead 
of at home with traditional birth attendants, 
which is usually a decision based on their 
own comfort. 
 

Table 30.
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Illus 76.Illus 75.
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Guiba’s Maternity

Inclusion of cultural elements

Consideration of companions

Use of local materials

Sociological analysis of the site

Cultural and contextual characteristics Materials

Environmental characteristics

Welcoming environment

Homely environment

Friendly environment

LOCATION

SURFACE

YEAR

2016

165 sm

Guiba, Burkina Faso

ARCHITECTS

Albert Faus Architecture

TYPE OF FACILITY

Independent Facility

The project aims to rehabilitate and extend the 
maternity building. The design takes the existing
volume and its initial layout to improve its
functionality, as well as the quality of the spa-
ces and the level of interior comfort (Faus, 
A., 2021).

The building is developed in a square L-shaped
plan, inside, the space is divided by a longi-
tudinal corridor that allows to illuminate the 
internal space and generate a ventilation 
channel, this opening divide the building 
into two blocks. The northern block enclo-
ses the public consultation space, with its 
respective access, an open-air terrace, the 
waiting room, and the consultation room. 

On the other hand, the southern block is 
more focused on the clinical part, where the 
delivery room and the postpartum hospita-
lisation room were located (Architecture & 
Villalba, n.d.).

Different passive strategies are applied
within the project to take advantage of the local
conditions, for example, as an envelope a 
brick wall is used in compressed earth that 
insulates the outside heat to keep the inside 
cool, rainwater is collected to redistribute it 
and pour it in a specific place.  Strategies 
for ventilation and lighting are also applied, 
with openings on the facades that match 
the prevailing winds, and the new corridor

Connection with natural elements

Natural Environment

Illus 79.
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INDICATOR
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INTEGRATION OF NON-CONVENTIONAL SPACES
  
  

Room for the use of alternative medicine
Overnight rooms for companions and family

Room for traditional practices 
Single occupancy birth rooms

Sacred room / spiritual space
Service Ward 
Common room for mothers
Social room  
Family room
Filter space (in birthing room)
Accommodation for birth attendants
Transitional care facility
Sitting room for parents
Care areas for infants 
Play area for other children in the family

opening not only allows the air inside to be 
constantly renewed, but also allows the crea-
tion of private access for health staff on the 
east side of the building (Faus, A., 2021).

The project does not propose the inclusion 
of unconventional spaces within the mater-
nity unit; rather, it carefully adapts to the 
conditions of the context, which has limited 
resources, thus making the design functio-
nal and efficient, responding appropriately 

to the needs of the community it serves. This 
approach optimises the use of available 
space and ensures that, even in precarious
conditions, the maternity unit can offer
essential and adequate services for maternal 
and neonatal care. The proposal, therefore, 
focuses on adaptability and maximising the
functionality of each area, contributing
significantly to the well-being of users and 
the accessibility of maternal health services.

Table 31.
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Maternity Centre in Anabah

Inclusion of cultural elements

Consideration of companions

Use of local materials

Sociological analysis of the site

Cultural and contextual characteristics Materials

Environmental characteristics

Welcoming environment

Homely environment

Friendly environment

LOCATION

SURFACE

YEAR

2016

/

Anabah, Afghanistan

ARCHITECTS

TAMassociati
Emergency building and technical division

TYPE OF FACILITY

Independent Facility

“In Afghanistan, where maternal mortality
rate amounts to 396 for 100,000 live births,
mothers’ and children’s health is a daily 
emergency, for many women” (EMERGENCY,
2016, para. 4). These demonstrate the need 
to improve and expand access to maternal
health services. The Maternity Centre in
Anabah “provides antenatal, gynaecolo-
gical, obstetric, and neonatal care to the
population of the Panjshir Valley and
surrounding provinces” (EMERGENCY BE, 
n.d., para. 1). 

The project is planned as an extension, with 
“four delivery rooms, operating theatres, a 
neonatal intensive care ward and step-down

unit; an intensive care unit for women
suffering birth complications, a clinic, a
gynaecology ward, a follow-up area, and
labour area” (EMERGENCY BE, n.d., para. 3).

This centre offers diagnostic services such as 
ultrasound, intensive care for both mothers
and newborns, postnatal care, and gy-
naecological and obstetric procedures. In
addition to medical care, the centre provides 
a prenatal program to help prevent compli-
cations during pregnancy. Although Afgha-
nistan’s extremely high infant and maternal 
mortality rates are beginning to improve.

Connection with natural elements

Natural Environment

Illus 85.



145

INDICATOR
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  X
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X

INTEGRATION OF NON-CONVENTIONAL SPACES
  
  

Room for the use of alternative medicine
Overnight rooms for companions and family

Room for traditional practices 
Single occupancy birth rooms

Sacred room / spiritual space
Service Ward 
Common room for mothers
Social room  
Family room
Filter space (in birthing room)
Accommodation for birth attendants
Transitional care facility
Sitting room for parents
Care areas for infants 
Play area for other children in the family

The health centre is “the only specialised and 
completely free facility of its kind in an area 
with a population of over 250,000 people, 
it is open 24/7 and works alongside our
network of First Aid Posts and Primary Health-
care Centres spread throughout the Panjshir 
Valley” (EMERGENCY USA, n.d., para. 2).

Table 32.
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St. Boniface Maternal Health 
Centre

Inclusion of cultural elements

Consideration of companions

Use of local materials

Sociological analysis of the site

Cultural and contextual characteristics Materials

Environmental characteristics

Welcoming environment

Homely environment

Friendly environment

LOCATION

SURFACE

YEAR

2015

510 sm

Fond des Blanc, Haiti

ARCHITECTS

Payette Architect and
Build Health International

TYPE OF FACILITY

Independent Facility

The centre aims to provide Haitian women 
in rural areas with a respectful place to give 
birth while receiving adequate prenatal and 
postnatal care. “Only 39 percent of births 
in Haiti take place in healthcare facilities 
which reflects issues of access, quality, and 
demand as well as low rates of postpartum
newborn care, this has resulted in Haiti
having the highest rate of maternal mortality 
in Latin America and the Caribbean” (U.S. 
Agency for International Development, n.d.). 
For that reason, the maternity centre provi-
des outpatient examinations, postpartum 
inpatient accommodation, pathological ob-
servation beds, labour rooms, and neonatal 
intensive care areas. 

As stated on the website of Payette:

“The St. Boniface Hospital is the only hos-
pital in the southern peninsula, serving a 
population of almost 12,000 inhabitants. 
Since it opened in 2015, the hospital 
has seen 2,000 inpatient cases, 42,000 
emergency room visits and 5,000 births
annually” (Payette, n.d, para. 1).

The building takes a modern, “back to
basics” approach, employing local construc-
tion techniques and employing people from 
the local community. The design strategy is 
to allow the circulation, lobby, and waiting 
areas to be covered, but open to the outside 

Connection with natural elements

Natural Environment

Illus 90.
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INTEGRATION OF NON-CONVENTIONAL SPACES
  
  

Room for the use of alternative medicine
Overnight rooms for companions and family

Room for traditional practices 
Single occupancy birth rooms

Sacred room / spiritual space
Service Ward 
Common room for mothers
Social room  
Family room
Filter space (in birthing room)
Accommodation for birth attendants
Transitional care facility
Sitting room for parents
Care areas for infants 
Play area for other children in the family

environment so that natural scenery can be 
appreciated. Meanwhile, all delivery rooms 
are completely enclosed (Payette, n.d). In 
addition to the building, a mother’s garden
is being developed with the purpose of
generating a therapeutic space that accom-
modates the psychological and physical
needs of patients, their families, and
communities. 

Among the innovative aspects that can be 
highlighted in this project is the training
centre, which offers community health deve-
lopment programmes and related activities. 
And the garden of mothers, which offers a 
therapeutic space with a healing approach 
in which through the connection with natural 
elements the process of recovery is faster.

Table 33.
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After the analysis it can be concluded that the 
required medical spaces may vary within the 
maternity unit according to the level of servi-
ce offered in the unit, i.e. depending on the 
complexity of services offered, the capacity 
of care and resources, and the infrastructure
and equipment available, it is possible to
integrated into the unit an operating area, a 
pharmacy, laboratories, a paediatric ward, 
examination rooms, among others.

On the other hand, it is noted that there is 
already an integration of non-conventional 
spaces such as family spaces and facilities 
for mothers and their companions such as 
cooking and laundry areas, also highlighted 
spaces for educational programs, lounge 
rooms for medical staff and midwives, and 
the waiting facilities which arise as a benefi-
cial possibility for mothers, companions, and 
staff.

Dirty
Utility

Post partum
ward

Triage
Reception

Predelivery
ward

Operating
Area

Post operative
ward

Isolation ward

Delivery ward/
Birthing room

Neonatal ward

Consulting
rooms

Ultrasound
room

Antenatal
ward

Training room/
Multipurpose

room

Clean
Utility

Cleaners
roomPreparation

room

Pedriatrics
ward

Family
laundry

area

Conference /
education room

Staff
lounge

Family
cooking

area

Family
lounge

Waiting
area

Staff
lounge

Nurse
station

Sluice
room

Anaesthesia
room

Sterilisation
room

Scrub
room

Pharmacy

Waiting facility

Outpatient
area

Operating
area

MATERNITY UNIT

Medical spaces required

New added spaces found in the case studies

Subareas within the maternity unit

Optional medical spaces required

Illus 95: Own elaboration



153

06.4 Maternity Waiting
Facilities

These types of facilities are analysed in a
different way; they are considered relevant 
because they address a current problem 
in resource-poor contexts where access 
to health care is difficult. In many of these
regions, limitations in infrastructure, medical
personnel, and basic resources prevent
women from receiving adequate care
during pregnancy, childbirth, and neonatal 
care. In response to these challenges, these 
structures are proposed as a comprehensive
solution that offers women and her family 
a safe and appropriate environment during

the waiting period before delivery, as well 
as during neonatal care when necessary. 

For these cases, the focus is more on what 
kind of spaces are included in the facility 
and what services can be offered to mothers 
and attendants. Among the essential services 
that these facilities can offer are access to
trained health personnel, adequate rest 
areas, feeding services, and, in some cases, 
access to educational resources on neonatal
care, maternal health, and sexual and
reproductive health.
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Maternity Waiting Village in 
Malawi

Inclusion of cultural elements

Consideration of companions

Use of local materials

Sociological analysis of the site

Cultural and contextual characteristics Materials

Environmental characteristics

Welcoming environment

Homely environment

Friendly environment

LOCATION

SURFACE

YEAR

2015

670 sm

Kasungu, Malawi

ARCHITECTS

MASS Design Group

TYPE OF FACILITY

Supportative facility

“In 2010 in Malawi, about one in thirty-
six women had a lifetime risk of dying
during pregnancy or delivery, largely from
preventable causes” (MASS Design Group, 
n.d., para. 1). For this reason, maternity
waiting facilities were established to reduce 
risks during pregnancy, ensure more
direct access by women to maternal health
services, and guarantee the availability of 
qualified health professionals. 

As established on the website of MASS
Design Group (n.d.):
The existing prototype’s single block concept 
was broken up into several smaller com-
pounds arranged around tiny courtyards in

the innovative design. This plan borrowed 
design cues from the vernacular layout of 
Malawian villages, where family compounds 
are composed of several small buildings 
housing branches of an immediate family.
The smaller-sized housing blocks create 
communities that encourage knowledge 
sharing between experienced and first-time 
mothers.

This facility provides a supervised space for 
pregnant women from week 36 to delivery, 
allowing at the same time to accommodate
family members and birth attendants. In this 
space, in addition to being cared for, women
can participate in different activities that

Connection with natural elements

Natural Environment

Illus 96.
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allow the development of outdoor activities, 
where mothers can meet and socialise, also 
have educational areas where antenatal and 
postnatal care workshops and craft training 
are given to help mothers earn money while 
they are away from home (Silva, 2020). 

This new village prototype creates a safe 
and familiar environment for the mothers, 
allowing it to be scalable and adaptable to 
other sites. In addition, different strategies
are integrated to optimise local conditions 
such as the use of natural lighting and 
ventilation, and the use of locally sourced 

materials such as walls in earth blocks that 
absorb sunlight during the day and radiate 
heat during the coldest nights (MASS Design 
Group, n.d.).

In general terms, the inclusion of spaces
outside those medically required can be
highlighted, the monitoring space where 
mothers can be constantly examined until 
the time of delivery, the usability and func-
tionality of the courtyards, the possibility 
of accommodation for mothers, their
companions, and birth attendants, and the 
inclusion of educational spaces.

Illus 97.
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Kay Manmito Mother’s house

Inclusion of cultural elements

Consideration of companions

Use of local materials

Sociological analysis of the site

Cultural and contextual characteristics Materials

Environmental characteristics

Welcoming environment

Homely environment

Friendly environment

LOCATION

SURFACE

YEAR

2015 - 2016

946 sm

Mirebalais, Haiti

ARCHITECTS

Partners in Health

TYPE OF FACILITY

Supportative facility

This facility is designed to accommodate
women with complicated pregnancies,
mothers whose newborns are required to stay 
in the hospital’s neonatal intensive care unit, 
and baby-sitting mothers. With in the spaces 
comps the structure, there is space for the 
accommodation of the mothers and babies, 
a monitoring space where “a nurse auxiliary 
is always on hand at Kay Manmito to answer 
women’s questions, take vital signs, and 
help determine when labour has advanced 
enough to go to the delivery ward” (Partners 
in Health, 2020, para. 8). Also, a particular
block offers facilities such as bathrooms 
for outpatients and mother’s families,
showers, and a common laundry area (Build 
Health International, n.d.).

Women staying in the residence receive 
three meals a day at a communal dining 
room where mothers socialise and share 
their stories, making the atmosphere much 
more familiar. On the other hand, women 
who are part of kangaroo moms stay in the 
same room as their babies so they can keep 
skin to skin contact.

In addition to the building, the Kay Manmito
house offers varied daily educational pro-
grams in breastfeeding, nutrition, breast 
exams, among others, as well as prenatal 
yoga sessions. They also schedule activities
outside the house such as pool days
(Partners in Health, 2020).

Connection with natural elements

Natural Environment

Illus 102.
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In summary, the role of such facilities in
resource-limited settings can be highlighted 
from two very important points of view, the 
first in relation to mothers and their families 
or companions, and the second from the 
perspective of health personnel.

This type of facility allows for increased
coverage of access to maternal care
services, and from this perspective should be 
included in the public health policies of a
territory. It provides women with the possibility
of access to maternal and neonatal health
care in a more efficient and direct way. In 
addition, it has other benefits, such as the 
preservation of traditions and culture in 
an environment surrounded by women 
and, at the same time, it provides a space 
for education, an important aspect in less
developed contexts, i.e. the facility provides
spaces for educational promotions and
workshops.

On the other hand, from the point of view of 
health personnel, it also has benefits as these
facilities can function together and serve 
as a temporary residence for staff, so that
the continued presence of qualified
personnel for the care of mothers and
babies is guaranteed, ensuring that the
quality of care can be maintained, as well as 
the correct development of interventions and 
medical procedures, thanks to the presence 
of qualified personnel.

Furthermore, if this type of facility accom-
modates both types of users, it is possible to
foster a closer bond between medical
staff and mothers, by sharing common
spaces beyond the strictly medical sphere, 
daily interactions are generated that favour 
coexistence and reinforce relationships.
These dynamics would strengthen the trust 
and connection between patients and staff, 
promoting a more collaborative and humane
environment within the maternity unit.
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06.5 Unbuilt design proposals

The projects presented below are proposals 
designed to improve maternity units, with 
a special focus on Africa, a region facing 
the highest maternal mortality rates in the 
world. These initiatives respond to the need 
to strengthen the quality of care provided to 
mothers and newborns. They also address 
the emergency of ensuring adequate, acces-
sible, and equipped spaces to reduce risks 
and provide comprehensive care in contexts 
with limited resources and significant health 
challenges.

The first proposal implements a socio-
cultural analysis of the context to integrate 
characteristics of local customs and culture 
within the health structure of the maternity 
unit, in this project it is possible highlight the 
integration of elements of internal decoration 

with typical Senegalese patterns, the pro-
vision of outdoor areas with traditional 
plant gardens for medicinal drinks, and 
the inclusion of a support and transition 
facility for women and their companions. 

The second project is intended as a 
prototype that can be replicated throughout 
Uganda to ensure that the development of
maternity units meets the health and infras-
tructure requirements for quality service.

These two examples demonstrate the diffe-
rent approaches that can be taken when 
designing maternity units. While one pro-
ject considers factors in addition to medical 
requirements, the other project has a more 
functional focus, where health prerequisites 
based on international guidelines are met.
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Kolda Maternity Centre

Inclusion of cultural elements

Consideration of companions

Use of local materials

Sociological analysis of the site

Cultural and contextual characteristics Materials

Environmental characteristics

Welcoming environment

Homely environment

Friendly environment

LOCATION

SURFACE

YEAR

Proposed 2024

350 sm

Madina Ladji, Kolda, Senegal

ARCHITECTS

Mauve studio in  collabortaion with
Paula Garzon

The project was developed with a focus on 
the socio-cultural characteristics of childbirth
in the context, maintaining as a pillar the 
value of women and the community in
providing support during childbirth and the 
postpartum phase. Therefore, the design
includes a community meeting space where 
women can stay surrounded by their families 
while being monitored by the medical staff 
at the centre.

The aim was to create a new maternity
centre designed to embrace a simple and 
functional framework, where the architec-
tural identity brings human values to the
communities living in this area. The layout

and organisation of the lot recall the
traditional villages and fields of Africa, which 
typically have a circular configuration with 
buildings connected like satellites around 
a central hub. The design of the three buil-
dings takes the shape of traditional houses, 
where the roof extends beyond the walls to 
form a pergola that also serves as a covered 
passage around the house.

In this case, the model of the house repli-
cated is the impluvium one, where the roof 
converges towards the centre of the inner 
courtyard to collect rainwater, which can be 
reused for baths, irrigation of medicinal herb 
(like aloe, hibiscus, neem) cultivation areas, 

TYPE OF FACILITY

Independent Facility

Connection with natural elements

Natural Environment

Illus 105.



163

or to create small streams that mitigate the 
dry climate.
The curved forms used in the design em-
phasise and visually resemble the shape of 
a mother’s womb during pregnancy, thus
conveying a strong sense of protection to 
those who visit the maternity centre. In tra-
ditional Senegalese culture, the community 
plays a fundamental role, especially during 
childbirth. The structure and buildings use 
different local materials to create a familiar 
place in this spot.

Besides functional spaces, the philosophy 
focuses on creating architectural details 
from local materials that resonate with peo-
ple through the language of architecture. 
Two symbolic elements for African culture 
are incorporated: the use of fabrics to create 
comfortable environments for guests, which 
help them feel at home and provide benefits 
during childbirth by relieving pain and pro-
moting relaxation through colour, thereby 
reducing or eliminating the need for anal-
gesic medicines during labour. The second 
element is the “mashrabiya,” a typical feature 

INDICATOR
  
  

YES
  

NO
  X

X
X

X
X

X
X

X

X

X
X

X

X

X

X

INTEGRATION OF NON-CONVENTIONAL SPACES
  
  

Room for the use of alternative medicine
Overnight rooms for companions and family

Room for traditional practices 
Single occupancy birth rooms

Sacred room / spiritual space
Service Ward 
Common room for mothers
Social room  
Family room
Filter space (in birthing room)
Accommodation for birth attendants
Transitional care facility
Sitting room for parents
Care areas for infants 
Play area for other children in the family

of vernacular architecture used for 
natural ventilation and to allow natural light 
into spaces.
The project consists of three buildings: the 
central one functions as a welcoming area 
for visitors and serves as a distribution hub, 
including a reception area for patients, a 
medical examination room, a space for the 
maternity centre staff, and an outdoor area 
covered by a pergola. The largest building is 
entirely dedicated to motherhood and child-
birth, featuring two rooms for women about 
to give birth, a delivery room, an operating 
room, and a neonatal centre to accommo-
date newborns near their mothers.

The third building, located on the opposite 
side of the childbirth area, is designed for
families. It includes bedrooms and a 
common area with a kitchen, allowing
women who have just given birth to spend 
time with their families, who may come from 
neighbouring villages. We have also aimed 
to create an open space that integrates the 
building with the surrounding environment 
while retaining privacy when necessary.

Table 34.
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Illus 106.

Illus 108.Illus 107.
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Illus 109.

Illus 108. Illus 110.
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Birthing Centre Prototype in 
Uganda

Inclusion of cultural elements

Consideration of companions

Use of local materials

Sociological analysis of the site

Cultural and contextual characteristics Materials

Environmental characteristics

Welcoming environment

Homely environment

Friendly environment

LOCATION

SURFACE

YEAR

Proposed 2017

446,31 sm

Uganda, Sub Saharan Africa

ARCHITECTS

Gould Family Foundation
BHI, Dandelion Africa

This prototype was developed under the
premise of setting a standard for delivery
facilities in Jinja, Uganda. The design propo-
ses an optimally functioning maternal health 
clinic that allows local teams to customise 
the program to their needs. “The prototype 
facility is designed with sustainable and ver-
nacular traditions to ensure they are easily 
erectable by local teams and provide quality 
care for women and children” (Adaptiv, n.d., 
para. 1).

Within the design, the Build Health
International organisation recognized the
importance of family during birth, especially 
in rural areas, and it is for this reason that

they propose the inclusion of flexible meeting 
spaces, outdoor rest areas and arrival areas 
are also integrated into the design. Another
important aspect of this prototype is the
inclusion of vernacular construction methods 
which allow to replicate the prototype more 
easily, in addition to maximising sustainable
opportunities by capturing solar energy and 
rainwater and using local materials that have 
significant insulating properties (Build Health 
International, n.d.).

The development of this prototype makes 
it possible to highlight important findings 
in relation to socio-cultural perceptions 
which may vary around birth, for example, 

TYPE OF FACILITY

Independent Facility

Connection with natural elements

Natural Environment

Illus 111.
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in Uganda it is traditional that births are
home-based and assisted by trusted friends or 
midwives (Adaptiv, n.d.). This aspect proves
that approaches to maternity design must 
adapt not only to local policies but also 

INDICATOR
  
  

YES
  

NO
  X

X
X

X
X

X
X

X

X

X
X

X

X

X

X

INTEGRATION OF NON-CONVENTIONAL SPACES
  
  

Room for the use of alternative medicine
Overnight rooms for companions and family

Room for traditional practices 
Single occupancy birth rooms

Sacred room / spiritual space
Service Ward 
Common room for mothers
Social room  
Family room
Filter space (in birthing room)
Accommodation for birth attendants
Transitional care facility
Sitting room for parents
Care areas for infants 
Play area for other children in the family

to the customs and traditions of the context, 
generating a more familiar and homely en-
vironment. Including these aspects within the 
unit can increase the women’s visits to pre-
natal and postnatal care. 

Table 36.
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Illus 112.

Illus 113.
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Illus 114.

Illus 115.

Typical Ground Floor Plan
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The conceptual proposal is based on 
international guidelines from which the
spatialrequirements for each area of the unit, 
their functional relationships, and spatial
requirements are referenced. The develop-
ment of the proposal is divided into four parts
according to different areas of the unit where 
the characteristics and functions vary, taking 
the outpatient antenatal area, the inpatient 
prenatal and postnatal care area, the birth 
unit, and the transition facility.

The intention of this proposal is to generate
a possible spatial re-accommodation of 
the maternity unit by integrating unconven-
tional spaces that support different types of 
needs that may be presented by the mother, 
her companions, and the health personnel, 
thus expanding the range of response to 
changing needs, implementing new approa-
ches to care, integrating cultural differences 

and beliefs, advocating different relaxation
techniques in labour, and in general 
offering greater wellbeing to all users 
and improvement in the quality of care. 

The proposal considers a stand-alone
maternity unit that offers different antenatal
services to ensure the health of mother and 
baby, but at the time of delivery focuses 
more on midwifery care and assistance, i.e. 
the proposal focuses on treating low-risk
deliveries in the birth unit.

An important factor in establishing the
proposal is that, despite the integration of 
new spaces, it must be ensured that the unit 
continues to comply with all hygiene and
sanitation requirements, to avoid contami-
nating flows and fostering an environment 
that encourages the spread of illness and 
infection.
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07.1 Outpatient antenatal area

This area, as mentioned in the first chapter, 
oversees offering antenatal care services, 
and although the proposal is more focused
on the care of low-risk pregnancies, it is
considered important to include this area 
in the prototype as it could be applied in
contexts with limited resources where there 
are many difficulties in accessing maternal 
health and having adequate prenatal and 
postnatal care. In this way, it will be possible
to keep checking and monitor women’s 
pregnancies and maintain the health and 
wellbeing of both the mother and the baby.

This area requires independent access, a
reception area, and the waiting area 
which may include the toilets, a food bay, 
a beverage bay, and a waiting room for
children. Then, the medical part is composed 
of consulting rooms, an interview room, an
ultrasound room for examinations, and a 
pregnancy assessment room. The area also 
should consider supportive spaces such as 
stores, an office, a clean utility room, a dirty 
utility room, and a conference or meeting room 
for educational programs or staff training.

Functional relationships: 
•	 The ultrasound room may have direct 

access to consulting rooms and preg-
nancy assessment room.

•	 The interview room may have direct ac-
cess to consulting rooms and the waiting 
area and try to have discreet access.

 

•	 The pregnancy assessment room should 
ensure direct access to the birthing unit 
and to the antenatal care inpatient area.

Spaces to integrate:
Sacred spiritual room:
This space is designed so that mothers, their 
companions, and even health personnel can 
practise their spirituality according to their 
beliefs and culture. The difference with the 
prayer room is that this space can host medi-
tation practices, ritual ceremonies or sacred 
community gatherings.
Social room:
This space is for the community, designed as 
a common space to generate awareness and 
consent on issues related to motherhood, 
family planning, sexual health, and 
maternal health keeping in mind that many 
women in rural areas with few resources 
have little or no access to these tools. 
Prayer room:
This space is destined to express anguish, 
needs and gratitude to the deity correspon-
ding to each person’s religion. 
Service area:
This area is designed mainly for mothers and 
their companions and consists of a lounge 
room with access to showers, an infant fe-
eding room, a children’s care area and re-
freshment facilities. As an important aspect, 
this area may have direct access to the tran-
sitional facility. 
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07.2 Inpatient antenatal and 
postnatal area

This area is dedicated to inpatient care; 
however, it is divided into antenatal and 
postnatal beds because patients require very 
different care. In addition, neonatal care is 
an area that also can be integrated into this 
ward, but it all depends on the level of care 
in the maternity unit and the medical staff 
available, as the inclusion of neonatal care 
requires qualified staff to ensure the care 
offered to the newborn.

Moreover, regarding the medical needs, 
it is important to consider that the mothers
reside in this area, so it is necessary to crea-
te a comfortable and calm environment for 
them, where relationships among themselves
and between the staff are strengthened and 
fostered.

Within the required medical spaces, it should 
be considered space for antenatal beds
separate from the beds of postnatal care, this 
division can be created with the dedicated 
medical staff areas, thus also ensuring that 
staff can have quick access to both areas. The 
spaces required are listed as meeting room, 
staff base, staff rest room, interview room, 
neonatal care room, and supportive spa-
ces such as ensuite bathrooms, a newborn 
bathing room, space for mobile equipment, 
space for general equipment, store space, 
clean utility room, and dirty utility room.

Direct links:
•	 The postnatal beds area may have direct 

access to the neonatal care area.
•	 The neonatal care area may have direct 

connection with the formula and feeding 
room.

•	 The staff base should be optimally lo-
cated so that it is easily accessible to 
postnatal, antenatal, and neonatal care 
rooms.

Spaces to integrate:
Day lounge:
This space allows the mother to change her 
environment, it can be conceived in a more 
homely rather than medical sense. “Mothers
can use it flexibly for dining, sitting, or 
waiting” (NHS, 2021, p. 35). 

Common space for mothers:
This room should be set up to provide a safe 
environment for mothers, where they can 
socialise, share knowledge, generate 
additional support and feel accompanied, 
this last point is important in some cultures, 
for example in Senegal after childbirth the 
woman is cared for by a women’s group 
from her community (Samb, 2021).

Feeding room:
As the name suggests, this room is dedicated 
to the feeding of newborn babies, a space
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that can provide the mother and baby with 
privacy and comfort.

Formula room:
It is a space where medical staff can
demonstrate the preparation of formula milk 
and teach mothers how to do it. “This room 
will include a small refrigerator, a sink with 
a drainer, storage facilities, and a clinical 
wash-hand basin” (NHS, 2013, p. 35).

Parental room:
This room can be used for parenting
sessions, in other words, a space with edu-
cational purposes to sensitise parents and 
educate them about parenthood, optionally 
it could be combined with the sitting room.

Sitting room:
This space is especially dedicated to ac-
companying mothers who are in labour to
provide them with a space that gives them 
privacy, where they can feel relaxed and have 
facilities such as showers and food bays.

Staff facilities:
In this area it is ideal to offer different servi-
ces for the staff, from toilets and showers to 
a lounge area, with space for cooking, laun-
dry, and storage for personal belongings.
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07.3 Birth Unit

The birthing unit is the area that needs to be 
most careful in terms of medical and spatial 
limitations, as infections and the spread of 
disease must be avoided as much as pos-
sible, and it is also the area that needs the 
most support space to function properly. 
Among the spaces required are the birthing 
rooms which should have their own ensuite
and storage space, the triage, the staff 
base with space for accommodation and a
beverage bay, the bereavement suite, and 
supportive spaces such as clean utility room, 
dirty utility room, storage, and drug store. 

For the proposal there is a preference for a 
birthing unit more focused on low-risk de-
liveries, so it is not necessary to integrate
highly technical spaces within it, such as 
a procedure room or resuscitation room, 
however, such spaces are at the discretion 
of the developers of the maternity unit within 
the context in which it is to be implemented. 

In cases where the unit offers a higher
level of service and is equipped in terms 
of infrastructure, medical equipment, and 
medical staff to receive pregnancies of all 
types, additional spaces such as a blood 
bank, a testing laboratory, and a resusci-
tation bay in the birthing room should be 
included in addition to the operating area.

The operating ward is other area of the unit 
which depends strictly on the level of care 
offered by the unit and the infrastructure 
and equipment available, in the case where
the operating area is added, it should be 
equipped with an anaesthetic room, an 
operating theatre, a preparation room, 
a scrub room, a dirty utility room, and a 
recovery room, among other support  spaces. 

Direct links:
•	 Birthing rooms may have direct access to 

the postnatal beds area, to the neonatal 
care nursery, and to the operating area.

•	 The operating area may have a direct 
connection with the postnatal beds area, 
and neonatal care nursery. 

•	 The staff base requires direct connection 
with birth rooms, and operating area.

•	 Triage room needs direct access to the 
birth rooms.

•	 Bereavement room requires isolation 
and discreet access.

Spaces to integrate:
Alternative medicine room:
Studies such as Hall et al. 2010 show that 
the use of alternative medicine as massa-
ge, various herbal therapies, and relaxation 
techniques help women in the process of 
childbirth. At the same time this space will 
support the recommendation given by WHO 
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2018, for integration of different relaxation 
techniques during labour, with the purpose 
of having a positive childbirth experience. 

Room for traditional practices:
Culture and traditions vary according to 
each specific place; however, to integrate
these aspects, it is proposed to include a 
space where the family, mother, accompan-
ying persons, and staff can perform their
traditional rituals or ceremonies according 
to their conception of birth. 

Filter space:
The filter can be considered as a small space
or device at the entrance of the delivery 
room, which provides more privacy to the 
room. It could also have medical purposes
if additionally used as a filter to prevent
infection. 

Lounge patient / family: 
During labour, it is positive to allow mothers 
to move freely, in that sense, this space is 
proposed as a kind of living room where
mothers can be accompanied by their 
companions during the process and have 
at their disposal other types of audiovisual 
elements that help her to alleviate pain, as 
well as enjoying the support and company of 
their companions. 

Companions’ facilities:
The idea is to provide a service space for the 
mothers’ companions, where they can feel 
comfortable and have a good experience
within the unit, allowing them to access
toilets, rest areas, and even a food area. 

Accommodation for birth attendants: 
If the maternity unit has a focus on midwife-
assisted deliveries, it is necessary to include
accommodation for midwives or birth 
attendants within the birthing unit. This arran-
gement ensures that midwives are always 
readily available while providing them with 
a place to rest during periods when their 
assistance is not required. 
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07.4 Transitional Facility

During the research of this study, there were 
several findings on the application of waiting 
facilities in relation to maternity units. From 
this point, a transitional facility is proposed 
that would function as a temporary residence
where mothers can stay even up to forty days 
before their delivery or stay if they have their 
baby in neonatal care.

This facility is directly related to all the 
problems that exist in areas of precarious-
ness in relation to access to maternal health
care, where due to different limitations in
terms of economic resources, road infras-
tructure, available means of transport, and 
other factors, many mothers do not have 
access to adequate maternal health servi-
ces, preferring to deliver at home, which in-
creases the risk to both the mother and the 
baby’s life.

On the basis of this infrastructure, it allows 
for more effective procurement of care servi-
ces provided in the maternity unit, but it can 
also function as a joint facility to also host 
medical staff, thus ensuring better conditions 
for staff transferred to locations with difficult 
contexts and guaranteeing their well-being
while performing their duties, solving 
another of the problems that influence the 
crisis of qualified personnel attending to 
health care facilities. 

While these facilities support the maternity 
unit, they include spaces that do not have any 
medical requirements. To avoid interfering
with the unit’s operational functionality or 
any of the sanitary and hygienic require-
ments that it must meet, it was determined to 
be more beneficial to design it independently
of the unit.

The spaces that compound this facility are 
described below:

Social room:
The social room is a space that allows for 
socialisation between mothers and caregi-
vers and promotes a sense of community, 
which is very important in different societies 
and cultures. In addition, it can have diffe-
rent purposes: firstly, it can be a space for 
knowledge, i.e. a space for the community 
to teach other generations the different cus-
toms, traditions, and knowledge of a cul-
ture. Secondly, it could be a space to offer 
workshops or labour training where different 
activities are promoted that allow the mo-
ther and/or the family to acquire new tools 
and knowledge, which can later be applied 
to generate new income. Finally, moreover, 
to being an educational space for parents, 
it can also be a space for the promotion of 
different relaxation techniques during child-
birth, such as dance and yoga.



199

Service area: 
This area offers services to mothers, their 
families, companions, and even staff, as well 
as being a space that provides more comfort 
to mothers in their work and stay in the unit, 
allowing the atmosphere to feel much more 
familiar and homely, an important aspect to 
include in the perception of the environment 
of the maternity unit. The space includes a 
kitchen, laundry room, and a dining room.

Educational room: 
The education room can have different
purposes from programs for the promotion 
of maternal health, family planning, and 
sexual health, to other types of conferences 
and workshops on different topics.

Room for traditional practices: 
Culture and traditions vary according to each 
specific place; however, to integrate these 
aspects, it is proposed to include a space 
where the family, mother, and accompan-
ying persons can perform their traditional
rituals or ceremonies according to their
conception of birth.

Overnight rooms for companions: 
This type of room is designed for a single 
bed per person, so that those accompanying 
a mother who is still in labour can stay close
to the maternity unit, without the need to
travel long distances and have easier access 
to the mother and baby.

Overnight rooms for families: 
On the other hand, there is the family 
room, designed to support a family-centred 
approach to care. This type of room accom-
modates the presence of immediate fami-
ly members, typically the mother, children, 
and father when applicable, fostering a
comfortable environment that encourages 
family involvement and support. 

By providing space for family members to 
stay together, this setting promotes emotional
well-being and active participation in the 
care process.

Care area for children:
This area is designed for childcare, since 
as seen in the family-centred approach, it 
should not only include the father, but also the 
mother’s other children, who may become
restless with whoever is caring for them or at 
home in their mother’s absence. Providing 
a space for them allows children to be in-
volved in the process, and helps mothers, 
considering that in some cultures they 
have full responsibility for the care of their 
children.
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Conclusions

In conclusion, there are several aspects that 
are worth highlighting after this work has 
been carried out. Firstly, it is crucial that 
international guidelines for the design of 
maternity units are not only aligned with
local policies but also consider factors closely 
related to the users, such as their context,
culture, traditions, and beliefs. This approach 
can lead to more appropriate unit designs,
address local challenges related to acces-
sibility and the availability of healthcare
infrastructure, and enhance both the user 
experience and the quality of services
provided.

Although international guidelines determine 
all the requirements that a health infrastruc-
ture of this type should have, they must be 
adapted to the needs of all those involved
and respond to other factors beyond
medical requirements. In other words, in 
addition to respecting all the directives for 
the maternity unit to function properly, it 
must generate a favourable environment 
that responds to the physical and psycholo-
gical needs of the mother, her companions, 
and the health personnel, thus generating 
an environment of well-being.

As Balabanoff mentions, there is a lack of 
research on the design of maternity units and 

the design of birth environments that support 
the natural birthing process and generally 
consider the needs of users. 

This creates a global call for not only more 
research on the topic but also for its appli-
cability to be made effective, especially in 
resource-limited settings, which present the 
greatest challenges for access and quality
of maternal health. Although there is
evidence of a much more humane and
holistic approach to maternity unit design, 
most of the evidence comes from developed
countries. Therefore, it is important that 
all research and new findings on the topic
focus on resource-constrained contexts, 
where maternal and newborn health must 
be strengthened.

Evidence shows that the application of 
different approaches to care, involving 
new practices such as the use of alternative 
medicine, relaxation techniques during 
childbirth, among others, practices that 
translate into unconventional spaces, is scar-
ce or non-existent in low-resource settings. 
This shows that, in contexts of scarcity and 
precariousness, where new approaches to 
care and the application of culture-related 
interventions are more urgent, these are little 
considered.
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Redesigning maternity units with a focus on 
the needs of the users and their culture has 
positive effects on the experience of both, 
mothers and staff. On the mothers’ side, it 
allows the care offered to rely not only on the 
skills and treatment of the medical staff, but 
also on the environment and space in which 
care is offered. And on the other hand, health
personnel can also have better outcomes if 
their working environment is pleasant and 
facilitating.

Despite the limited research on culturally 
sensitive maternity unit design, a metho-
dology was developed to assess diverse
contexts. This tool proves valuable as it ena-
bles international organizations and local
governments to re-evaluate and adapt
maternity unit designs, making them more 
responsive to users’ needs and preferences, 
thereby enhancing the quality of care.

Finally, the importance of this issue should 
be highlighted, as adopting international
directives with a cultural approach to the 
needs of users and their local context not 
only represents an improvement in the 
quality of care, but also increases accessibi-
lity to health infrastructures. This last point is 
consistent with SDG 3, which should ensu-
re access to health and human well-being, 
as adapting maternity units to local needs, 
respecting culture, and integrating medical 
care with traditions, improves the experience 
and facilitates a more favourable response
from mothers, their companions, and 
medical staff.
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INDICATOR
  
  

Low
Importance

  
  

Medium
Importance

  
  

High
Importance

  
  

INTEGRATION OF NON-CONVENTIONAL SPACES
  
  

Room for the use of alternative medicine
Overnight rooms for companions and family

Room for traditional practices 
Single occupancy birth rooms

Sacred room / spiritual space
Service Ward 
Common room for mothers
Social room  
Family room
Filter space (in birthing room)
Accommodation for birth attendants
Transitional care facility
Sitting room for parents
Care areas for infants 
Play area for other children in the family

INDICATOR
  
  

Low
Importance

  
  

Medium
Importance

  
  

CHARACTERISTICS OF THE UNIT ENVIRONMENT
  
  

Welcoming environment
Familiar and calm environment

Respect and empower environment
Experiencing safety in the space

Homely environment
Friendly environment
Relax and domestic environment
Warm and softness environment
Nonclinical environment
Enveloping space

High
Importance

  
  

INDICATOR
  
  

Low
Importance

  
  

Medium
Importance

  
  

High
Importance

  
  

UNIT LAYOUT
  
  

Support privacy within the space 
Availability of facilities

Optimum location of midwives’ hub/staff base
Allow continuity of the space

Avoid long corridors

Assessment tables
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INDICATOR
  
  

Low
Importance

  
  

Medium
Importance

  
  

CHARACTERISTICS FOR THE BIRTH ROOM ENVIRONMENT
  
  High

Importance

  
  

Clean and inviting room
Central woman’s environment

Sacred and supportive atmosphere 
Individualised space

Sense of belonging within the space
Decorated space
Self-control of room 
Cave-like space

INDICATOR
  
  

Low
Importance

  
  

Medium
Importance

  
  

High
Importance

  
  

BIRTH ROOM LAYOUT
  
  
Allow for adaptability of space
Facilitate freedom of movement

Use of mobile furniture
Ensure a private toilet, bath, and shower

Spacious rooms
Flexible room
Change bed position, not in the centre

PHYSICAL ELEMENTS
  
  
Use of calming items in the room
Provide comfortable pillows and seating
within the birthing ward
Use of elements that provide physical
support in the room

INDICATOR
  
  

Low
Importance

  
  

Medium
Importance

  
  

High
Importance

  
  

SUPPORTING ELEMENTS
  
  
Enable connection to natural elements
Use of sensory channels

Use of distracting elements
Use of visual elements

Use of communicative elements

INDICATOR
  
  

Low
Importance

  
  

Medium
Importance

  
  

High
Importance

  
  



227

LIGHTING  
  

INDICATOR
  
  

Low
Importance

  
  

Medium
Importance

  
  

High
Importance

  
  Allow control of light intensity in the birth room

Use of natural light

Soft lighting in the environment

INDICATOR
  
  

Low
Importance

  
  

Medium
Importance

  
  

High
Importance

  
  

MATERIALS AND TEXTURES
  
  

Use of different textures and natural materials
Avoid using glare-producing surfaces
Use of rugs on the floors

INDICATOR
  
  

Low
Importance

  
  

Medium
Importance

  
  

High
Importance

  
  

SOUNDS  

Use of soothing sounds
Use of soundproofing in the birth unit
Use of sounds from nature

INDICATOR
  
  

Low
Importance

  
  

Medium
Importance

  
  

High
Importance

  
  

Use of aromas

SMELLS 
  

COLOURS 
  

INDICATOR
  
  

Low
Importance

  
  

Medium
Importance

  
  

High
Importance

  
  

Use of warm colours
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